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CAREER OPPORTUNITIES IN 

Vijay Prakash Srivastava 

For a common man banks are
the most familiar financial 

institutions which are used to 
deposit and withdraw money and 
to avail loans .Banks branches 
are widely spread and offer their 
services to both rich and poor. 
When it comes to careers, these 
banks, both public and private, 
have offered employment to 
thousands of young people. 
Banking is considered to be a 
good career option in our 
country. 

Banks deal into money. Along 
with banks there are other 
institutions also involved in the 
business of money and finances. 
Such institutions come under the 
ambit of capital market which 
keeps expanding with economic 
growth. There are different 
financial instruments traded in 
this capital market. These 
include bonds, equity shares, 
debentures, call money, 
derivatives, commodity indices, 
futures and options etc. 

FRI I 
Forest Research Institute, 

Dehradun requires 98 
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 CAPITAL  
Explanation for these terms can 
be easily found in books on 
financial management and of 
course on internet. 

Capital market consists of 
primary capital markets and 
secondary capital markets. 
Primary capital markets deal 
with trade of fresh issues of 
stocks and other securities, 
whereas secondary capital 
market deals with the exchange 
of existing or previously issued 
securities. On business related 
TV channels you might have 
come across the strip showing 
running prices of stocks. Many of 
these stocks were first offered to 
investors 50-60 years ago and 
are still being traded albeit for a 
different price. The price of such 
securities depends on market 
sentiments, state of the 
economy, demand, quality of the 
company management and 
future prospects. This example 
is given to highlight the long term 
and dynamic nature of capital 
markets. 

The primary capital market 

grows on the strength of 
secondary capital market. 

Capital market is a market 
where buyers and sellers come 
together to trade financial 
securities like bonds, stocks, etc. 
These days most of such trade is 
done electronically/on line. This 
market has both institutional and 
individual buyers. Capital 
markets come within the 
financial sector. 

A healthy and growing Capital 
Market attracts both domestic 

and foreign investment which is 
necessary for the growth of 
economy. Governments usually 
don't interfere in such markets 
but regulating it becomes 
necessary to protect the 
interests of investors and curb 
unfair trade practices. Ministry of 
Finance, Reserve Bank of India, 
Securities and Exchange Board 
of India keep a watch on the 
capital markets. Then there are 
specific regulators for particular 
businesses. 

The pre budget economic 
survey released on 29th 
January 2018 promises the 
country's Gross Domestic 
Product (GDP) growth rate to be 
7.5 percent during the financial 
year of 2018-19.Thus we can be 
sure that our economy shall be 
buoyant and so shall be the 
capital markets. 

Except for general positions 
like customer service associates 
etc. all other job roles in capital 
market require specific 
knowledge and study. A simple 
graduation may help you to get a 
bank job but such is not the case 
with capital markets. Here you 
need specific qualifications. 

The following qualifications 
can help you make a good 
career in capital market­
Postgraduation in Commerce: 
Commerce has always been a 
popular subject of study for 
students of 10+2 onwards. 
Masters degree in Commerce 
(M.Com) can be pursued at most 
of the universities and colleges 

Continued on page 2 

FAST DEEPENING WATER CRISIS 

CAN WE AFFORD TO IGNORE IT?
S.P. Sharma 

There goes a very famous 
anecdote. Once upon a time, 

there lived a king who possessed 
a very vast empire. The king was 
very much fond of hunting. On a 
certain day, the king, with his 
cavalcade and a huge retinue of 
servants and courtiers, set out for 
preying into a dense forest. 
Hunting kept the king busy and 
the day went on passing until the 
sun rose to a very scorching 
noon. Having felt very thirsty, the 
king started heading back 
hurriedly in search of some 
natural streams of drinking water. 
But all efforts of the king to find 
water for quenching his thirst 
went in vain. 

As was the king in frenzy, he 
found some clouds of smoke 
billowing from a hut at some 
distant place. The eyes of the 
king shone with renewed hope. 
He rushed to the hut and found a 
hermit sitting immersed in deep 
meditation. The king mustered 
his courage and made a humble 
prayer to the hermit, "O great 
sage, please forgive me to 
intervene into your deep 

meditation. I am the king of the 
empire you live in but now am 
very miserable. I am very much 
thirsty. I am dying of thirst. Please 
give me some water so that I can 
quench my thirst." 

"I need to struggle hard every 
day to fill up the pitcher with 
water. It is only for my use. I 
cannot share even a single drop 
of it with anyone, however the 
great person he or she may be. 
Go and search for it somewhere 
else'', the hermit refused the 
request of the king without any 
compunction. 

"I cannot afford to search more 
for water. My energy has drained 
away. Please give me a little 
water so that I can save my life," 
the king again made earnest 
request. 

The king became very much 
disappointed. He made the last 
desperate 
effort, 

"O kind sage, give me some 
water and I can pay the price as 
much as you wish. I am ready 
even to offer you my entire 
empire which I have won at the 
huge cost of massacre of so 

many innocent lives and 
unfathomable personal 
sacrifices. If I die due to extreme 
thirst then what is the value of the 
empire for me?" 

"So the value of your entire 
kingdom equals to only a few 
glasses of water! Shame on you! 
Shame on your empire and your 
kingship!" the hermit replied 
philosophically and offered him 
heart-content water. This event of 
life proved to be an eye-opener 
for the king and the realization of 
vital significance of water in the 
sustenance of the mankind 
taught him the lesson which he 
had never imagined of. 

In fact, the aforesaid anecdote 
is not simply a story of a king and 
his search for water to satisfy his 
thirst. The story needs to be read 
between the lines and the 
message which becomes crystal 
clear is - water is the most 
precious asset on the earth that 
gives sustenance to the entire 
creatures on the earth planet. 
The story is also a reflection on 
the bitter truth that no amount of 
wealth can purchase water, the 

Continued on page 38 
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offering postgraduate courses
spread all across the country.
Masters in Business
Administration with
specialization in Finance:
Importance of MBA qualification
is known to every aspirant of a
corporate job. Few universities
have named their business
courses as Masters in
Management Studies (MMS).
Two years full time
Postgraduate Diploma in
Management as offered by
Indian Institute of Management
(Ahmedabad/ Bengaluru/
Kolkata/Indore/ Lucknow/
Shillong/Rohtak/ Kashipur/
Tiruchirapalli and at few other
centres) is a much sought after
course. Finance is one of the
main specializations offered in
business management courses.
Also available are courses like
Masters in Financial
Management in which
specialization is already defined.
Admission to management
courses are made through
Common Aptitude Test (CAT),
Management Aptitude Test
(MAT), AIMS Test for
Management Admissions
(ATMA) etc. Some institutes like
Manipal  Academy of Higher
Learning, a deemed university,
conduct their own entrance
tests. 

Narsee Monjee Institute of
Management Studies (NMIMS)
at Mumbai offers MBA in Capital
Markets. Institute of Technology

& Management (ITM), Navi
Mumbai conducts a
Postgraduate Diploma in
Financial Markets. There may
be few more such courses.
Make sure that the business
course you choose has the
approval of All India Council for
Technical Education
(AICTE)/Universities Grants
Commission (UGC).
Chartered Accountancy: This
is a well known course
administered by the Institute of
Chartered Accountants of India
(ICAI).
Cost & Management
Accountancy: The Institute of
Cost Accountants of India offers
this course which to some extent
is similar to a course in
Chartered Accountancy.
Company Secretary: Institute
of Company Secretaries of India
(ICSI) conducts this course.
Chartered Financial Analyst:
The course has an international
identity. It is run globally by the

CFA Institute based in the
United States of America. It
means that one can do this
course in India without leaving
the country.
CIMA Certified Professional:
Chartered Institute of
Management Accountants is a
body of professionals with origin
in United Kingdom. It offers
Certificate in Business
Accounting and Certification as
Chartered Management Global
Accountant which can be
completed in India. 
All the above courses
(Chartered accountancy and
below) are offered usually under
self study mode with facility of
contact classes.
Higher qualifications in
Economics, Data Analytics etc.
may also come handy for jobs in
capital market. Those with
background in information
technology are also in demand
as use of technology is on rise
and technological innovations

are taking place everywhere
including capital markets.
Following are few of the
institutes offering distinct
valuable courses for entry to
the Capital Markets:
Bombay Stock Exchange
(BSE) jointly with Mumbai
University conducts Masters
in Global Financial Markets
and Masters in Financial
Technology. BSE Institute
has many short term
programmes also as listed on
their website.
National Institute of
Securities Market (NISM)
was established in the year
2006 by SEBI, the securities
market regulator for the
country. It has its main campus
at Patalganga near Mumbai. It
conducts full time programmes
leading to Postgraduate
Diploma in Management
(Securities Markets),
Postgraduate Programme in
Securities Markets,
Postgraduate Diploma in
Quantitative Finance. Part
time programmes include
Certificate in Treasury
Management, Certificate in
Securities Law, Postgraduate
Diploma in Financial
Engineering and Risk
Management. The Institute
also conducts a number of
Short term and certification
programmes. 
Credit Rating Information
System of India Limited,
now CRISIL, offers a two
years work-cum-study
programme to develop
finance professionals. This is
known as CRISIL Certified
Analyst Programme.
As a qualified professional
you have varied career
opportunities in Capital

Markets. Some of the areas you
may consider to work in, are
described below:
Equity Markets: There are
broking houses which carry
trade in equities for self and on
behalf of their clients. They need
equity analysts to evaluate
performance and potential of
stocks/shares. Based on this
analysis decision regarding
sale/purchase of shares is taken
and recommendations to clients
are also made.
Mutual Funds: Mutual Funds
collect money from individuals
and other entities for investing in
stocks, bonds and debt
instruments etc. They offer
variety of schemes as per
customer preferences and their
risk appetite. There are a large
number of mutual fund
operators in our country whose
workforce consists mainly of
equity analysts and fund
managers. Unit Trust of India is
a leading mutual fund company
of our country. List of other
mutual funds can be accessed
from the website of Association
of Mutual Funds in India.
Wealth Management: High net
worth individuals, companies
and trusts etc. appoint wealth
managers to seek considered
advice and take care of their
investments. It is common for
industrialists, big film, stars,
sportspersons etc. to engage
wealth management
professionals. 
Investment Banking: This is a
lucrative area and is equally
challenging. Investment Banking
is different from common
banking services. Investment
banks work as financial
intermediaries specializing in
large and complex financial
transactions such as
underwriting, acting as an
intermediary between a
securities issuer and the
investing public, facilitating
mergers and acquisitions, and
acting as financial advisor for
institutional clients. Barclays,
Bank of America, Merrill Lynch,
Goldman Sachs, Deutsche
Bank, JP Morgan, Morgan
Stanley, Credit Suisse, Citibank
and Lazard are well known
global names in Investment
Banking.  Kotak Investment
Banking is among leading Indian
operators. Some investment
banks specialize in particular
industry sectors.
Merchant Banking: Few roles
are common for investment
bankers and merchant bankers.
Merchant banking involves
managing issues of initial public
offering and rights issue of
equities, bonds etc., raising
finance for clients, restructuring
and rehabilitation of
business/industry, project

management services, portfolio
management etc. SBI Capital,
ICICI Securities Limited, IDBI
Capital Markets, Tata Capital
Markets Limited, J M Financials,
Bajaj Capital, Yes Bank Limited,
Edelweiss Capital are among
top merchant bankers in India.
Rating agencies: Many of the
financial instruments like
debentures, fixed deposits
offered by companies, bonds
etc. need to carry their rating by
a recognized rating agency. This
rating is a kind of risk profiling of
the instrument and an indication
how good or bad is the
instrument from risk's point of
view. CRISIL, CARE, ICRA are
the leading rating agencies
operating in our country.
Moody's, Standard & Poor's,
Fitch Ratings are few of the
reputed global rating agencies.
Audit: Regulatory guidelines
have been in existence for
financial transactions and
companies have to report the
findings of audit and compliance
thereon. There are various firms
which engage people for audit of
their clients. These include
Indian as well as global firms.
Taxation: Both individuals and
companies are required to
ensure that tax on earnings and
other transactions are paid as
per law of the land. With
introduction of Goods and
Services Tax (GST), tax
structure and accounting etc.
have been rationalized. Taxation
can be one area for a
specialized career in capital
markets.
Consulting firms: With your
knowledge of capital markets
and its operations, you may join
a consulting company. There are
home grown consulting firms as
well as global ones. These firms
may be offering their services in
multiple disciplines like financial
restructuring, taxation, audit etc.
Deloitte, Ernest & Young, Price
Waterhouse are counted among
biggest consulting firms
operating globally. Such firms
have better opportunities for
experienced professionals.
Academics and Media: Career
opportunities can also be
explored in teaching, training
and in media.Teaching jobs may
be available at Universities,
commerce and management
colleges etc. Media related
careers can be found with
leading business/financial
dailies and with business news
channels. 

If you want to work on your
own, you may choose to be a
sub broker or an independent
consultant in the area of your
choice. It is advisable to gain
some practical work experience
before you launch yourself.
Traits for success
To do well in your capital market
career you should develop
affinity with numbers, eye for
detail and analytical ability. You
should work on ethical principles
with high regard for compliance
of laws, rules and regulations.
This article makes mention of
many institutes offering
programmes useful for making a
career in capital market and
places where related
opportunities are available.
Details about these can be had
from their websites. 
The Author is Mumbai based
Counsellor.
E mail : v2j25@yahoo.in
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Forest Research Institute
(Indian Council of Forestry Research and Education)

P.O.  New Forest, Dehradun (Uttarakhand)
Advt. No. 1/FRI/GC/2018
Applications are invited for the following posts required for Forest Research Institute Dehradun:-
Sl. Name of Post 7th CPC No. of Category
No. Pay Level Vacancies UR SC ST OBC PH
1. Technician (Electrician/ Level-2 10 03 05 - 02 -

Plumber/AMO/Carpenter/Welder)
2. Technician (Field/Lab Research) Level-3 45 31 07 01 06 01 (OH/ VH/ 

HH)
3. Technical Assistant Level-5 03 03 - - - -

(Maintenance) 
One each for Electrical, 
Mechanical & Civil

4. Store Keeper Level-2 01 01 - - - -
5. Driver Ordinary Grade Level-2 03 02 - - 01 -
6. Lower Division Clerk Level-2 19 15 02 - 02 01(OL/ 

BL/HH)
7. Forest Guard Level-1 02 01 - - 01 -
8. Multi Tasking Staff (MTS) Level-1 15 10 02 - 03 -

The minimum and essential qualifications, experience, etc. for all the above posts are as under :-
Sl.No. [1] : Technician [Electrician (02 post) , Plumber (02 post), Assistant Machine Operator (02
post), Carpenter (03 post) Welder (01 Post) ] : 
Educational Qualification: Matriculation from a recognized Board with ITI certificate in relevant trade or
certificate course from a Government recognized Institute.
Age Limit :  For General category : Not below 18 years or exceeding 30 years.
Sl.No. [2] : Technician (Field/Lab Research) 
Educational Qualification: 10 + 2  in Science with 60% marks in aggregate or equivalent from a
recognized Board.
Age Limit : For General category : Not below 18 years or exceeding 30 years.
Sl.No. [3] : Technical Assistant (Maintenance) : Electrical (01 Post), Civil (01 Post), Mechanical  (01
Post)
Educational Qualification: Bachelor degree in Science in the relevant field/ specialization or equivalent
from a recognized University  or  3 years diploma in Engineering in the relevant field from a recognized
Institution  or  10+2 with Science from a recognized Board + 2 years diploma in the relevant field from a
recognized University/ Institution.
Age Limit : For General category : Not below 21 years or exceeding 30 years.
Sl. No. [4] : Store Keeper 
Educational Qualification: 12th pass  from  a recognized Board.
Age Limit : For General category : Not below 18 years or exceeding 27 years.
Sl.No. [5] : Driver Ordinary Grade 
Educational Qualification: Matriculation from a recognized Board. Possession of a valid driving license
for Motor Cars. Experience of driving a Motor Car for 3 years or more. Desirable: Knowledge of Motor
Mechanism (the candidate should be able to remove minor defects in vehicles).
Age Limit : For General category : Not below 18 years or exceeding 27 years.
Sl.No. [6] : Lower Division Clerk
Educational Qualification: 12th pass certificate from a recognized Board. A typing speed of 30 words
per minute in English or 25 words per minute in Hindi on manual Type Writer  Or Typing speed of 35 words
per minute in English or 30 words per minute in Hindi on Computer.
Age Limit: For General category : Not below 18 years or exceeding 27 years.
Sl.No. [7] : Forest Guard
Educational Qualification: Essential: (a)10th Pass from a Government recognized Board. (b) Certificate
in Fire Fighting.
Physical Standard : Men : i)  Walk : 25 Kms. in 4 hours. ii) Height : Minimum 165 cms iii) Chest :
79 cm without expansion and 84 cm with expansion. Women : i)  Walk : 14 Kms. in 4 hours. ii) Height :
Minimum 150 cms. iii) Chest: 74 cm without expansion and 79 cm with expansion. Desirable : (a) Home
Guard Training. (b) Experience in relevant trade.
Age Limit ; For General category : Not below 18 years or exceeding 27 years.
Sl.No. [8] : Multi Tasking Staff (MTS)
Educational Qualification: Essential: 10th standard pass from recognized Board/ recognized School.
Desirable: 3 years or more experience in relevant field.
Age limit: Not below 18 years or exceeding 27 years.
Note:- 1. The number of vacancies are subject to variation. 
2. Application will be registered online only. Interested candidates may visit our http://recruitment.fri.
res.in OR website www.fri.res.in for detailed Advertisement and filling up of online application form. The
online application web portal will remain open from 01 April, 2018 to 21 April, 2018 for registering the
application.
3. Only those candidates will be called for written exam / test whose candidature found eligible as per the
educational qualification, age and other criteria.  
4. Age relaxation for SC/ST/OBC/PH will be as per the Govt. of India rules / guidelines.
5. Incomplete application/or not fulfilling eligibility criteria / or without application fee payment will be
rejected.
6. Visit FRI's official website www.fri.res.in or http://recruitment.fri.res.in from time to time for any
updates, corrigendum or information.
EN 52/81 DIRECTOR, FRI

Jawaharlal Nehru University
New Delhi-110067

Corrigendum to Rolling
Advt. No. RC/04/2018 & RC/05/2018

published on 10th March 2018.
All the faculty positions advertised under Rolling Advt.

Nos. RC/04/2018 & RC/05/2018 are withdrawan due

to administrative reasons.

Registrar 

Jawaharlal Nehru University

EN 52/56

Indicative Advertisement No. 06/2018  
Online Recruitment Applications (ORA) are invited for
direct recruitment by selection through website
http://www.upsconline.nic.in to the following posts by
12th April, 2018.
1. (Vacancy No. 18030601524)

One Assistant Commissioner (Cooperation/
Credit), Department of Agriculture, Cooperation &
Farmers Welfare, Ministry of Agriculture & Farmers
Welfare (UR-01).

2. (Vacancy No. 18030602624)
One Deputy Drugs Controller (I) (Medical
Devices), Central Drugs Standard Control
Organisation, Directorate General of Health
Services,   Ministry of Health and Family Welfare
(UR-01).

3. (Vacancy No. 18030603624)
Two Assistant Drugs Controller (I) (Medical
Devices), Central Drugs Standard Control
Organisation, Directorate General of Health
Services,  Ministry of Health and Family Welfare
(UR-02).

4. (Vacancy No. 18030604524)
One Assistant Professor (Electrical Enginee-
ring), National Fire Service College, Nagpur,
Ministry of Home Affairs (UR-01).

The candidates willing to apply for the above posts are
advised to visit Commission's ORA Website
http://www.upsconline.nic.in. The detailed
advertisement along-with 'Instructions and Additional
Information to Candidates for Recruitment by
Selection' has been displayed on Commission's
Website http://www.upsc.gov.in as well as on the
Online Recruitment Application (ORA) website
http://www.upsconline.nic.in.

CANCELLATION NOTICE
(Ref.No. F. 1/64(9)/2017-RV) It is notified for
information to all concerned that the process of
recruitment to twenty eight posts of Marketing Officer
(Group-I) (Survey, Training & Quality Control) in the
Ministry of Agriculture & Farmers Welfare,
Department of Agriculture, Cooperation & Farmers
Welfare,  Directorate of Marketing and Inspection
published in the Employment Newspapers of the
country on 22nd July, 2017 vide Commission's
Advertisement No. 14/2017 Item No.1  Vacancy No.
17071401522 has been withdrawn by the concerned
Ministry/Department. Therefore, the Commission has
decided to close the process of recruitment is the above
said post.

EN 52/85

Union Public Service
Commission

Dholpur House, Shahjahan Road
New Delhi-110069

No. A.12026/1/2017-E.III
Government of India 

Ministry of Water Resources, River Development &
Ganga Rejuvenation

Refer Vacancy Circular published in Employment News dated 23-29 December, 2017, the
last date of receipt of applications for filling up of one post of General Manager in the Pay
Band-4 of Rs. 37400-67,000 plus grade pay of Rs. 10000/- (6th CPC Scale) in Brahmaputra
Board, Guwahati, a statutory body of this Ministry on deputation (including short term contract)
basis is extended for a period of 30 days from the date of issue. The detailed vacancy circular
is available on this Ministry's website - mowr.gov.in. The candidates applied earlier need not
apply again. (Shalini Juneja) 
EN 52/84 Under Secretary to the Government of India

t.
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Delhi Jal Board
Govt. of NCT. of Delhi 

Office of the Assistant Commissioner (D) 
Varunalay Phase-II: Karol Bagh, New Delhi

Subject:- For advertisement regarding filling up the post of
Labour Welfare Officer in Delhi Jal Board in the Pay Band 3
of Rs. 15600-39100 with Grade Pay of Rs. 5400 (Pre-revised).
"Applications are invited for filling up the post of Labour
Welfare Officer on deputation in Delhi Jal Board in the PB-3
of Rs. 15600-39100 with Grade Pay of Rs. 5400/- (Pre-
revised) plus usual allowances from the eligible officers.
Last date of submission of application is 25/5/2018. For
more information please visit our website
www.delhijalboard.nic.in".
Issued by PRO (Water)
Advt. No. J.S.V. 576/2017-18 (SANDEEP GULATI)
EN 52/26                          ASSISTANT COMMISSIONER(D)

Government of India
Ministry of Development of North Eastern Region
North Eastern Council Secretariat

Nongrim Hills, Shillong-793003.
Advertisement No. ADMN-13012/1/2017-ADMN Dated: the 22nd February, 2018

The North Eastern Council Secretariat is looking for the services of suitable officers for filling up 18
(eighteen) posts of Stenographer Grade-ll on deputation basis in the pay scale of Rs. 5000-150-
8000/- (5th CPC)/PB-2 Rs. 9300-34800/- plus Grade Pay of Rs. 4600/- (6th CPC) corresponding to
pay scale of Rs. 44900 - 142400/- (Level 7) of the 7th CPC Pay Matrix. The details of the post are as
under :

1. Method of By deputation:
Recruitment and Officers under the Central Government or State Government or
Eligibility Union Territories or Statutory Organisations holding analogous 
Criteria post or with eight years regular service in post in the scale of 

Rs. 4000-100-6000 (5th CPC)/PB-1 Rs. 5,200-20,200/- + G.P. 
Rs. 2400/- (6th CPC) corresponding to pay scale of Rs. 25500-
81100/- (Level 4) of the 7th CPC Pay Matrix or equivalent.

2. Period of Deputation and Period of deputation including period of deputation in another ex-
Maximum Age Limit for cadre post held immediately preceding this appointment in the 
the Post same or some other Organisation/Department of the Central 

Government, shall ordinarily not exceed three years. The maximum 
age limit for appointment by deputation shall be Not exceeding 
56 years as on the closing date of receipt of applications.

3. Job Requirement/ (a) To function as PA to senior officers.
Duties and (b) Taking shorthand dictation in English and typing in the 
Responsibilities computer (English).
of the Post (c) Maintenance of Visitors' Diary, files and dak movement

registers of the Officer/Sector/Section where he/she has
been attached.

(d) Maintenance of tour details of officer(s) with whom he/she
has been attached.

(e) Performing any other task assigned to him/her by his/her
officer with whom he/she has been attached/Secretary/
Deputy Secretary/ Director (Admn.) from time to
time.

The pay and other terms and conditions of deputation will be regulated in accordance with DoPT's O.M.
No. 6/8/2009-Estt. (Pay-II) dated 17.06.2010 and No. 2/11/2017-Estt. (Pay-II) dtd. 24.11.2017 as
amended from time to time. Cadre authorities/Head of Departments are requested to forward applications
of eligible and willing candidates whose services can be spared on deputation basis immediately so as
to reach the Director (Admn.) within 60 days from the date of publication of this advertisement in the
Employment News. For Curriculum Vitae (Annexure-I) and other details, the candidates are advised to
visit and download from the NEC website http://necouncil.gov.in.

Note: The candidates applying for the post would not be allowed to
withdraw their candidature subsequently.

LIST OF ENCLOSURES TO BE ACCOMPANIED WITH THE
APPLICATION/CERTIFICATES TO BE GIVEN BY THE
OFFICE/DEPARTMENT WHILE FORWARDING THE

APPLICATION
1. Application in prescribed format-Annexure-I duly completed,

signed by the applicant and countersigned by the
Cadre/Appointing authority.

2. Attested copies of ACRs/APARs for the last five (5) years duly
attested on each page with seal by an officer not below the rank
of Under Secretary to the Govt. of India or equivalent.

3. Integrity Certificate.
4. Vigilance Clearance.
5. Major or minor penalty certificate for the last 10 years of his/her

service.
6. A certificate to the effect that the particulars furnished by the

applicant have been verified and found correct as per service
records.

7. Cadre Clearance Certificate.
(Kh. Siile Anthony)

l/c Director (Admn.)
NEC Secretariat, Nongrim Hills

Shillong-793003
EN 52/24 Ph. No.: 0364-2522647

÷Ê⁄UÃ ‚⁄U∑§Ê⁄U/Government of India
¬⁄U◊ÊáÊÈ ™§¡Ê¸ Áfl÷Êª/Department of Atomic

Energy
¬Á⁄UflÃË¸ ™§¡Ê¸ ‚ÊßÄ‹Ù≈˛UÊÚŸ ∑§ãŒ˝/Variable Energy

Cyclotron Centre
v/∞.∞»§., ÁflœÊŸ Ÿª⁄U, ∑§Ù‹∑§ÊÃÊ-700 064 

1/AF, Bidhan Nagar, Kolkata - 700 064
Advt. No.VECC- 1/2018

Engagement of a Research Associate (RA)
Applications are invited from Indian nationals for engagement of a
Research Associate (RA) at Variable Energy Cyclotron Centre,
Kolkata in the field of "Phase transitions in sub-saturation nuclear
matter and applications to core-collapse supernova and nuclear
experiments" purely on temporary basis. The tenure of fellowship
initially for a period of one year which may be extended maximum
for a period of three years depending upon the satisfactory
performance of the candidate during the preceding year. This
engagement will be under the sanctioned project of Indo-French
CEFIPRA project.
Essential Qualification: Ph. D in Theoretical Nuclear Physics from
any recognized Institute/University. Candidates having working
experience in the area of nuclear astrophysics will be given
preference.

Fellowship: A fellowship for an amount of Rs.36,000/- p.m. for the
1st year, Rs.38,000/- in the 2nd year and Rs.40,000/- p.m. for the
3rd year plus HRA (if Hostel accommodation is not provided) and
other facilities as admissible as per the institution's rules.
The eligible candidates may send their applications which should
include detailed curriculum vitae, list of publications highlighting their
contribution to the field as well as 2 (two) recommendation letters
alongwith photocopies of all the documents directly to the email:
cvs.sastry@vecc.gov.in. The original application should also be sent
by post to Administrative Officer-Ill, Variable Energy Cyclotron
Centre, Department of Atomic Energy, Sector - 1, Block - AF,
Bidhan Nagar, Kolkata - 700 064. The shortlisted candidates will be
called in VECC, Kolkata for interview/interaction session, dates of
which will be intimated later. This advertisement is also available in
the website of this Centre i.e., www.vecc.gov.in. The last date for
receiving of applications is 27.04.2018.
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EN 52/15 EN 52/90

NATIONAL COUNCIL FOR HOTEL MANAGEMENT
AND CATERING TECHNOLOGY (NCHMCT)

an autonomous organization under Ministry of Tourism, Govt. of
India and 

INDIRA GANDHI NATIONAL OPEN UNIVERSITY (IGNOU),
a people University under Govt. of India

Jointly announce the calling of Application towards
Admission for 2018-19 Academic Session

in their joint collaborative
3 Years (6 Semesters) B.Sc. in Hospitality and

Hotel Administration Degree program
which is delivered through the India's largest chain of best Hotel
Management institutes affiliated to NCHMCT all over India viz
IHM Pusa, Mumbai, Kolkata, Chennai, Bangalore, Hyderabad,
Chandigarh, Goa, Lajpat Nagar and many more (total 58 number
of IHMs). This is a full time, regular, job oriented program, equips
with knowledge, technical skills, service aptitude and exposure
of Hospitality Industry. More than 90% students of these IHMs
gets in-campus selection in Hospitality Industry not only in India
but globally. Most of the top management and middle
management level manpower of Indian Hospitality Industry is the
NCHM affiliated IHM alumnus.

Candidates from all streams of 10+2 Passed/ 
Appearing this year are eligible

For on-line submission of Application Form (w.e.f. 24.12.
2017) log on to https://applyadmission.net/nchm jee2018
or www.nchm.nic. in and follow instructions.
There is no option for OFF-LINE application.
Reservations as per rule.

IMPORTANT DATES
Apply through ON-LINE : 24th December, 2017

to 11th April,2018
Last Date for receipt of 11th April, 2018
Applications : 
Date of JEE Written 28th April, 2018
Examination : (10.00 a.m. to 01.00 p.m)

FEES Of APPLICATION FORM
Rs.800/- for General/OBC categories & Rs.400/- for

SC/ST/PD Categories

NCHM JEE 2018

For enquiry call Toll Free Number:
1800 180 3151 (09:00 a.m. to 05:30 p.m.)

Govt. of India
Ministry of Defence

Establishment (IRDE), Instruments Research
& Development

Defence Research & Development Organisation (DRDO)
Raipur Road, Dehradun-248008 (Uttarakhand)

Applications are invited from the citizens of India for the selection of the Junior
Research Fellowship (JRF) for a period of two years (Extendable as per rules) as per
details given below:-
Instruments R & D Establishment (IRDE), Dehradun is a premier laboratory of the
Defence R & D Organisation (DRDO) engaged in the Research and Development of
advanced technologies in the areas of optics, opto electronics, and photonics to
enhance the defence capabilities of the nation. IRDE invites applications from highly
motivated candidates (Indian citizens) with excellent academic background to work as
Junior Research Fellows for a period of two years (extendable as per rules). They will
work in some of the collaborative projects with IIT Kanpur, IIT Madras, IIT Delhi and
IISc, Bangalore in the frontier areas of Micro-optics and Nanophotonics including
Photonic Crystals, Metamaterials, Silicon Photonics, Micro-optics fabrication and
development of high performance computational imaging systems. IRDE has well
equipped laboratories and state of the art fabrication facilities including UV lithography
and Class 100 & 10000 clean rooms. The Research Fellows will be encouraged to
pursue Ph.D. in some of the above mentioned frontier areas in Photonics and will have
the opportunity to interact with some of the leading researchers in the country
associated with these collaborative projects.
Name of the Post: Junior Research Fellowship (JRF)
Number of Vacancies: 05 (Five) (Vacancies may increase or decrease)
Qualification: Graduate degree in professional course (B.E/B.Tech.) in the field of
Electronics and Communication Engineering/ Mechanical Engg./Electrical Engg. in first
division with NET/GATE. OR
Post graduate degree in professional course. (M.E./M. Tech) in the above field in first
division both at Graduate and Post graduate level.
Desirable Qualification: Interest in research for pursuing Ph.D.
Age: Maximum 28 years on the last date of receipt of application (5 years relaxation to
SC/ST and 3 years to OBC candidates). 
Emoluments: Stipend Rs. 25000/- per month with House Rent Allowance (if
accommodation is not provided) and Medical facilities (will be provided by M.I. Room
of the Establishment).
Important Note:
1. Typed application with complete bio-data should reach the Director, Instruments

Research & Development Establishment, Raipur Road, Dehradun-248008
within 21 days from the date of publication of advertisement in the Employment
News.

2. Please affix a recent passport size photograph on the right top corner of the first

page of the application.
3. Send a Bank draft of Rs.10/- drawn in favour of Director, IRDE, Dehradun

alongwith the application (Candidates belonging to SC/ST and OBC are
exempted from bank draft).

4. Candidates working in Govt. /PSU/Autonomous bodies should apply through
proper channel.

5. Candidates will be required to produce certificates/testimonials in original at the
time of interview otherwise he/she may be disqualified for interview.

6. The selection procedure will consist of written test and Interview.
7. Offer of fellowship does not confer any rights on fellows for absorption in

Government Service in DRDO.
8. Vacancy position may vary.

(H.S. RANA) 
Senior Admin Officer-II

FORMAT FOR JUNIOR RESEARCH FELLOW (JRF) IN
INSTRUMENTS RESEARCH & DEVELOPMENT ESTABLISHMENT (IRDE)

RAIPUR ROAD, DEHRADUN -248008 (UTTARAKHAND)
Post applied for: Junior Research Fellow (JRF) - 2018
Name of Discipline/Subject: _____________________________
Ref: Employment News No.  ____________ and date : ____________
1. Name of the Candidate ______________________________

(Block letters) as per High School Certificate)
2. Father's/Husband's Name : ___________________________
3. Gender : Male/Female _______________________________
4. Date of birth : ______________________________________

(as per High School Certificate)
5. Nationality :  _______________________________________
6. Category: Gen SC ST OBC PHP
7. Marital Status: Married/Unmarried
8. Demand Draft (Only Gen Category): Rs.10/- only. Bank Name,

Bank Draft No. and date
9. Present Address: _____________________________________________
10. Permanent Address: __________________________________________
11. Contact Number: Mob No. :  _____________ Phone No. ______________
12. E-Mail ID if any: ______________________________________________
13. Aadhar Card No. : ____________________________________________

(copy attached)
14. Academic/Technical Qualification: ________________________________
Examin- Subj- University Year of Marks Out of Division Percent-
ation ects or Board Passing Obtai- Total age (%)

ned Marks

Self
attested
passport

size photo

Continued on page 7
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15. Work Experience: _____________________________________________
S. Organization/ Designation Nature of Period
No. Institution Work From To

16. Pursuing any higher qualification:
17. Whether Qualified GATE/NET Examination give with score:       Yes/ NO 

If yes give details: (Submit documents).
18. Any other related information's:
Note: Please enclose self attested photo copy of all certificates/documents.
DECLARATION
I Certify that the foregoing information is correct and complete to the best of my
knowledge and belief.

EN 52/39

EN 52/12 EN 52/20

EN 52/21

HIRING OF SECTOR EXPERTS (FULL /PART TIME)
BEE intends to hire 8 Full Time and 12 Part Time Sector Experts

on contract  initially  for  a   period   of one  year. For details  visit

www.beeindia.gov.in

Last date for submission of application is 21 days from

publication of advertisement in Employment News.

davp 34106/11/0110/1718         Secretary

BUREAU OF ENERGY EFFICIENCY
(A Statutory body under Ministry of Power, 

Government of India)
4th Floor, Sewa Bhawan, R. K. Puram, 

New Delhi- 110066 
Website: www.beeindia.gov.in, 

Ph: 011-26179699-, Fax: 011-26178352

Unique Identification Authority of India
Gol, Ministry of Electronics & Information Technology (MeitY) 

Regional Office, 7th Floor, MTNL Telephone Exchange 
G D Somani Marg, Cuffe Parade, Mumbai - 400005

Advt. No. 1/2018
The authority would like to fill up following posts on deputation basis in UIDAI, Regional
Office located at Mumbai, as per the following requirements:-
Name of the Posts Pay Band with Grade Pay Nos. of 

Posts
Senior Accounts Pay Matrix Level- 10 (Pre-revised Pay Band III 01 (One)
Officer Rs. 15600-39100 + GP Rs. 5400/-)
Assistant Accounts Pay Matrix Level-8 (Pre-revised Pay Band II 01 (One)
Officer Rs. 9300-34800 + GP Rs. 4800/-)
Accountant Pay Matrix Level-5 (Pre-revised Pay Band I 01 (One)

Rs. 5200-20200 + GP Rs. 2800/-)
Section Officer Pay matrix Level - 8

(pre-revised Pay Band II, Rs. 9300 - 34800 01 (One)
plus Grade Pay of Rs. 4800/-)

Private Secretary Pay Matrix Level-8 (Pre-revised Pay Band II 02 (Two)
Rs. 9300-34800 + GP Rs. 4800/-)

Stenographer Pay matrix Level - 6 (Pre-revised Pay Band II, 01 (One)
Rs. 9300- 34800 plus Grade Pay of Rs. 4200/-)

Note: Officers of Central Govt./State Govt./UTs/PSUs/ Autonomous Bodies can
only apply.
The last date for receipt of applications will be 27.04.2018 (1800hrs). For eligibility
criteria, desirable qualification, experience & application form etc. please log on to our
website: uidai.gov.in.

Section Officer (ADMIN) 
(Tel. 022-22188186)

davp 54108/11/0013/1718 EN 52/108

I am fully aware that by providing false information or suppressing material information

while filling this form, the authorities have full right to terminate my fellowship and I am

also liable for appropriate criminal/civil/legal action as a consequence.

I am not aware or any circumstance which might impair my fitness for JRF post.

Date: (Signature of Candidate)
Name ______________

davp 10301/11/0393/1718 EN 52/104
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Government of India
Ministry of Information & Broadcasting

Directorate of Publications Division
Soochna Bhawan, New Delhi-3

Dated : 07th March 2018
Subject:- Filling up of three posts of Accounts Officer (Group-B Gazetted) in
Level-7 of Pay Matrix of 7th CPC (Pre-revised: PB-2, Rs. 9300-34800 + Grade
Pay Rs. 4,600/-) in Publications Division at New Delhi by transfer on
deputation.
It is proposed to fill up three posts of Accounts Officer (Group-B Gazetted) in
Level-7 of Pay Matrix of 7th CPC (Pre-revised: PB-2, Rs. 9300 -34800 + Grade
Pay Rs. 4,600/-) in Publications Division at New Delhi by transfer on deputation,
from amongst officers of the Central Government.

2. The requirements of qualification/ eligibility for applying for the above posts are
as under:-

1. Holding analogous posts on regular basis, or

2. Officers of the rank of Accountant or Audit Officers or Subordinate Account
Service Accountants with 5 years' regular service from any of the organised
Accounts Department like Indian Audit and Accounts Department, Indian
Defence Department and Posts and Telegraphs Accounts Department with
five year's regular service in the posts in Level-6 of Pay Matrix (Pre-revised
scale of Rs. 9300-34800 in PB-2 with Grade Pay Rs. 4200/-).

3. Possessing experience of administration, establishment and accounts
matters.

Other details are as under:-
1. The place of posting will be at New Delhi.

2. The period of deputation including period of deputation in another ex-cadre
post held immediately preceding appointment under these rules in the same
or other organisation/department of the Central Government shall ordinarily
not exceed three years. However, initially the appointment will be for one year
which is extendable from year to year basis at the discretion of the Appointing
Authority. The maximum age shall not exceed 56 years as on closing date of
receipt of application.

3. The pay and allowances of the officers selected will be regulated in
accordance with the Department of Personnel & Training O.M. No. 2/ 29/ 91-
Estt. (Pay) II dated 5th January 1994 as amended from time to time.

4. Officers once selected for the above post will not be ordinarily be allowed to
opt out without a valid reason accepted by the HOD in Publications Division.

3. It is requested that the applications (in duplicate) of the officers who are eligible
and can be spared immediately in the event of selection may be sent to this office
in the Proforma at Annexure-A, addressed to "The Director (Admn.),
Publications Division, Ministry of Information and Broadcasting,
Government of India, Soochna Bhawan, CGO Complex, New Delhi within 30
days from the date of advertisement in Employment News. While forwarding the
applications, the Departments are requested also to furnish an Integrity Certificate
in respect of the officer in addition to Vigilance Clearance and also a certificate to
the effect that no major/minor penalty was imposed on the officer during the last 5
years.

4. No application will be entertained which is found incomplete or received after the
due date of submission and/or which has been forwarded without complete and
up-to-date character rolls, vigilance clearance, etc.

(SANJEEV KUMAR)
DEPUTY DIRECTOR (ADMN.)

TEL: 2436 2932
Annexure-A

CURRICULUM VITAE PROFORMA
APPLICATION FOR APPOINTMENT TO THE POST OF ACCOUNTS OFFICER

GROUP-B (GAZETTED) IN THE SCALE OF PAY LEVEL 07 OF PAY
MATRIX OF 7TH CPC (I.E. IN THE PRE-REVISED SCALE OF PAY OF

RS. 9300-34800 IN PB-2 WITH GRADE PAY OF RS. 4600/-) ON
DEPUTATION IN PUBLICATIONS DIVISION, MINISTRY OF

INFORMATION & BROADCASTING
1. Name and Address (in Block Letters)
2. Date of Birth (in Christian era):
3. Date of retirement under Central/State Government Rules.
4. Educational Qualifications :
5. Whether Educational and other qualifications required for the post are

satisfied. (If any qualification has been treated as equivalent to the one
prescribed in the Rules, state the authority for the same)

6. Please state clearly whether in the light of entries made by you above, you

meet the requirement of the post.

7. Details of Employment, in chronological order. Enclose a separate sheet duly

authenticated by your signature, if the space below is insufficient.

S. Office/ Post From To Scale of Pay Nature of

No. Institution/ held & Basic Pay duties

Orgn.

1. 2. 3. 4. 5. 6. 7.

8. Nature of present employment i.e. Ad-hoc or Temporary or Quasi-Permanent

or Permanent.

9. In case the present employment is held on deputation/contract basis, please

state

a) The date of initial appointment

b) Period of appointment on deputation/contract

c) Name of the parent office/Organization to which you belong.

10. Additional details about present employment. Please state whether working

under:-

(m) Central Government

(n) State Government

(o) Autonomous Organization

(p) Government Undertaking

(q) Universities

(r) Others

11. Please state whether you are working in the same Department and are in the

feeder grade or feeder to feeder grade.

12. Are you in Revised Scale of Pay? If yes, give the date from which the revision

took place and also indicate the pre-revised scale.

13. Total emoluments per month now drawn.

14. Additional information, if any, which you would like to mention in support of

your suitability for the post. Enclose a separate sheet, if the space is

insufficient.

15. Please state whether you are applying for deputation (ISTC)/Absorption/Re-

employment basis. (officers under Central/State Governments are only

elligible for Absorption. Candidates of non-government Organizations are

eligible only for short-term contract).

16. Whether belongs to SC/ST, please mention.

17. Remarks:

I have carefully gone through the vacancy circular/advertisement and I am well

aware that the Curriculum Vitae duly supported by documents submitted by me will

also be assessed by the Selection Committee at the time of selection for the post.

Signature of the Candidate

Date: Address________________

Countersigned

(Employer with seal)

CERTIFICATE

i) Certified that the particulars of the officer has been verified and found to be

correct.

ii) It is certified that no disciplinary proceedings are either pending and or

contemplated against the officer. Also it is certified that no any major/minor

penalty was imposed on the officer during the last 10 years.

iii) Integrity of the officer is also certified.

(Signature of the Head of Office with Stamp)

davp 22213/11/0016/1718 EN 52/3
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National Council for Promotion 
of Sindhi Language

(An autonomous body fully funded by the Ministry of Human Resource
Development, Government of India)

West Block- VIlI, Wing-7, R.K.Puram, New Delhi-110066

ADVERTISMENT FOR THE POST OF DIRECTOR

Applications are invited for the Post of Director, National Council for Promotion
of Sindhi Language (NCPSL), New Delhi, an autonomous body fully funded by
the Ministry of Human Resource Development, Government of India from persons
possessing qualifications and experience mentioned below in the prescribed
proforma published in the Employment News/Rozgar Samachar. The
Application Form, can also be downloaded from http://mhrd.gov.in/
Pay Scale: Pay Band PB-4 Rs. 37,400-67,000/- plus Grade Pay of Rs. 8,700/-
(pre-revised) 
Qualification: 
Essential:
(1) Masters Degree in Sindhi Language/Literature OR Masters Degree in
Linguistics with excellent knowledge of Sindhi. (2) Minimum 55% marks in the
Masters Degree examination (3) In the case of Non-Ph.D candidates: Published
Research/literary work in Sindhi of recognized merit.
Desirable:
(1) Ph.D in Sindhi. OR Ph.D in Linguistics with good knowledge of Sindhi language
(2) Good knowledge of one or more Indian languages in addition to Sindhi (3)
Knowledge of modern principles and techniques of lexicography.
Experience:
(a) For Non-Ph.D Cgndidates: Ten (10) years in group 'A' level post OR Five (5)
years in a post carrying pre-revised pay scale of Rs. 12,000-16,500/-.
(b) For Ph.D Candidates: Five (5) Years in group 'A' level post.
Explanation "Administrative Experience" means experience as head of an
academic institution (including the Head of Department in a College or University)
OR Experience in administrative capacity in a Government, local body or
autonomous organization, preferably connected with the area of
education/languages.
Method of Recruitment
By transfer or deputation from among the officers under the Central/State
Government/Universities/autonomous bodies holding analogous posts or with five
(5) years service in the pre-revised Pay-Scale of Rs. 12000-16500/- with the
educational qualifications given above and minimum fifteen (15) years experience
in the discipline.
Age limit
Age of superannuation is 60 years. The candidate selected should have a
minimum period of three years of service left before superannuation age on the
closing date of receipt of application. The tenure would be initially for three years
extendable up to five years. Retiring/Retired officers governed by State
Government rules may be engaged on contract basis until 60 years of age
provided they fulfil essential qualifications.
Last Date
Duly filled up applications complete in all respects and forwarded through Proper
Channel by the concerned University/College/Department, etc. should reach Shri
V. Sripathi, Under Secretary (L-III), Department of Higher Education, Ministry
of Human Resource Development, Room No. 206, C-Wing, Shastri Bhawan,
New Delhi-110001 within 30 days from the date of publication of the
advertisement for the above post in the Employment News/Rozgar Samachar.
Note-1:- The applicants who are in Central Govt./State Govt Service/Autonomous
Bodies/Union Territories or other Govt. Bodies should submit their application
through Proper Channel along-with Integrity Certificate and a certificate to the
effect that no disciplinary proceedings are pending or contemplated against the
Officer. ACRs of the last five (5) years may also be forwarded along-with the
application.

PROFORMA OF APPLICATION
Application  for the  Post  of  Director,   National  Council  for  Promotion  of
Sindhi  Language (NCPSL), New Delhi
1. Name and Address (in Block Letters) : ______________________
2. Date of Birth (in Christian era) : ____________________________
3. Date of retirement under Central/State Government Rules
________________________________________________________
4. Educational Qualifications
_________________________________________________________________
_________________________________________________________________
5. Whether Educational and other qualifications required for the post are satisfied.
(If any qualification has been treated as equivalent to the one prescribed in the
Rules, state the authority for the same)

Qualifications/ Experience Qualifications/ Experience
required possessed by the officer

Essential (1)
(2)
(3)

Desirable (1)
(2)
(3)

6. Please state clearly whether in the light of entries made by you above, you meet
the requirement of the post __________________________
7. Details   of   Employment,   in   chronological   order.   Enclose   a   separate
sheet   duly authenticated by your signature.

Office/ Post Held From To Scale  of Pay Nature  of
Institution and  Basic Pay duties (in

detail)

8. Nature of present employment i.e. Ad-hoc or Temporary or Quasi- Permanent or
Permanent.
9. In case the present employment is held oh deputation/contract basis, please
state :
a) The date of initial appointment
b) Period  of  appointment  on deputation/contract
c) Name of the parent office/ organization to which you belong
10. Additional details about present employment. Please state whether working
under (indicate the name of your employer against the relevant column) :
Central Govt. :
State Govt. :
Autonomous Organization : 
Government Undertaking :
Universities :
Others :
11. Please state whether you are working in the same Department :
12. Are you in Revised Scale of Pay? If yes, give the date from which the revision
took place and also indicate the pre-revised scale :
13. Total emoluments per month now drawn :
14. Additional information, if any, which you : would tike to mention in support of
your suitability for the post. (This among other things may provide information with
regard to (i) additional academic qualifications  (ii) professional training and
(iii) work experience over and above prescribed in the Vacancy Circular/
Advertisement) (Note: Enclose a separate sheet, if the space is insufficient)
15. Whether belongs to SC/ST
16. Remarks (The candidates may indicate information with regard to (i) Research
publications and reports and special projects (ii) Awards/Scholarship/Official
Appreciation (iii) Affiliation with the professional bodies/institutions/societies and
(iv) any other information. (Note : Ehclose a separate sheet if the space is
insufficient)
I have carefully gone through the vacancy circular/advertisement and I am well
aware that the Curriculum Vitae duly supported by documents submitted by me will
also be assessed by the Selection Committee at the time of selection for the post.

Signature of the Candidate 
Address_________________

_________________________
__________________________

Date : ________________
FORWARDING NOTE BY THE EMPLOYER

It is certified that :
1) Information given in the above proforma is correct as per the service records of
the applicant.
2) The applicant is clear from vigilance angle.
3) The integrity of the applicant is beyond doubt.
4) That no major/minor penalty has been imposed on the applicant during the last
ten (10) years.
5) The cadre controlling authority of the applicant has given clearance to enable
him/her apply for the post.
6) Attested copies of the last five(5) years of the applicant's Annual Confidential
Report/Annual Performance Appraisal Report has been enclosed while forwarding
this application.

Countersigned by the Authorized Signatory on behalf of the Employer
__________________
__________________

(Seal of the Authorized Signatory)
Place : _____________
Date :  _____________

davp 21262/11/0004/1718 EN 52/1
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ONLINE applications are invited from Indian Nationals for direct recruitment to the post
of Scientist 'B' in the National Technical Research Organisation, a premier organisation
under the Government of India.
2. The details/description of the post, number of vacancies, edibility criteria,

permissible age relaxation beyond the upper age limit and service conditions are
given below:-

(A). DESCRIPTION OF POST:
Name of the Classification Pay Scale, Allowances & other benefits
Post
Scientist 'B' General Central Pay Scale: Level-10 (Rs. 56100-Rs.177500) 

Civil Service, of the Pay Matrix.
Group-'A' Allowances & other benefits: Dearness
(Gazetted, Non- Allowance, House Rent Allowance, Transport
Ministerial) Allowance, Leave Travel Concession, Children 

Educational Allowance, Special Allowance, 
Medical facilities, Central Government Emplo- 
yees Group Insurance Scheme, etc. as admi- 
ssible to Central Government employees.

(B) NUMBER OF VACANCIES:
Subject/Stream Vacancies*

UR SC ST OBC Total Remarks
Electronics 06 05 02 08 21 Including 13 (SC-4, ST-2 & 

OBC-7) backlog vacancies
Computer Science 12 08 03 12 35 Including 11 (SC-3, ST-1 &  

OBC-7) backlog vacancies
Geo-Informatics 02 01 01 02 06

* The number of vacancies are provisional and liable to change.
(C) ELIGIBILITY CRITERIA:
Subject/ Essential Qualification (Discipline) Corresponding 
Stream GATE paper

in GATE
Electronics (i) First Class Master's Degree of Science in Elec- Electronics &

tronics/Electronics & Computer Science/Applied Communication
Electronics/ Radio Physics & Electronics from a (EC)
recognized University or Institute; or First Class
Bachelor's Degree in Engineering or Technology
in Electronics/ Electronics Communication & Inst-
rumentation/Electronics & Communication/Elect-
ronics & Power/Telecommunication/Electronics &
Telecommunication/Information & Communication/
Communication/Optics & Optoelectronics from a
recoginsed University or Institute; and
(ii) Knowledge of computer application.

Computer (i) First Class Bachelor's Degree in Engineering Computer
Science or Technology in Computer Science/ Computer/ Science &

Computer Science & Information Technology/Infor- Information
mation Engineering/ Information Technology from Technology (CS)
a recoginsed University or Institute; and
(ii) Knowledge of computer application.

Geo-Infor- (i) First Class Master's Degree of Science in Geo- Geology & 
matics Informatics/Remote Sensing & Geo-Informatics Geophysics

from a recognized University or Institute; or First (GG)
Class Bachelor's Degree in Engineering or
Technology in Geo-Informatics/Geo-Informatics &
Remote Sensing from a recoginsed University or
Institute; and
(ii) Knowledge of computer application.

(D) AGE LIMIT (as on the closing date of online application): Not exceeding 30
years (Relaxable for Government servants up to five years in accordance with
instructions or orders issued by Central Government). However, the upper age
limit is relaxable as per the instructions issued by the Central Government in this
regard from time to time for appointment to the posts under Government of India.

(E) SERVICE CONDITIONS: The candidates appointed are liable to serve
throughout the territory of India and outside India when called upon to do so. They
shall be liable to field service, including service on sea platform, in respect of such
work as may be approved by the organization in public interest.

3. The desirous applicants are requested to go through the complete advertisement
carefully and satisfy themselves about their suitability before filling up the
application form ONLINE. Candidates fulfilling eligibility criteria of essential
qualification, age (with or without relaxation), etc and possessing valid GATE
score card (i.e. GATE - 2016 or 2017 or 2018) in one of the corresponding GATE
paper mentioned above may visit the website http://ntrorectt.in so as to
apply/register themselves ONLINE. The applications submitted through any other
mode will not be accepted. The GATE paper must be related to any one of the
disciplines specified as essential qualification for the respective subject/stream
(Electronic or Computer Science or Geo-Informatics, as the case may be). The
candidates must have possessed the essential qualification in such discipline on
or before the closing date of online application.

4. Candidature of applicants shall be purely PROVISIONAL at all stages of the
recruitment process, subject to his/her satisfying the prescribed eligibility
conditions. If on verification at any time before or after examination, it is found that
a candidate does not fulfill any of the eligibility conditions, his/her candidature for
the said examination shall be cancelled/rejected at any stage of the recruitment
process without any notice. The candidate is also liable for termination from
service, if appointed.

5. IMPORTANT DATES: Online Application/Registration will become operational
from 24 March 2018 (09.00 AM) till the closing date, i.e. 14 April 2018 (05.00
PM). Extension of date for online application/registration, if any, will be notified in
the said website. The personal interview is tentatively scheduled to be conducted
during May/June-2018.

6. SELECTION PROCEDURES:
(i) Eligible registered candidates will be shortlisted based on valid GATE Marks out

of 100 in order of merit in each category of respective subject/stream. The ratio
for shortlisting will be 1:5 (i.e. 05 candidates for every vacancy), subject to
availability of sufficient number of eligible registered candidates. In the event of
two or more candidates having equal GATE Marks out of 100 in any category of
a particular subject/stream, such candidates will be further arranged in
descending order on the basis of percentage of marks obtained by them in
Essential Qualification for shortlisting till the ratio of 1:5 is attained.

(ii) The shortlisted candidates will be required to appear for personal interview
carrying 100 marks which shall consist of Scientific Aptitude Assessment and
Personality Assessment. For considering selection in UR category, a candidate
has to secure minimum 40% marks each in Scientific Aptitude Assessment and
Personality Assessment. For considering selection in OBC/SC/ST category, a
candidate has to secure minimum 30% marks each in Scientific Aptitude
Assessment and Personality Assessment.

Note-I: Where the result of the candidate is indicated in the Final Year Marks Sheet in
CGPA without indicating the corresponding percentage of marks, such candidate,
during the online application/registration, is required to carefully calculate and
mention the correct corresponding percentage by following the criteria/formulae,
if any, indicated therein. In case a particular Institute does not have any criteria
for first class or equivalence, 60% will be taken as equivalent to first class for that
institute. In such cases, in case of non-availability of the conversion formula,
CGPA/CPI of 6.75 (for 10 point scale) will be taken as equivalent to 60%, as per
AICTE guidelines. Where percentage of marks is clearly mentioned in the
Final Year Consolidated Marks Sheet/Degree Certificate of Essential
Qualification, the candidate is required to mention such exact percentage
during the online application/registration.

Note-ll: The information furnished and documents uploaded by the candidates during
online application/Registration will be verified with reference to their original
documents at the time of personal interview and also when report for joining on
their appointment, if selected. During such verification of documents, if it is found
that any information/ document furnished by the candidate is wrong, his/her
candidature will be cancelled/ rejected forthwith. No appeal or representation
against such cancellation/rejection of candidature will be entertained. The
candidates should ensure that they have furnished correct
Information/document during the online application/Registration.

(iii) Final selection will be on the basis of GATE Marks out of 100 (Not GATE score
on a score of 100) and performance in personal interview. For preparation of the
consolidated merit list for final selection, 60% weightage will be given to GATE
Marks out of 100, 30% weightage will be given to marks obtained in Scientific
Aptitude Assessment and 10% weightage will be given to marks obtained in
Personality Assessment.

(iv) Mere position in the Final Merit List will not entitle the candidate for appointment
unless he/she is declared medically FIT to join the post. Instructions for medical
examination will be issued to the candidates in due course as per their position in
the Final Merit List.

7. VENUE OF PERSONAL INTERVIEW: The venue for appearing personal
interview will be at New Delhi or at arty other place as decided by the National
Technical Research Organisation. The detail address of the venue, date and time
of the personal interview will be intimated to the shortlisted candidates through
email.

8. GENERAL INSTRUCTIONS:
(i) Candidates are also advised to fill their correct and active e-mail address and

mobile number during the online application/registration as correspondence will
be made through e-mail/SMS.

(ii) The crucial date for determining the age limit, educational qualifications,
certificates/testimonials, caste, category, etc., shall be the closing date of
online application/registration for this examination.

(iii) The date of birth as well as the name of the applicant will invariably be taken from
the matriculation/10th certificate issued by a recognised board. No other proof of
date of birth and name shall be accepted.

(iv) Certificates in support of qualifications must have been obtained on or before the
closing date.

(v) Degree obtained through Open Universities/Distance education mode will not be
accepted for the purpose of Educational Qualification unless it is recognized by
Distance Education Council in terms of Ministry of Human Resource
Development Notification No. 44, dated 01.03.1995 published in the Gazette of
India dated 08.04.1995 for the relevant period when the candidate acquired the
relevant qualification.

(vi) Candidates must ensure before applying for the post that he/she is eligible for the
post in terms of age, educational qualification, etc. as laid down in this
advertisement. If the information furnished by the candidate at the time of
applying for the post is found to be incorrect at a later date, the candidate
himself/herself will be solely responsible and his/her candidature/service is liable
to be terminated at any time during his/her service.

(vii) Candidates claiming benefit of OBC Category should ensure that they belong to
OBC Category as per the notification of the Central Government meant for
appointment to the posts under the Government of India (and not as per the
notification of the State Government) and also they DO NOT belong to the creamy
layer. The candidate are required to produce the OBC certificate along with the

Government of India

National Technical Research Organisation
DIRECT RECRUITMENT

Start of online Application/Registration: 24 Mar 2018 (09:00 AM) 
Closing date of online Application/Registration: 14 Apr 2018 (05:00 PM)

Continued on page 11
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undertaking in the proforma available in the above mentioned website (click
Instructions-Format of Certificates).

(viii) Candidates already in Government service should inform their Employer and
obtain necessary permission before applying for the said post. No Objection
Certificate (NOC) from the Employer is required to be furnished before
appointment, if selected.

(ix) Consequent upon final selection, only the Roll No./Registration No. of the
selected candidates empaneled for appointment will be made available in the
said website. However, no other details of the selection process will be available
for general information. The candidates, who are empaneled for appointment
after finally selected, will be intimated through e-mail/Speed Post for processing
pre-appointment formalities viz. Medical Examination, Character & Antecedents
Verification, etc.

9. HOW TO APPLY:
(i) Applications should be submitted ONLINE only by visiting the website

https://ntrorectt.in and applications will NOT be accepted through any other
mode.

(ii) Candidate should provide all the required details while filling up the Online
Application/Registration. Mandatory fields are marked with *(asterisk) sign.

(iii) Wrong information in any column may lead to the application getting rejected
altogether.

(iv) The candidates are advised to keep the legible soft copy of the following
documents ready (confirming with size of digital file mentioned against each)
before starting online application/registration since these are required to be
uploaded to successfully complete their registration without any hassle:-

(a) Recent passport size colour Photograph (digital file should be minimum 20 KB
& maximum 40 KB in jpg format).

(b) Scanned Signature (digital file should be minimum 10 KB & maximum 20 KB in
jpg format).

(c) Matriculation/10th Certificate (digital file in jpg or jpeg format should be
minimum 150 KB & maximum 200 KB and the contents are legible).

(d) Final Pass Mark sheet of Essential Qualification (digital file in jpg or jpeg
format should be minimum 150 KB & maximum 200 KB and the contents are
legible).

(e) SC/ST/OBC Certificate (digital file in jpg or jpeg format should be minimum 150
KB & maximum 200 KB and the contents are legible).

(f) Central Government Civilian Employees - Certificate & Declaration by the
applicant (digital file in jpg or jpeg format both together should be minimum 150
KB & maximum 200 KB and the contents are legible), if applicable. The specimen
formats are available in the above mentioned website.

(vi) At the end of the online application/Registration, candidate shall be prompted to
confirm the information/ details provided by him/her and to make, corrections, if
any. Once the candidate has completed his/her registration, he/she will not be
able to correct/amend their registered online application.

(vii) Upon successfully registration of their online application, the candidates are
advised to keep the Registration Number and print-out of his/her application form
in safe custody which will be required to be submitted by them at later stage, as
and when asked for.

(viii) Registration number will be informed to the candidate through e-mail/SMS, Admit
Cards for personal interview will be sent through e-mail. Applicants are therefore
advised to check their email (in box as well as spam folder) from time to time.

10. CANVASSING: Canvassing in any form will disqualify the applicant.
davp 58101/11/0067/1718 EN 52/28

Appendix ‘A’
(Ref  Bengal Area Pro Unit  letter

No. Pro/00051/Rect/A dt 09 May 2017)

Recruitment  to Civilian Post: Cook in the Corps of
Military Police (Bengal Area Provost Unit)

1. Under the authority of Adjutant General Branch MP-4 (CIV) (B), IHQ of MoD
(Army) letter No. 15716/Opt/NAC/PM/16-17/MP- 4 (Civ) (b) dated 21 Oct 2016,
applications  are invited for filling up 01 (One) Post  in  an existing vacancy of
Civilian Cook (UR) in  the Pay Scale of PB-1 of Rs. 5200-20200 with Grade Pay
of Rs. 1900/-.

2. Applications are invited from Indian Nationals for direct recruitment for the under
mentioned post at Bengal Area Provost Unit, C/o 99 APO, PIN-900285 :-

Address Place of Work Post Vacancy
Bengal Area Provost Unit,       Bengal Area Provost Unit,    Cook 01 (UR)
C/o 99 APO, PIN- 900285 C/o 99 APO, PIN-900285

3. Pay Scale, minimum educational qualification, experience, age limit and
suitability  for persons are as under:-

Post Qualification/ Experience Pay Scale Age Limit
Cook (i) Matriculation or equivalent PB-1 of Rs. 5200- Between 18 and 25 years

from recognized Board. 20200 with Grade of age as on the last date
(ii) Must have knowledge Pay of Rs. 1900/- of submission of applic-
of Indian Cooking and (As per 6th CPC) ation (Relaxable for
proficiency in trade. Government servant upto 

40 years in accordance 
with orders/instructions
issued by the Central 
Government).

4. General Instruction / Condition:-
(a) Application must be typed in A4 size paper.
(b) Documents to be enclosed:-
(aa) Photocopies of following documents/certificates will be attached alongwith the

application, duly attested by a Gazetted Officer.
(ab) Copy of Matriculation Certificate.
(ac) Copy of Marksheet of  Matriculation.
(ad) Copy of Birth Certificate or Proof of Date of Birth (As per Matriculation Certificate).
(ae) Copy of NOC in original from their present  employer (only in case of

Government Servant).
(af) Copy of Aadhar card.
(ag) Three latest passport size photographs, self attested.
(ah) Copy of Ex-servicemen Certificate, if applicable.
(ai) Copy of Character Certificate from SP Office of home town (not more than six

months old from date of publication of advertisement).
Note:- Original Certificates should not be sent with application. These should be

produced only at the time of appearing for the examination/tests, if
shortlisted.

5. Application forms received as per given format only be accepted.
6. Candidates are required to forward applications properly sealed, in an envelope

to  the address “Bengal  Area  Provost  Unit, Fort William, Kolkata -700021,
West Bengal” to reach within 45 days from the date of publication of
advertisement through Registered Post/Speed Post. Candidates are required to
mention the name of post  / category (IN  BLOCK  LETTERS) e.g.
“APPLICATION  FOR  THE  POST  OF COOK” on the top of the application form
and as well as on the outside of the envelope in which the application form is
being sent.

7. Candidates are also required to forward a self addressed envelope (size 4” x 10”)
duly affixing  postal  stamp  of Rs. 22/- with application form, for dispatch of the
call  letters for short-listed candidates. Call letters will not be forwarded to those
candidates  who have not enclosed self addressed envelope with postal stamp of
Rs. 22/- affixed on it.

8. Incomplete/illegible/ineligible applications will be deemed invalid and rejected
without  information to the candidate. Application received after closing date will
not be entertained.  Only eligible candidates will be called for written examination.

9. No application will be received by hand. Call letters will be sent to only those
candidates whose applications are found correct in all respects.

10. No TA/DA will be admissible for written examination/tests. Duration of the test can
be 02 to 03 days or more.

11. The place of work for the posts mentioned above is Bengal Area Provost Unit,
C/o 99 APO and will be liable for transfer to anywhere in India, subject to all India
transfer liability and field service liability Rules.

12. New entrants to Central Govt. Service will come under New Contributory Pension
Scheme.

13. Centre of examination is Bengal Area Provost Unit, Fort William, Kolkata -
700021, West Bengal and may be changed to any other place in Kolkata.

14. Syllabus/Pattern. Syllabus for written test will be as per essential qualification
mentioned against the post and will be included for categories namely General
Intelligence and Reasoning, Numerical Aptitude, General English, General
Awareness.

Part Subject Maximum Marks
(a) General Intelligence and Reasoning 25
(b) Numerical Aptitude 25
(c) General English 25
(d) General Awareness 25

15. The recruitment process can be cancelled /postponed/ suspended /terminated
without any prior notice without assigning any reason at any stage.

16. Canvassing in any form shall result in disqualification of the candidate.
17. The Commanding Officer, Bengal Area Provost Unit, Kolkata will not be

responsible for any injuries which occur during the process of testing/selection.

18. The decision of Appointing Authority, The Commanding Officer of Bengal Area
Provost Unit regarding selection/rejection will be final and no correspondence will
be entertained in this regard.

19. No extra weightage will be given for additional /extra/higher qualification for
recruitment.

20. Period of Probation - Two years
21. Merely fulfilling the basic selection criterion does not automatically entitle a

person to be called for test or interview.
Lieutenant Colonel 

Second-in-Command for Commanding Officer
davp 10622/11/0068/1718 EN 52/27

Inland Waterways Authority of India
(A Statutory Body under Ministry of Shipping, Govt. of India ) 

Head Office: A-13 ,Sector -1, Noida, U.P. 201301

Brief Employment Notice No. : IWAI/ SRC/ 2 /2018 Dated: 06/03/2018
IWAI invites applications from the Indian Nationals working in offices of Central/State
Governments/Public Sector Undertakings/Statutory or Autonomous bodies for filling
up the post of Secretary on deputation basis for a period of three years which may be
extended for another two years.
S. No./ Name  of Pay Scale No. of Method   
Post Post Post of recruitment
Code
D.6 Secretary Level- 13 of 7th CPC i.e. pre- 01 Deputation Basis 

revised 6th CPC Pay Band of for 03 years
Rs. 37, 400-67,000/- + Grade
Pay Rs. 8700/- on deputation
basis.

Eligibility conditions, prescribed application format etc. can be downloaded from IWAI
website www.iwai.nic.in. Interested candidates may visit the website and submit the
application in prescribed format alongwith requisite information to Secretary, IWAI
latest by 30.04.2018.
EN 52/16 SECRETARY

Continued from page 10
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Govt. of India
Ministry of Defence

Indian
Ordnance
Factories
Ordnance Factory

Kalpi Road, Kanpur

NOTICE

No.1777/DR/IEs/CS

Dt:  27/02/2018

Sub: Scrapping of the

recruitment process for 100

posts of Labourers. 

Ref: Advt. no. Davp

10201/11/ 2800/1213, EN

50/39 16-22 March 2013

On administrative ground the

recruitment process initiated

with reference to the above

advertisement has been

scrapped.

This is for information of all.

(Anupma Tripathi) 

Addl. General Manager 

davp 10201/11/0378/1718

EN 52/103 EN 52/64

National School of Drama
New Delhi

(An autonomous Institution, under the Ministry of Culture, 
Government of India)

ADMISSION NOTICE- 2018

THREE YEAR DIPLOMA COURSE IN DRAMATIC 
ARTS 2018-2021

The National School of Drama, invites application for admission to its three year
diploma course (full time-residential) in Dramatic Arts, the course starts from 16 July,
2018 and aims at taining students to become professionals in the area of acting,
design, direction and other theatre related disciplines.
Medium of Instruction: Hindi /English
ELIGIBILITY FOR ADMISSION
Essential Qualification : 1) Graduation in any subject from a recognized University  in
India or Abroad .
2) Participation in at least 6 theatre productions.
3) Working knowledge of Hindi/English.
Desirable : 1) 3 recommendations from theatre Experts.
2) Documentary proof of the theatre experience.
AGE LIMIT as on 1.7.2018 Minimum 18 years Maximum 30 years.
The upper age limit is relaxable for reserved category candidates as per GOI rules
(5 years for SC/ST).
RESERVATION FOR SC/ST/OBC (Non Creamy Layer)/PwD:
Out of 26 seats, 4 seats are reserved for candidates belonging to the scheduled caste;
2 seats are reserved for scheduled tribes, 7 seats are reserved for OBC (Non Creamy
Layer as notified by the Government) and reservation for PwD, as per Govt. of India
rules.
SELECTION:
The selection is a two phase process. The candidate should appear for a preliminary
examination and if selected then has to appear for a final examination workshop.
CENTRES FOR PRELIMINARY TEST/AUDITION AND FINAL WORKSHOP:
A preliminary test/audition will be conducted at twelve centers i.e.
Jaipur 1st & 2nd  May, 2018
Chandigarh 4th & 5th May, 2018
Lucknow 7th, 8th & 9th May, 2018
Patna 11th & 12th May, 2018
Bhubaneswar 14th May, 2018
Kolkata 16th, 17th & 18th May, 2018
Guwahati 20th May, 2018
Chennai 22nd May, 2018
Bengaluru 24th May, 2018
Mumbai 26th, 27th, 28th, 29th May, 2018
Bhopal 31st May,1st & 2nd June, 2018
Delhi 4th, 5th, 6th, 7th & 8th June, 2018

Study Material and guidelines for preliminary test/audition will be available with the
prospectus both in hard copy and website.
The candidates qualifying in this test will have to attend a workshop of 5 days in the
School premises, New Delhi from 26th to 30th June, 2018, for their final selection for
which they will be paid D.A. and 3 tier Sleeper class train/bus fare from the place of
their residence to Delhi & back by the shortest route, on submission of ticket/cash
receipt and will also be provided accommodation on modest sharing basis.
An Expert Committee constituted by the School will assess the aptitude and talent of
the candidates & its decision will be final. Any CANVASSING in this regard will be
treated as a disqualification. The school reserves the right to shortlist the number of
candidates for audition/preliminary test on the basis of experience of the candidates in
theatre arts.
FINANCIAL ASSISTANCE :
All selected students will be given a monthly scholarship of 
Rs. 8000/- p.m. to meet their academic and related expenses.
PHYSICAL FITNESS :
The students selected for admission will be required to undergo a medical test for
physical fitness at NSD Delhi. Their final selection is subject to clearance of the fitness
test. 
HOW TO APPLY : 
Applicant  can choose any one option listed below:
Option 1) : Application form can be filled up online and submitted at  school website
http://www.onlineadmission.nsd.gov.in from 16/03/2018. The form, necessary
documents may also be submitted online, Fee Rs. 50/- is to be paid for filling form
online. Last date to fill up online form is 16/04/2018.
Option 2) : Application form can also be downloaded from the school website
www.nsd.gov.in from 16/03/2018. The downloaded application form must be sent
along with Demand Draft of Rs. 150/- in favour of  The Director, National School of
Drama, New Delhi in an envelope titled "Application for Admission-2018-21". Form
sent in envelopes without DD/Pay Order will not be entertained.  
Option 3) : Application form & prospectus will also be available from the Book Shop of
the National School of Drama from 16/03/2018 to 16/04/2018 on cash payment of  Rs.
150/- between 10.00 am to 1.00 pm & 2.00 pm to 5.00 pm on working days.
Option 4) : To receive the application form and prospectus (in English & Hindi) by post,
please write to The Dean, Academic, National School of Drama, Bahawalpur
House, Bhagwandas Road, New Delhi - 110001 alongwith a crossed Demand
Draft/Pay Order, payable at Delhi, of Rs. 225/- (Rupees two hundred twenty five only)
including postal charges in favour of The Director, National School of Drama, New
Delhi. Request for receiving the application form by post must reach the school by
28/03/2018.
Offline application forms duly filled in & complete in all respects must reach To Dean
Academic, National School of Drama, Bahawalpur House, Bhagwandas Road,
New Delhi- 110001 on or before 16/04/2018. No application form will be entertained
after the last date in any circumstances.
All the foreign nationals have to apply through Indian Council for Cultural Relation as
per the norms.
davp 09130/11/0078/1718 EN 52/94
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F. No. A-12025/01/2018-ISH.l
Government of India

Ministry of Labour 
& Employment

It is proposed to fill up one Post of Director (Safety) in (Pre-revised
PB-3- Rs. 15,600/- 39,100/- + Grade Pay 7,600/-) in the Directorate
General Factory Advice Service and Labour Institutes (DGFASLl),
Mumbai which is an attached office under the Ministry of Labour &
Employment by transfer on deputation (including short-term-
contract) from amongst officers under the Central Government/
State Governments/Public Undertakings/recognized research
institutions/statutory or autonomous organizations :-
a) i)  holding analogous posts on regular basis;

OR      
ii) with five years' regular service in Posts in the Pre-revised
Pay Band -3 ( Rs. 15,600/- 39,100/- + Grade Pay 6,600/-)   or
equivalent; and

b) Possessing the following essential educational qualifications
and experience:
i) Degree in Mechanical or Electrical or Chemical or Marine
Engineering of a recognized University or equivalent.
ii) Ten years' experience in handling various aspects of
Industrial Safety in a factory, dock, ship or a technical
institution/organization or in a Government Department
dealing with the administration of Factories Act, 1948 (63 of
1948) or the Dock Workers (Safety, Health and Welfare) Act,
1986 (54 of 1986).

For more details please visit Ministry of Labour and Employment's
website http://labour.nic.in. Completed applications should reach
the undersigned on or before six weeks from date of publication of
advertisement in Employment News.

(B. Neeraja) 
Under Secretary to the Govt. of India

davp 23101/11/0008/1718 EN 52/4 EN 52/19

EN 52/41

EN 52/18

Government of India 

Serious Fraud Investigation Office
2nd Floor, Pt. Deendayal Antyodaya Bhawan

B3 Wing, CGO Complex, Lodhi Road, New Delhi-110003
No. 02/01 /2017-Admn.SFIO/Vol.II

NOTICE FOR EXTENSION OF LAST DATE
The closing date for receipt of applications in respect of following vacancies published

in Employment News dated 18-24 November, 2017 to be filled on deputation (ISTC)
basis in SFIO has further been extended up to 30.04.2018:
Sr. Category of Post Tentative Scale of Pay Tentative Place
No. No. of Posts (Pre-revised) of Posting
1. Additional Director 02 Rs. 37400-67000 

(Financial Transactions) plus GP Rs. 8700 Delhi/
2. Additional Director 02 Rs. 37400-67000 Mumbai/

(Forensic Audit) plus GP Rs. 8700 Kolkata/
3. Additional Director 01 Rs. 37400-67000 Chennai/

(Capital Market) plus GP Rs. 8700 Hyderabad

Sr. Category of Post Tentative Scale of Pay Tentative Place
No. No. of Posts (Pre-re vised) of Posting

4. Deputy Director 01 Rs. 15600-39100 Delhi/
(Banking) plus GP Rs. 6600 Mumbai/

5. Deputy Director 01 Rs. 15600-39100 Kolkata/
(Corporate Law) plus GP Rs. 6600 Chennai/

6. Senior Assistant Director 05 Rs. 15600-39100 Hyderabad
(Forensic Audit) plus GP Rs. 5400

7. Senior Assistant Director 03 Rs. 15600-39100 
(Corporate Law) plus GP Rs. 5400

8. Private Secretary 08 Rs. 9300-34800
plus GP Rs. 4600

All other terms and conditions would remain the same. The particulars of posts,
eligibility conditions etc. may be obtained from the website www.sfio.nic.in.
davp 07102/11/0017/1718 EN 52/100 Joint Director (Admn)
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F. No. 21-7/2017-E.III

National Council of Educational
Research & Training 

Sri Aurobindo Marg, New Delhi-110016
Vacancy Notice

Applications in the prescribed proforma are invited from suitable and eligible candi-
dates for filling up the following posts on deputation basis on foreign services terms for
a period of 01 year extendable upto 03 years on year to year basis , in the National
Council of Educational Research and Training, Sri Aurobindo Marg, New Delhi.
The details of the qualification and eligibility criteria are mentioned below against each
posts:-
Sl. Name of the posts. Level of Pre-revised scale as 
No. Pay Matrix per 6th CPC
1. Head, Publication Division-01 Level-12 PB-III Rs. 15600-39100+GP

(01-UR) Rs. 7600.
2. Editor-01 (01-ST) Level-11 PB-III Rs. 15600-39100+GP

Rs. 6600.
3. Assistant Editor-03 (02-UR, 01-ST) Level-10 PB-lIl Rs. 15600-39100+GP

Rs. 5400.
4. Store Keeper Gr.l-01 (01-UR) Level-05 PB-I Rs. 5200-20200+GP

Rs. 2800.
5. Proof Reader-02 (02-UR) Level-04 PB-I Rs. 5200-20200+GP

Rs. 2400.
Educational qualification and eligibility criteria
SI. Name & No. of Scale of Eligibility conditions
No. vacant post pay
1. Head, Level-12 By deputation from the Officials of the Central  

Publication (Pre-revised Govt./State Govt./Central Autonomous organiza-
Division- Rs. 15600- tion holding analogous post on regular basis in
01 (UR) 39100+ GP the parent cadre OR Officers having 05 years 

Rs. 7600). regular service in posts drawing Grade Pay 
Rs 6600 and possessing the following qualifi-
cations.
Essential qualifications :
1. Master's Degree from a recognized University

OR
Bachelor Degree in Printing Technology.
2.At least 15 years of experience in book publi-
shing house including production or editing or
supervising distribution and sales of all kinds
of books, textbooks, monographs and reports
in a senior management level in Govt./Semi
Govt. or an autonomous publishing and printing
establishment.
3. i) Knowledge of advanced book production
processes including pre-press, press, post-press
paper procurement process for publications, etc.

OR
ii) Knowledge of editing and use of graphic
softwares and its applications in book production
process.

OR 
iii) Knowledge of sales promotion and material
management and inventory control related to
publications.
Desirable :
1. Master degree in Mass Communication or
Printing Technology or two years management
course in marketing or business administration.
2. In depth knowledge of managing publication
and production activities through advanced
information and communication technologies
(ICT) and have the capability of managing a
large network of Distribution outlets.

2. Editor-01 Level-11 By deputation from the Officers of the Central 
(ST) (Pre-revised Govt./State Govt./Central Autonomous organiza-

Rs. 15600- tion holding analogous post on regular basis in
39100+ GP the parent cadre OR Officers having 05 years
Rs. 6600). regular service in the post drawing Grade Pay 

of Rs 5400 and having the requisite educational 
qualification prescribed for direct recruitment.
Essential:-
1) A Bachelor degree from a recognized
University.
2) Post Graduate Diploma in Book Publishing/
Mass Communication/Journalism, where editing
is one of the subject.
3) At least 8 years experience in editing, produc-
ing-planning and supervising publications
especially school textbooks, monographs and
reports in a responsible capacity.
4) Knowledge of books production techniques,
modern process of printing, typography and
should be proficient in English/Hindi/Urdu
Desirable:
1) Word processing and techniques of online
editing.

3. Assistant Level-10 By deputation from the Officials of the Central 
Editor-03 (Pre-revised Govt./State Govt./Central Autonomous organiza-
(02-UR, 01-ST) Rs. 15600- tion holding analogous post on regular basis in 

39100 + Gp the parent cadre OR Officers possessing the 
Rs. 5400). requisite educational qualification for direct 

recruitment and having 08 years regular service
in the Grade Pay of Rs 4200/- /having 03 years 
regular service in the Grade Pay of Rs 4600/-/
having 02 years regular service in the Grade
Pay of Rs. 4800/-
Essential:
1) A Bachelor degree from a recognized
University.
2) Post Graduate Diploma in Book Publishing/
Mass Communication/Journalism, where editing
is one of the subject.
3) At least 5 years' experience in editing,
producing-planning and supervising publications
especially school textbooks, monographs and
reports in a responsible capacity.
4) Knowledge of books production techniques,
modern process of printing, typography and 
should be proficient in English/Hindi/Urdu 
Desirable: 
Word processing and techniques of online 
editing.

4. Store Keeper Level-05 By deputation from the Officials of the Central 
Gr.-I- 01 (Pre-revised Govt./State Govt./Central Autonomous organiza-
(UR) Rs. 5200- tion holding analogous post on regular basis in 

20200 + Gp the parent cadre or department and possessing 
Rs. 2800). the requisite educational qualification prescribed 

for direct recruitment. 
OR

Officers having 05 years regular service in the 
post drawing Grade Pay of Rs.  2400  and  
possessing  the  requisite  educational 
qualification prescribed for direct recruitment.
Essential:
1. A Bachelors' Degree in Arts/Science/
Commerce

OR
A Bachelor's  Degree/Diploma in any stream of 
Engineering/material management from a 
recognized University.
2. Two (2) years experience of procurement/
Inspection /Maintenance/Custody/Accounting
of Stores and verification of Stores in a well
established stores organization in Govt./Semi-
Govt./ Industry/ Private Organization.
3. Working knowledge of computer
Desirable:
1. Certificate/Diploma in Purchasing, Store
Keeping and Stock Control.

6. Proof Level-04 By deputation from the Officials of the Central 
Reader-02 (Pre-revised Govt./State Govt./Central Autonomous organiza-
(02-UR) Rs. 5200- tion holding analogous post on regular basis in 

20200 + Gp the parent cadre OR Officers having 08 years 
Rs. 2400). regular service in the post drawing Grade Pay 

of Rs. 1900 and possessing the requisite 
educational qualification prescribed for direct 
recruitment. 
Essential:
1. A Bachelor’s degree either in English/Hindi/
Urdu.
2. At least 1 year experience of working in a
Printing or Publishing organization as Copy
Holder/Proof Reader.
3. Working knowledge of Computer.
Desirable:
1. Knowledge of  Typography

Note 1. The departmental officers in the feeder category who are in the direct line of
promotion shall not be eligible for consideration for appointment on deputation.  
Similarly, the deputationists shall not be eligible for consideration for appointment by
promotion.
Note 2: Period of deputation including the period of deputation in another ex-cadre 
post held immediately preceding this appointment in the same or some other organi-
zation or department of the Central Government shall ordinarily not exceed three
years.  The maximum age limit for appointment by deputation shall be 'Not exceeding
56 years' as on the closing date of receipt of applications.
Note 3: For the purpose of appointment on deputation basis, the service rendered on
a regular basis by an officer prior to 1st January, 2006 (the date from which the revised
pay structure based on the Sixth Central Pay Commission recommendation has been 
extended)  shall be deemed to be service rendered in the corresponding grade pay or 
pay scale extended based on the recommendations of the Pay Commission except 
where there has been merger of more than one pre-revised scale of pay into one grade 
with a common grade pay or pay scale and where this benefit will extend only for the
post(s) for which that grade pay or pay scale is the normal replacement grade without 
any upgradation.
Eligible candidates may send their application duly signed along with the attest-
ed copies of qualifications/experiences/caste certificates with the latest pass-
port size photograph pasted on the application through proper channel to the
Under Secretary, E.III, NCERT, Sri Aurobindo Marg, New Delhi -110016 within 21
days from the date of publication of this advertisement in the Employment News
in the proforma enclosed. The employer while forwarding such application
should send vigilance clearance certificate and attested copies of ACRS/APARS
of the employees for the last 05 years.
For downloading the proforma of application please visit NCERT webslte :
www.ncert.nic.in. in case of alteration/modificatfon/deletion/addltions/updation 

Continued on page 15

www.employmentnews.gov.in14 Employment News  24 - 30 March 2018RECRUITMENT
https://t.me/Estore33_com https:/t.me/TheHindu_Zone_Official

https://t.me/Estore33_com

https://t.me/Estore33_com
https:/t.me/TheHindu_Zone_Official
http://www.estore33.com
https://t.me/Estore33_com


in the advertisement (if any) the same will be uploaded in the NCERT website only.
The selected candidate can be posted in the NCERT, Headquarter New Delhi and
its constituent units/Institutes situated in various states in India.

(Rajesh Kumar)   
Under Secretary E.lll NCERT

APPLICATION PROFORMA FOR THE POST OF.........................................
(ON DEPUTATION)

1. Name and Designation :.....................................................................................
2. Post applied for :.....................................................................................
3. Date of Birth :.....................................................................................
4. Gender: (Male/Female) :.....................................................................................
5. Date of Retirement :.....................................................................................
6. Educational Qualifications :.....................................................................................
7. Mobile No. & e-mail ID. :.....................................................................................
8. Details of employment in chronological order. Enclose a separate sheet duly authen-
ticated by the Department, if space  below is insufficient.

Department/Office/ Post held From To Scale of pay Nature of 
Institution/ and basic pay duties

Organisation therein performed

9. Nature of present employment. : Temporary/Permanent.
10. Basic pay, Level of pay in Pay Matrix  :..............................................................
11. Additional information, if any, which you would like to mentioned in support of your

suitability for the post. Enclose a separate sheet, if the space is insufficient.
12. Whether belonging to SC/ST/OBC/PWD :
13. Remarks. :

(Signature of the candidate)
Address:

Dated:
It is certified that particulars furnished by the applicant are correct and no disciplinary
case is either pending or contemplated against the officer and no penalty, major or
minor, was imposed on the officer during the last 05 years and his integrity is beyond
doubt.

Signature of the Head of Department
EN 52/6 (with stamp)

Continued from page 14
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EN 52/14

Continued on page 17

HQ Eastern Air Command: Indian Air Force 
Direct Recruitment for Group 'C' Civilian Post

1. Applications are invited from eligible Indian Citizens for recruitment for the under-
mentioned Group 'C' civilians post in Indian Air Force. The details of the post, eligible
conditions and the location of the stations where vacancy has been allotted are follows:-

SI. No. Units/ Stations MTS Total 
1. Station Commander 01 (UR) 01

Air Force Station, Missamari (Assam)
2. The following are given eligible conditions as per the recruitment rules (RRs):-
Age limit  : For the post of MTS : 18 - 25 years
3. Age Limit Relaxation:
(a) 10 years for the candidates belonging to Physically handicapped (Additional 05 years
in case of Physically Handicapped belonging to SC, ST & 03 Years for OBC category).
(b) Ex-Serviceman: Ex-Serviceman who have rendered not less than 06 months of
continuous service in the Armed Forces shall be allowed to deduct the full period of such
service from their actual age and, if the resultant age does not exceed the prescribed
maximum age by more than three years, they shall be deemed to be within age limits.
(c) Departmental employees:- 40 years for UR.
4. SC/ST/OBC candidates applying against UNRESERVED post are not entitled to any
relaxation in age limit, experience etc.
5. Benefit for Women Employee: Women employees fulfilling the requirement for apply-
ing the above posts are allowed to avail the benefits available to women employees as
mentioned in the Min. of Pers, DOP&T NO. 13018/4/2009-Estt (L) dated 08 Jul 09.
6. The crucial date for determining age limit is the last date of receipt of applications /
last date up to which the employment exchange is asked to submit the names.
7. Educational Qualification:-

Post Educational & Other Qualification

MTS Matriculation pass or equivalent qualification from a recognised University 
or Board.
Desirable. One year of experience as Watchman or Lascar or Gestetner
operator or Mali from an Organisation or Institute.

8. Pay Scale:
(a) Level - 1 in pay matrix of 7th CPC. (Erstwhile PB-1 with GP Rs. 1800/- in terms of
6th CPC)
9. Application is to be forwarded only through ordinary post. Applications sent
through Registered Post/Speed Post/Courier etc. will not be accepted and liable
to be  rejected. Application as per format given under may be typed in English (past-
ed with recent passport size photograph duly attested by self) and duly filled alongwith

the photocopies of the following supporting documents, duly self attested may be sent
to Stn Cdr Air Force Station, Missamari Assam.
(i) Proof of date of birth (ii) Educational qualification certificate. (iii) Experience certifi-
cate (if any) (iv) Any other documents as required. (v) Two copies of recent passport
size photographs (vi) One self addressed envelop with stamps of Rs. 5/- (self address
should be typed or neatly hand written in English / Hindi) (vii) Applicants should promi-
nently annotate his/ her contact number (mobile or landline) on the application. (viii)
Original certificates are NOT (R) NOT to be sent. IAF is not responsible for any
loss of documents/certificates in due course.
10. Application must be submitted within 30 days from last date of publication of
this advertisement in 'Employment News/Rozgar Samachar. Application
received thereafter will not be entertained. Further, IAF will not be responsible for
any kind of postal delay.
11. In case of ex-serviceman self attested photocopy of discharge book is to be sub-
mitted along with the application. Applicant serving under Government/Semi-Govt/
PSUs must apply through proper channel.
12. Applicant to be mentioned clearly on the envelope "APPLICATION FOR THE
POST OF............................AND CATEGORY ..................................
13. Merely fulfilling the basic selection criteria does not automatically entitle a person
to be called for written test/skill/practical test. If the number of applications received is
too large in comparison to the number of posts, only shortlisted candidates will be
called for written test. An application can be rejected without any intimation to the can-
didate. The centre for examination/ skill/practical/physical test may be different from the
place to which the application was sent. This is done purely for administrative conven-
ience. Further, However, no TA / DA will be paid to the candidate to attend the written
test or physical test / practical / Skill test.
14. Candidates appearing for the examination are required to carry a photo bearing iden-
tity card (Voter Card/ Aadhar card/ PAN card/ Driving Licence/ Passport etc. in original.
15. The above posts carry an "All India Service Liability".
16. Selected candidates will be given appointment subject to verification of character
and antecedents, caste status, Educational Qualification, etc. and Submission of
Medical Fitness Certificate duly signed by Govt Medical Officer/ Civil Surgeon.
17. If at any stage of recruitment/ appointment, it is found that the candidate has sub-
mitted any false/ fabricated information/ documents, his/her candidature will be can-
celled forthwith and he/she will be liable for criminal charges under IPC, 1860.
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FOR OFFICIAL RECORD ONLY
1. Received on..........................................................................................................
2. Accepted / Rejected ............................................................................................
3. Reason for rejection: Underage / Overage / incomplete documents / Any other

reason to be specified ..........................................................................................
4. Index No......................................... Date of test/skill/practical/physical test 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT CARD 
Post of .........................................................

1. Name :........................................................................................... 
2. Father's Name :............................................................................. 
3. Address for correspondence: (to be filled same as per Column-6

of application form)
House No./Street/Village............................................Post Office......................... 
Distt...........................State.........................................Pin Code............................
Mobile No...........................................

4. Index No.- Date & Time of test/skill/practical/physical test................................
Venue of Written Test/Skill/Practical/Physical test ...............................................

Signature of Controlling Officer 
davp 10801/11/0098/1718 EN 52/95

Continued from page 16
18. The Air Officer Commanding / Station Commander / Commanding Officer of the
concerned Air Force have the right to reject any application without assigning any rea-
son. Similarly, HQ EAC, IAF has the right to change number of vacancies / reservations
status of the post at any Air Force Stations under this Command at any time before the
selection.
APPLICATION FOR THE POST OF...............................in.................................... Unit
1. Post applied for ..................................................................
2. Name of the Candidate (in block letter) ..............................
3. Father's name .....................................................................
4. Date of Birth........................./........................./.........................

(attach copy of Birth / Matriculation Certificate self attested)
5. Age as on last date prescribed for receipt of application

Year......................Months......................Days......................
6. Address for correspondence:

House No./Street/Village.............................................Post Office......................... 
Distt...........................State.........................................Pin Code............................
Contact / Mobile No...........................................

7. Permanent address:-
House No./Street/Village.............................................Post Office......................... 
Distt...........................State.........................................Pin Code............................
Contact / Mobile No...........................................

8. Caste: Gen/OBC/SC/ST ......................................................................................
(Attach Certificate in case of SC/ST/OBC)

9. Education Qualification.......................................................................................
(attach education certificate self attested)

10. Any other qualification/Experience ....................................................................
11. Category for which applied: Gen (UR)/OBC/SC/ST/ Ex-Serviceman / Meritorious

Sport person / Physically handicapped..............................................................
(Attach copy self attested)

12. Technical Training / Experience :.........................................................................
13. Domicile.............................................................................................................

(attach self attested copy)
14. Whether registered with any Employment Exchange:- Yes / No If yes, mention

registration No. and Name of employment exchange ...........................................
15. I hereby certify that above particulars mentioned in the application are correct and

true to the best of my knowledge and belief, if particulars mentioned by me are
found false at any stage than I shall be liable to be terminated without any notice.

Date :............ (Signature of Candidate)

Self 
Photograph

Paste a self
attested 

photograph  

Government of India  
Ministry of Micro, Small & Medium Enterprises 
Office of Development Commissioner (MSME) 

New Delhi
CENTRAL INSTITUTE OF HAND TOOLS, JALANDHAR

(A Government of India Society under Ministry of MSME)
G.T. Road, By-Pass, Jalandhar - 144008 (Punjab)

REQUIRES 
PRINCIPAL DIRECTOR

Central Institute of Hand Tools, (CIHT), Jalandhar has been set up as a National Institute for Hand Tools
at Jalandhar in the State of Punjab with the assistance of UNIDO in the year 1983. CIHT is a
Government of India Society, registered under Societies Registration Act and is functioning as an
autonomous body under Ministry of Micro, Small and Medium Enterprises, Government of India. The
main objectives of the Institute are to provide technology support services to the micro, small & medium
industries such as improved design and production technologies for hand tools, common facility servic-
es for forging, die, tools, jigs & fixture, testing & quality control techniques and skill development activi-
ties in the field.
The Principal Director, being the Executive Head of CIHT shall be responsible for day-to-day manage-
ment and affairs of the Society and shall exercise his powers under the direction, superintendence and
control of Chairman of the Governing Council. It shall be the duty of Principal Director to co-ordinate and
exercise general supervision of overall activities of the CIHT.
Applications are invited from citizens of India for the post of PRINCIPAL DIRECTOR in CENTRAL
INSTITUTE OF HAND TOOLS, JALANDHAR which is proposed to be filled up on contract basis for a
period of 5 years initially  with further extension based on review of performance. The details regarding
eligibility condition etc. are as under:
1. Educational Qualifications:
(a) Essential : Degree in Mechanical/Production Engineering or equivalent from a recognized

University/Institution.
(b) Desirable : Post Graduate qualification in Engineering/Technology/Management from a recog-

nized Institution.
2. Experience:
(a) Essential : 15 years experience in Production/Training department of a Tool Room/reputed

Engineering industry of which 10 years in a managerial technical position.
(b) Preferable: Implementation and Management of Engineering Projects, experience in use of com-

puterized Management Information System including reverse engineering. Rapid Prototyping,
CAD/CAM and CNC technologies etc. Experience in Administration, Finance & Labour
Management.

3. Scale of Pay : PB-4, Pay Band- Rs. 37,400 67,000/- + GP Rs.8,900/- (as per 6th CPC)/ Pay Matrix
Level-13 A (as per 7th CPC). The post besides basic pay carries allowances as per Government
Rules.

4. Age : 50 years (relaxable up to 5 years for SC/ST/Internal candidates and 3 years for OBC candidates).
Application as per the Proforma given in detailed advertisement on Website www.dcmsme.gov.in and
www.ciht.in should be sent at the following address by 15.05.2018.
"Director (Adorn), Office of the Development Commissioner (MSME), Room No. 734, 7th Floor,

A Wing, Nirman Bhawan, Maulana Azad Road, New Delhi-110108".
www.msme.gov.in www.msmedatabank.in www.udyogaadhaar.gov.in

davp 25113/11/0402/1718 EN 52/98
EN 52/52

Bureau of Indian Standards
Manak Bhavan, 9 Bahadur Shah Zafar Marg

New Delhi-110002
Corrigendum 

RECRUITMENT OF SCIENTIST-B
Reference is invited to advertisement dated 15.03.2018 regarding
recruitment of Scientist-B by Bureau of Indian Standards, New Delhi.
In this regard, it may be noted that the number of vacancies in the
Mechanical Engineering and Civil Engineering disciplines has
undergone changed. The changed position regarding vacancy is as
under:

Discipline Number of Vacancies

Total UR OBC SC ST

Mechanical Engineering 21 10 6 3 2

Civil Engineering 18 8 5 3 2

The vacancy figures are indicative and are subject to change.
This corrigendum also appears on the BIS website www.bis.gov.in.
davp 08103/11/0026/1718 EN 52/102

Dr. Babasaheb Ambedkar Marathwada University, Aurangabad is "A" Grade University
re-accredited by NAAC,  Bangalore  in   2013. The jurisdiction of the University is
spread over Aurangabad, Jalna, Beed & Osmanabad districts of Maharashtra. Online
applications  for the post of FINANCE & ACCOUNTS  OFFICER are invited from eligi-
ble Indian national in the prescribed application form. Detailed information about
Qualifications, Experiences & submission of application etc. is made available on
University Website:- www.bamu.ac.in.
i) Last date for online submission of forms: - 31-03-2018.
ii) Last date for receipt of application forms (Hard Copy) in the University
office : 07-04-2018.

Advt No. Estt/RO/11/2018.
Date :-07-03-2018
EN 52/67 Registrar

Dr. Babasaheb Ambedkar Marathwada University
Aurangabad- 431 004 (Maharashtra State)

Ph. Nos. 0240-2403399 - 400, (Off.) 2403104
E-mail: vc@bamu.ac.in, registrar@bamu.ac.in

Websile : www.bamu.ac.in

Appointment of Finance and Accounts Officer
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Applications are invited from officers under the Central/State Governments/Public
Sector Undertakings/Agricultural Universities/Recognized Research Institutes or
Autonomous Organizations holding (a) (i) analogous post on regular basis; or (ii) with
5 years regular service in Level 12 [pre-revised Pay Band-3 Rs. 15600-39100/- +
7600/- (Grade Pay)] or equivalent; or (iii) with 10 years service in Level 11 [Pay Band-
3 Rs. 15600-39100/- + 6600/- (Grade Pay)] or equivalent; and (b) Possessing the
following educational qualifications and experience (i) Degree in Agricultural
Engineering or Soil and Water Conservation Engineering or Post Graduate Degree in
Agronomy or Soil Science from a recognized University; and (ii) 12 years experience in
Water Conservation and management of irrigated agriculture and on-farm development
work in the irrigation or agricultural department of a State/ Central Government or in any
recognized Agricultural University or in any agricultural training or research or
management Institute, for appointment on deputation (including short-term contract) to
the post of Senior Joint Commissioner (Agricultural Discipline) in the Level 13 [pre-
revised PB-4 of Rs. 37400-67000/- + 8700/- (Grade Pay)] in the Ministry of Water
Resources, River Development & Ganga Rejuvenation. PERIOD OF DEPUTATION/
CONTRACT: shall not exceed 5 years. MAXIMUM AGE LIMIT: 56 years as on the
closing date of receipt of applications. Terms and conditions of deputation including pay
will be governed as per rules of Government from time to time. LAST DATE OF
RECEIPT OF APPLICATIONS: Applications (in triplicate) in the prescribed proforma
(Appended below) may be forwarded through proper channel within 60 days of
publication of this advertisement to the Under Secretary (Admn), Ministry of Water
Resources, River Development & Ganga Rejuvenation, Shram Shakti Bhawan,
Rafi Marg, New Delhi-110001. While forwarding the applications the sponsoring
authority may certify that (i) particulars given by the applicant are correct (ii) no
vigilance/disciplinary case is either pending or contemplated against the applicant (iii)
in case of selection, the officer will be relieved for taking up the new assignment (iv)
upto date CR dossier/ photocopies of ACRs for the last 5 years duly attested by an
officer of the rank of Under Secretary of the Govt. of India or above and (v) no major/
minor penalty has been imposed on him/her during the last 10 years or a list of major/
minor penalties imposed on him/her during the last 10 years be sent along with
applications.

Annexure-I
BIO-DATA/CURRICULUM VITAE PROFORMA

1. Name and Address (in Block letters) :
2. Date of Birth (in Christian era) :
3. i) Date of entry into service

ii) Date of retirement under Central/State
Government Rules

4. Educational Qualifications
5. Whether Educational and other qualifications

required for the post are satisfied. (If any qualification
has been treated as equivalent to the one prescribed
in the Rules, state the authority for the same)
Qualifications/Experience required as men- Qualifications/Experience
tioned in the advertisement/vacancy circular possessed by the Officer
Essential Essential
A) Qualification A) Qualification
B) Experience B) Experience
Desirable Desirable
A) Qualification A) Qualification
B) Experience B) Experience

5.1 Note: This column needs to be amplified to indicate Essential and Desirable Qualifications 
as mentioned in the RRs by the Administrative Ministry/Department/Office at the time 
of issue of circular and issue of advertisement in the Employment News.
5.2. In the case of Degree and Post Graduate Qualifications Elective/main subjects 

and subsidiary subjects may be indicated by the candidate.
6. Please state clearly whether in the light of entries

made by you above, you meet the requirement
of the post.

6.1 Note: Borrowing Departments are to provide their specific comments/views
confirming the relevant Essential Qualification/work experience possessed 
by the Candidate (as indicated in the Bio-data) with reference to the post 
applied.

7. Details of Employment in chronological order. Enclose a separate sheet duly
authenticated by your signature, if the space below is insufficient.

Office/ Post held on From To *Pay in the Matrix Nature of Duties
Institution regular basis against the post held (in detail) highlig-

on regular basis hting experience
required for the
post applied for

* Important: Pay granted under ACP/MACP are personal to the officer and therefore,
should not be mentioned. Only Pay held on regular basis to be mentioned. Details
of ACP/MACP with present Pay where such benefits have been drawn by the

Candidate, may be indicated as below:
Office/ Pay drawn under ACP/MACP From To
Institution Scheme

8. Nature of present employment i.e. Ad-hoc or
Temporary or Quasi-Permanent or Permanent

9. In case the present employment is held on
deputation/contract basis, please state-

a) The date  b) Period of c) Name of the d) Name of the post
of Initial appointment on parent office/organi- and Pay of the post
appointment deputation/contract zation to which the held in substantive

applicant belongs capacity in the
parent organisation

9.1 Note: In case of Officers already on deputation, the applications of such officer 
should be forwarded by the parent Cadre/Department alongwith Cadre Clearance,
Vigilance Clearance and Integrity Certificate.

9.2 Note: Information under Column 9 (c) & (d) above must be given in all cases 
where a person is holding a post on deputation outside the cadre/organization but 
still maintaining a lien in his parent cadre/organisation.
10. If any post held on deputation in the past by applicant,

date of return from the last deputation and other details.
11. Additional details about present employment:

Please state whether working under (indicate the
name of your employer against the relevant column)
a) Central Government
b) State Government
c) Autonomous Organization
d) Government Undertaking
e) Universities
f) Others

12. Please state whether you are working in the same Department
and are in the feeder grade or feeder to feeder grade.

13. Are you in Revised Scale of Pay? If yes, give the date from which
the revision took place and also indicate the pre-revised scale.

14. Total emoluments per month now drawn
Pay in the Matrix Level Total Emoluments

15. In case the applicant belongs to an organisation which is not following the Central
Government Pay Scales, the latest salary slip issued by the Organisation showing
the following details may be enclosed.
Basic Pay with Level in Pay Dearness Pay/Interim relief/ Total
Matrix other Allowances etc., (with Emoluments

break-up details)

16. A Additional information, if any, relevant to the post you applied
for in support of your suitability for the post.
(This among other things may provide information with regard to
(i) Additional academic qualifications (ii) Professional training and
(iii) Work experience over and above prescribed in the Vacancy
Circular/Advertisement).
(Note: Enclose a separate sheet, if the space is insufficient)
16. B Achievements:

The candidates are requested to indicate information with regard to:
i) Research publications and reports and special projects;
ii) Awards/Scholarships/Official Appreciation;
iii) Affiliation with the professional bodies/institutions/societies; and
iv) Patents registered in own name or achieved for the organization;
v) Any research/innovative measure involving official recognition;
(Note: Enclose a separate sheet, if the space is insufficient)

17. Please state whether you are applying for deputation (STC)/
Absorption/Re-employment Basis.
# (Officers under Central/ State Governments are only eligible
for “Absorption”. Candidates of Non-Government Organizations
are eligible only for Short-Term Contract).
# (The option of ‘STC/ ‘Absorption’/ ‘Re-employment’ are 
available only if the vacancy circular specially mentioned 
recruitment by “STC” or “Absorption” or “Re-employment”)

18. Whether belongs to SC/ST
I have carefully gone through the vacancy circular/advertisement and I am well aware
that the information furnished in the Curriculum Vitae duly supported by the documents
in respect of Essential Qualification/Work Experience submitted by me will also be
assessed by the Selection Committee at the time of selection for the post. The
information/details provided by me are correct and true to the best of my knowledge
and no material fact having a bearing on my selection has been suppressed/withheld.
Date __________ (Signature of the Candidate)

Address ________________

CERTIFICATION BY THE EMPLOYER/CADRE CONTROLLING AUTHORITY
The information/details provided in the above application by the applicant are true and
correct as per the facts available on records. He/she possesses educational and
experience mentioned in the advt. If selected, he/she will be relieved immediately.
2. Also certified that:
i) There is no vigilance or disciplinary case pending/contemplated against Shri/

Smt. _______________________
ii) His/her integrity is certified.
iii) His/Her CR Dossier in original is enclosed/photocopies of the ACRs for the last 5

years duly attested by an officer of the rank of Under Secretary of the Govt. of
India or above are enclosed.

iv) No major/Minor penalty has been imposed on him/her during the last 10 years Or
A list of major/minor penalties imposed on him/her during the last 10 years is
enclosed (as the case may be)

Countersigned
EN 52/23 (Employer/Cadre Controlling Authority with Seal)

No. A. 12025/1/2016-Admn
Government of India

Ministry of Water Resources, River Development &
Ganga Rejuvenation

https://t.me/Estore33_com https:/t.me/TheHindu_Zone_Official

https://t.me/Estore33_com

https://t.me/Estore33_com
https:/t.me/TheHindu_Zone_Official
http://www.estore33.com
https://t.me/Estore33_com


EN 52/17

www.employmentnews.gov.in 19Employment News 24 - 30 March 2018      RECRUITMENT

Govt. of India, Ministry of Textiles

Office of the D.C. 
for Handlooms

Weavers’, Service Centre 
I.I.H.T. Campus,  Khanapara, Guwahati-22

Notice Inviting Application
Advt. No. WSC/GAU/1/18 : Applications are invited from the eligible
officials for filling up of the following General Central Services Group
'B', Non-Gazetted Posts on Deputation Basis by the Director,
Weavers' Service Centre, IIHT Campus, Jahawar Nagar,
Khanapara, Guwahati-781022, a subordinate office under the
Office of the Development Commissioner for Handlooms.
SI. Name of Pay Band & Gr No.of Place of 
No. Post Pay/Pay Level Vacancy Posting
1. Assistant PB-2 + Grade Pay 04 At any WSC located

Rs.4200/-Pay at Guwahati/Kolkata/
Level-6 of Pay Bhubaneswar/Bhaga-
Matrix as per CCS lpur/Ranchi/Imphal/
(RP) Rules 2016 Agartala, Dimapur,

Aizwal or at IIHT, 
Guwahati/Fulia

For details about qualification, age limit, selection process and appli-
cation format etc., please log on DC (Handlooms)'s website :
www.handlooms.nic.in. Last date of receipt of application will be 45
days from the date of publication of the advertisement in
Employment News. (S. Bandyopadhyay)
EN 52/42 Director (EZ)

EN 52/44

EN 52/50
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No. 25/3/2018-R&R

Government of India

Ministry of
Power

Shram Shakti Bhavan
Rafi Marg, New Delhi

March 8, 2018 
VACANCY CIRCULAR

The Central Electricity
Regulatory Commission
(CERC) was set up by the
Government of India at New
Delhi under the provisions of the
erstwhile Electricity Regulatory
Commissions Act, 1998. CERC
is deemed to have been consti-
tuted under the corresponding
provisions of the Electricity Act,
2003 which repealed the
Electricity Regulatory
Commission Act, 1998. The
Commission consists of the
Chairperson and three other
Members (and also
Chairperson, Central Electricity
Authority as ex-officio Member
of the Commission). One post
of Member, CERC will fall
vacant on 9.10.2018. It is pro-
posed to fill up the anticipated
vacancy.
2. Appointment to the post of
Member, CERC will be gov-
erned by the relevant provision
of the Electricity Act and the
Central Electricity Regulatory
Commission (Sala-ries,
Allowances and other
Conditions of Service of
Chairperson and Members)
Rules, 2004 as amended from
time to time. As per the recom-
mendation of the Seventh
Central Pay Commission
accepted by the Government of
India, Member, CERC is pres-
ently entitled to a consolidated
pay of Rs.4.00 lakh per month
(without house and car).
3. Section 77(1) of the Electricity
Act, inter-alia, states that the
Chairperson and the Members
of the CERC shall be persons
having adequate knowledge of,
or experience in, or shown
capacity in, dealing with, prob-
lems relating to enginee-ring,
law, economics, comm-erce,
finance or management. The
above anticipated vacancy of
Member, CERC is required to be
filled up from persons having
qualifications and experience in
the field of commerce, law or
management, as prescribed in
section 77 (1) (a) of the
Electricity Act. In terms of sec-
tion 89 of the Act, the Member
shall hold office for a term of five
years from the date on which he/
she enters upon his/ her office
or till he/ she attains the age of
sixty-five years, whichever is
earlier. The candidate is
required to give a declaration
that he/she does not have any
financial or other interest, which
is likely to affect prejudicially
his/her function as Member,
CERC.
4. Relevant extracts of the
Electricity Act, 2003 relating to
the requirement of qualification,
experience, etc. for Member,
CERC and copy of Central
Electricity Regulatory Commi-
ssion (Salaries, Allowances and

other Conditions of Service of
Chairperson and Members)
Rules, 2004, Amendment Rules
of 2010 and format of the decla-
ration mentioned in para 3 are
available at Ministry's website
www.powermin.nic.in and the
website of DoPT www.persmin.
nic.in.
5. Applications/ nominations are
invited from suitable persons
having qualifications and experi-
ence in the field of commerce,

law or management as pre-
scribed in the Act for appoint-
ment as Member, CERC so as
to reach the Ministry within six
weeks from the date of publica-
tion of this circular in the
Employment News, addr-essed
to the Under Secretary (R & R),
Ministry of Power, 2nd Floor
(Room No.222-A), Shram Shakti
Bhavan, Rafi Marg, New Delhi -
110001. Serving officers under

EN 52/40

EN 52/8

Continued on page 21

National Institute of
Social Defence

(An Autonomous Body under the Ministry of
Social Justice & Empowerment)

Government of India
West Block -1, Wing - 7, R.K. Puram 

New Delhi -110066
ADMISSION NOTICE 

(One Year Post Graduation Diploma in Integrated Geriatric Care)
Applications are invited for the admission of One Year PG Diploma

in Integrated Geriatric Care at New Delhi, being organized by

National Institute of Social Defence (NISD) during 2018-19.

Eligibility Criterion:
a) Educational Qualification :

Essential: Bachelor's Degree in Social Sciences (Sociology,

Social Work/Social Welfare, Anthropology, Psychology)

Nursing, Home Science and related fields or equivalent from

a recognized University or Institute.

Desirable: Preference will be given to the candidates having

certificates/ experience(s)/training of working in Age Care

Organizations.

b) Age Limit: 21 to 35 years (in completed years as on date of

advertisement)

c) No. of seats & Selection Criterion: There are 25 seats and

selection will be made on the basis of percentage of marks

obtained in Bachelor's degree and interview.  

Application form is available on NISD website: www.nisd.gov.in
and can also be collected personally from Old Age Care Division,

NISD from 10:00 am to 5:00 pm on all working days. The last date

for submission of the filled in application form will be within 30 days
from the date of publication of the advertisement. The programme

will tentatively commence from 16th April 2018.

For more details may visit the website: www.nisd.gov.in or Office:

National Institute of Social Defence, West Block-1, Wing-7, R. K.

Puram, New Delhi - 110066. Ph : 011-26100056 / 011-26106883.
Director

davp 38110/11/0001/1718 EN 52/107

EN 52/91

DISCLAIMER DISCLAIMER 
The views expressed by the authors in the articles published
in the Employment News are their own. They do not neces-
sarily reflect the views of the government or the organisa-
tions they work for. The contents of the advertisements pub-
lished in the Employment News belong to the organisation or
their representatives. The Employment News is in no way
responsible for any liability arising out of the contents/text of
these advertisements.
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Government/ PSUs, etc. may
forward their applications
through proper channel.

(D. Chattopadhyay)
Under Secretary to the Govt. 
of India 

Tele fax: 23730265
Declaration

I ...................... hereby declare
that I do not have any financial
or other interest, which is likely
to affect prejudicially my func-
tion as Member, Central
Electricity Regulatory
Commission, in the event of my
selection.

(Signature of Applicant)
EN 52/34

Continued from page 20

EN 52/13

Indian Air Force  
Recruitment of LHV at Air
Force Station Kalaikunda

1. Applications are invited from eligible Indian Citizens for recruit-
ment for the post of Lady Health Visitor (LHV) at Air Force Station
Kalaikunda, West Midinapore- Dist, Kharagpur, West Bengal on reg-
ular basis:-

SI. Units/ Stations Lady Health Total 
No. Visitor (LHV)
1. Air Officer Commanding 01 (UR) 01 

Air Force Station, 
Kalaikunda 

2. The following are given eligible conditions as per the
recruitment rules (RRs):-
(a) Age limit  : 18 - 25 years (Departmental candidates 40
years for UR, 43 years for OBC and 45 years for SC/ST)
(b) Qualification - (i) 12th passed or equivalent from a recog-
nised Board/ University (ii) Successful completion of Auxilary
Nurse Midwife with Health Worker female training from any
recognised organisation or institute.
(c) Pay Scale - Level 5 in Pay matrix of 7th CPC.

3. Application must be submitted within 30 days from last
date of publication of this advertisement in 'Employment
News/Rozgar Samachar. Application received thereafter
will not be entertained. Further, IAF will not be responsible
for any kind of postal delay.

4. The crucial date for determining age limit is the last date of
receipt of the application.

5. Application is to be forwarded only through ordinary post.
Applications sent through Registered post/speed post/Courier
etc. will not be accepted and liable to be rejected. Application
as per format may be typed in English (Pasted with recent
passport size photograph duly attested by self) and duly filled
along with photocopies of the following supporting documents,
duly self attested may be sent to Air Officer Commanding,
Air Force Station Kalaikunda, West Midinapore-Dist,
Kharagpur, West Bengal, PIN-721303.

(i) Proof of date of birth (ii) Education qualification certificate (iii) Any
other documents as required (iv) One self addressed envelope with
stamp of Rs. 5/- (v) Original certificates are NOT (R) NOT to be
sent. IAF is not responsible for any loss of documents/certifi-
cates in due course.

APPLICATION FOR THE POST OF............in............Unit
1. Post applied for   .......................................
2. Name of the Candidate .............................

(in block letters) 
3. Father's name ...........................................
4. Date of Birth  ..............................................

(attach copy of Birth / Matriculation Certificate self attested) 
5. Age as on last date prescribed for receipt of application

Year....................Months........................ Days.....................
6. Address for correspondence:

House No./Street/Village.................... Post Office  .................
Distt.......................  State...................  Pin Code.....................
Contact/Mobile No  ................................

7. Permanent address:-
House No./Street/Village.................... Post Office  .................
Distt.......................  State...................  Pin Code.....................
Contact/Mobile No.  ................................

8. Caste: Gen/OBC/SC/ST ..........................(Attach Certificate in
case of SC/ST/OBC)

9. Education Qualification.............................. (attach education
certificate self attested)

10. Any other qualification/Experience   .......................................
11. Category for which applied: Gen (UR)/OBC/SC/ST/Ex-

Serviceman/Meritorious Sport person / Physically handi-
capped ...................  (Attach copy self attested)

12. Technical Training / Experience : ............................................
13. Domicile.........................................(attach self attested copy)
14. Whether registered with any Employment Exchange:- Yes /

No; If yes, mention registration No. and Name of employment
exchange ......................................  

15. I hereby certify that above particulars mentioned in the appli-
cation are correct and true to the best of my knowledge and
belief, if particulars mentioned by me are found false at any
stage than I shall be liable to be terminated without any notice.

Date : (Signature of Candidate) 
FOR OFFICIAL RECORD ONLY

1. Received on..........................
2. Accepted/ Rejected...........

Paste a self
attested photo-

graph 

3. Reason for rejection: Underage/ Overage/ incomplete docu-
ments/ Any other reason to be specified

4. Index No.  Date of test / skill / practical / physical test  ..............
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT CARD 

Post of .......................................
1. Name :...................................................
2. Father's Name   :...................................
3. Address for correspondence: (to be filled same as per

Column-6 of application form)
House No./Street/Village.................... Post Office  .................
Distt.......................  State...................  Pin Code.....................
Mobile No.  ................................

4. Index No................................Date & Time of test/skill/practical/
physical test ....................................................Venue of Written
Test/Skill/Practical/Physical test  .....................................

Signature of Controlling Officer 
davp 10801/11/0100/1718 EN 52/97

Paste self 
photograph 
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F. N. UIDAI/RO/RNC/Deputation/2017 
Government of India

Ministry of Electronics &
Information Technology (Meity)
Unique Identification Authority of India 

Regional Office, Ranchi.

The Authority invites applications in the prescribed form for the
following posts on deputation basis in UIDAI, Regional Office, Ranchi.
S.N. Name of the No. of Pay Scale

Post Vacancy
1. Deputy Director 1 (Patna) Pay Matrix Level-11 (pre-revised 

Pay Band III Rs. 15600-39100 
plus Grade Pay of Rs.6600/-)

2. Senior Accounts 1 (Ranchi) Pay Matrix Level-10 (pre-revised
Officer Pay Band III Rs. 15600-39100 

plus Grade Pay of Rs.5400/-)
3. Private 4 (1-Patna+ Pay Matrix Level-8 (pre-revised

Secretary 3-Ranchi) Pay Band II Rs. 9300-34800 plus
Grade Pay of Rs. 4800/-)

4. Stenographer 1 (Ranchi) Pay Matrix Level-6 (pre-revised
Pay Band I Rs. 5200-20200 plus 
Grade Pay of Rs. 4200/-)

For application form, eligibility criteria, desirable qualifications/
experience and related details please visit www.uidai.gov.in.
Applications completed in all respects along with CRs, vigilance
clearance etc. should be sent through proper channel to: The
Assistant Director General (Admin), UIDAI, Regional Office, 1st
Floor, JIADA Central Office Building, Namkum Industrial Area,
Lowadih, Ranchi -834010 within 45 days from the date of
publication of vacancy in the Employment News.
davp 54106/11/0016/1718                           Deputy Director (HR)

EN52/5

VACANCY CIRCULAR FOR VARIOUS POSTS IN REGIONAL
OFFICE RANCHI, ON DEPUTATION BASIS

EN 52/45 EN 52/93

Central Pollution Control Board
(Ministry of Environment, Forest & Climate Change)

'Parivesh Bhawan’, East Arjun Nagar
Shahdara, Delhi- 110032

Advt. No. 01/2018-Admin.(R)
Applications are invited for following posts in Central Pollution Control Board:-

Name of the Post/ Level in No. of Posts & Upper age limit not exceeding as on
the Pay Matrix Category last date, (relaxation as per rules)
DIRECT RECRUITMENT

01. Junior Laboratory 02 Posts (02-OBC- Between 18-25 years
Assistant: Ex Service Man) Relaxation as per rules
Level- 2 in Pay Matrix (Period of Military Services Plus 3 years +
(Rs. 19900-63,200/-) 03 years for OBC)

02. Driver (Ordinary Grade) 01 Post (UR) Between 18-25 years
Level- 2 in Pay Matrix
(Rs. 19900-63,200/-)

03. Assistant Director (OL) 01 Post (UR) Upto 35 years
Level-7 in Pay Matrix 
(Rs. 44,900-1,42,400/-)
(Pay Scale under revision)
DEPUTATION BASIS

04. Technical Supervisor 01 Post Upto 56 years
Level-6 in Pay Matrix
(Rs. 35,400-1,12,400/-)

Detailed advertisement with eligibility criteria & prescribed application form can be downloaded from our
website www.cpcb.nic.in. Candidate with required criteria may send their applications within 30 days
from date of publication of advertisement in the Employment News and 45 days for the applicant from
far-flung area to the Senior Administrative Officer, Administration, (Recruitment) Central Pollution
Control Board, "Parivesh Bhawan", East Arjun Nagar, Shahdara, Delhi-110032.

Senior Administrative Officer
davp 13113/11/0014/1718

EN 52/48
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Applications are invited for filling up the following posts direct recruitment through open
competition.

S.No. Name of post Pay Level Number of Post
1. T.V Producer Grade-1 Level 10 (Rs. 56,100 1 (1-UR)

to 1,77,500)
2. Assistant Engineer Level 10 (Rs. 56,100 5 (2-UR, 3-OBC)

Gr. “A” to 1,77,500)
3. T.V. Producer Grade-II Level 6 (Rs. 35,400 2 (1-UR, 1-OBC)

to 1,12,400)
4. Script Writer Level 6 (Rs. 35,400 1 (1-UR)

to 1,12,400) 
5. Cameraman Grade-II Level 6 (Rs. 35,400 3 (1-UR, 2-OBC)

to 1,12,400) 
6. Engineering Assistant Level 6 (Rs. 35,400 1 (1-OBC)

to 1,12,400) 
7. Audio Radio Producer Level 5 (Rs. 29,200 1 (1-UR)

Grade-Ill to 92,300)
8. T.V. Producer Grade-Ill Level 5 (Rs. 29,200 3 (1-SC, 2-OBC)

to 92,300) 
9. Field Investigator Level 5 (Rs. 29,200 1 (1-UR)

to 92,300) 
10. Technician Grade-I Level 5 (Rs. 29,200 7 (4-UR, 3-OBC)

to 92,300) 
11. Floor Assistant Level 4 (Rs. 25,500 2 (2-OBC)

to 81,100) 
12. Film Assistant Level 4 (Rs. 25,500 2 (1-UR, 1-OBC)

to 81,100) 
13. Photographer Grade-II Level 5 (Rs. 29,200 1 (1-UR)

to 92,300) 
14. Electrician Level 2 (Rs. 19,900 1 (1-UR)

to 63,200) 
15. Lightman Level 2 (Rs. 19,900 1 (1-OBC)

to 63,200) 
16. Dark Room Assistant Level 2 (Rs. 19,900 1 (1-UR)

to 63,200) 
17. Carpenter Level 2 (Rs. 19,900 1 (1-UR)

to 63,200) 
18. Film Joiner Level 2 (Rs. 19,900 1 (1-UR)

to 63,200)
Selected candidate can be posted at NCERT, New Delhi and its constituent units situated
at various states in India.
The applications should reach to the Under Secretary, CIET Chacha Nehru Bhavan,
NCERT New Delhi-16 within 21 days from the date of advertisement published in the
Employment News. Incomplete applications/application received after the last date will
not be entertained. For further queries, please contact the Under Secretary, CIET over
Telephone No. 011-26963311 during office hours.
In case of alteration/modification/deletion/additions/updation in the advertisement (if
any) the same will be uploaded in the NCERT website at - www.ncert.nic.in only.
The council reserves the right to increase/decrease the number of vacancies and not
to fill up any of the advertised positions.
Eligibility Criteria:
1 T.V Producer Grade-1
Educational and Qualification: 
other qualifications A. Essential:

Post Graduate degree in any discipline and a Post Graduate
Diploma or equivalent in any area of media/visual or
performing arts Or
Post Graduate degree in relevant area of media production and
management
Experience:-
05 years of relevant experience in reputed media organiza-
tions/Industry at the level of producer, active engagement
with production and dissemination of media.
B. Desirable
Experience of development and dissemination  of media/
Information &  Communication Technology (ICT) content
Experience of working with media/ICT for education and chil-  
dren at Institutes of National/International recognition having
awards or publications.

Age limit Not Exceeding 35 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the 
employees of the Council.

2. Assistant Engineer Gr.- "A"
Educational and Qualification: 
other qualifications A. Essential:

Bachelor Degree in Electronics and Communication

Engineering/Engineering with specialization in Informa-
tion Technology or equivalent. or
Masters Degree in Electronics and Communication, or  rele-
vant area of Information & Communication Technology (ICT).
Experience:
05 years of relevant experience in reputed organisations/
industry and active engagement with operations and main-
tenance of relevant hardware and software/TV & Radio
broadcast equipments.
B. Desirable:
1. Experience of leading teams in design, establishment,
operations and maintenance of media/Multimedia / Informa-
tion & Communication Technology (ICT) Hardware and
Software systems/TV & Radio broadcast equipments.
2. Experience of working with a wide range of operating
systems, relevant software applications and troubleshooting.
3. Post graduate diploma in any area of media or ICT hard-
ware/software.

Age limit Not exceeding 35 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

3. T.V. Producer Grade-II
Educational and A. Essential:
other qualifications Degree in Mass Communication from a recognised University or

Degree in any discipline with Diploma from recognised
Institute in Mass Communication or equivalent.
B. Experience:
3 years experience in Production film or TV Programme in
direction of film or TV Production.
C. Desirable:
Experience of development and dissemination of media/
Information & Communication Technology (ICT)  content
Experience of working with media/Information & Communi-
cation Technology (ICT) for children of at education National/
International recognition, having awards or publications.

Age limit Not exceeding 30 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council. 

4. Script Writer
Educational and A. Essential:
other qualifications 1. Post Graduate Degree in any discipline from a

recognized University.
2. 03 years experience of writing shooting scripts for
film/TV.
3. Research experience leading to scripts.
4. Proficiency in any one of the main languages mentioned in
the 8th schedule of the constitution.
B. Desirable:
Having experience of writing scripts for Educational Television
Programme.

Age limit Not exceeding 30 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

5. Cameraman Grade-II
Educational and A. Essential:
other qualifications 1. Graduate degree in any discipline.

2. Diploma from a recognized institute where the course
of studies includes the critical aspect of still photo-
graphy, videography, cinematography and film production
or performing arts. OR
1. Graduate degree in media production and manage-
ment/Mass Communication.
2. Diploma from a recognized Institute where the course
of studies includes the critical aspect of still photo-
graphy, videography, cinematography and film production
or performing arts.
B. Experience:
03 years practical experience in different aspects of motion
picture, photography such as shooting, developing, printing,
editing, dubbing, sound recording including 3 years experi-
ence of handling still and movie cameras/Video cameras
and film production/educational video programme production.

Age limit Not exceeding 30 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

Advertisement Year 2018/CIET
No. F. 3-9/2017-18/CIET(Estt.)/(Pt.)

NATIONAL COUNCIL OF EDUCATIONAL
RESEARCH AND TRAINING

Vacancy Notice

Continued
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6. Engineering Assistant:
Educational and A. Essential:
other qualifications Bachelor Degree in Engineering with specialization in Electro-

onics, Communication and Information Technology.
Experience:
5 years of relevant experience in reputed organisations/
industry; active engagement with operations and mainten-
ance of relevant hardware and software/TV & Radio broad-
cast equipments.
Desirable:
Experience of working with a wide range of Information &
Communication Technology (ICT) based media equipment in
production and broadcast environments.
Experience of working with a wide range of operating sys-
tems, relevant software applications and troubleshooting.

Age limit Not exceeding 30 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

7. Audio Radio Producer Grade-III
Educational and A. Essential:
other qualifications Graduate degree in any discipline with Diploma in Media

(Audio-Radio Production) or
Graduate degree in media production and management and
Mass Communication.
B. Experience:
One year of relevant experience in reputed media organi-
sations/industry at the Level of production assistant or higher;
active engagement with production and dissemination of
media/Radio.
C. Desirable:
1. Experience of Educational Audio Programme Production.
2. Experience of development and dissemination of media/
ICT content.
3. Experience of working with media/ICT for children and
education.
4. Having National/International recognisition, awards or publi-
cation.

Age Limit Not exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

8. TV Producer Grade-III
Educational and Qualification: 
other qualifications A. Essential:

1. Degree from a recognized University.
2. One year experience in research for writing TV scripts or
collection of data and materials for writing books. OR
Post Graduate Diploma in media or equivalent in relevant
area of Media.
B. Desirable:
1. Familiarity with TV equipment.
2. 2 years Experience of having worked as Production Asstt
on TV or having worked as TV continuity in film/TV production/
ICT.

Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

9. Field Investigator
Educational and Qualification:
other qualifications A. Essential:

1. A Masters Degree with high Second class in Education/
Psychology/Sociology/Humanities/Child Development/
Social work/Anthropology.
2. Good knowledge in language concerned (language to be
specified).
3. One year experience in teaching/research/working with
children.
B. Desirable:
1. Degree or diploma in teaching/research experience in area
of Educational Technology/ICT.
2. Experience of TV Script -writing/Story board development/
MuIti media Production/ Presentation.
3. Experience of collection and analysis of qualitative and
quantitative data.

Age limit Not exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

10. Technician Grade-I:
Educational and Qualification 
other qualifications A. Essential:

1. 10th/12th passed.
2. Three years Diploma with  Electronics,  Communication
or relevant area of Information Technology/Information
and Communication Technology/Radio/Television Comm-
unication.
B. Experience:
3 years of relevant experience in reputed media organisa-
tions/industry active engagement with operations and
maintenance of relevant hardware and software.

C. Desirable:
Experience of handling and troubleshooting relevant hard-
ware and software/TV & Radio equipments used for Audio/
Video Programme production.

Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

11. Floor Assistant:
Educational and Qualification: 
other qualifications Essential :

1. 10+2 or equivalent from a recognised Institute.
2. One year experience in handling erection of sets in stage,
Film or T.V. or Diploma from a recognised Institutions in stage
Craft.
3. Good physique and capacity for undertaking strenuous
physical work.

Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

12. Film Assistant:
Educational and Qualification: 
other qualifications Essential:

1. Graduation in any discipline from a recognized University.
2. Diploma/Certificate in a related media field from a recogni-
sed institute.
Experience:
At least one year experience of video editing/Computer
Graphic/Computer animation.

Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

13. Photographer Grade-II:
Educational and Qualification:
other qualifications A. Essential:

12th Pass
Diploma in Photography/Videography/Cinematography
from a recognized Institute with 03 (three) years experi-
ence as photographer/videographer/movie/TV Camera-
man.
B. Desirable:
Experience of photography with double exposure, super
imposition/preparation of video clips.

Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

14. Electrician:
Educational and Qualification
other qualifications 1. ITI Certificate or equivalent in the trade of Electrician or

Wireman.
2. At least two years experience in electrical installation
and wiring.

Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

15. Lightman:
Educational and Qualification:
other qualifications A. Essential

1. 10th/12th pass from any recognised board/Institution.
2. 3 years experience of lighting in stage, Film and Television.
B. Desirable:
Experience of handling studio lights/portable lights/lights on
outdoor location while shooting.

Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt, Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

16. Dark Room Assistant:
Educational and Qualification: 
other qualifications A. Essential:

1. 10th/12th pass from any recognised Board/Institution.
2. ITI in relevant trade with one year experience of handling
audio equipments/Video equipments/Film Equipments and
editing.
B. Desirable:
Experience of working as an Assistant/helper in Media
Institutions.

Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt, Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with instruction or orders issued by 
the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the  
employees of the Council.

17. Carpenter:
Educational and Qualification: 
other qualifications A. Essential:

1. 10th pass from any recognised Board/Institution.
2. ITI in relevant trade with 3 years experience.
B. Desirable:
Experience of construction of sets for stage/film/TV Progra-
mme. Continued on page 26
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Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

18. Film Joiner:
Educational and Qualification: 
other qualifications A. Essential:

1. 10th/12th pass from any recognised Board/Institution.
2. ITI in any trade with one year experience of handling audio
equipments/Video equipments and Editing/Film Equipments.
B. Desirable:
Experience of working as an Assistant/helper in Media Insti-
tutions.

Age limit Not Exceeding 27 years. Relaxable for Govt. Servant's upto
5 years in accordance with the instructions or orders issued
by the Central Government, 10 years age relaxation for the
employees of the Council.

GENERAL INFORMATION:
1. Candidates who fulfill the prescribed qualifications, experience and other

eligibility conditions as on 1.2.2018 should apply giving full particulars (Bio-data)
as per proforma enclosed supported by self attested copies of all the relevant
certificates and documents and a passport size photograph to be affixed on the
application.

2. Candidates who are already working in Government service should send their
application through proper channel. Applications not found as per prescribed
proforma and not supported by duly attested documents or attested photograph
will not be entertained.

3. Candidates who do not fulfill the prescribed qualifications and other eligibility
conditions need not apply.

4. Fee of Rs. 200/- (Rupees Two hundered only) has to be paid in form of DD/IPO
payble in favour of "Secretary, NCERT at New Delhi".

5. The fee once paid will not be refunded or re-adjusted under any circumstances.
6. No fee is required for SC/ST & PwD category and Women candidates.
7. The age limit shown against all items is the normal age limit and the age is

relaxable for SC/ST candidates upto 5 years and upto 3 years for OBC
candidates in respect of vacancies reserved for them. SC/ST/OBC Candidates
have to produce a caste certificate in prescribed proforma.

8. A candidate will be eligible to get the benefit of community reservation only in
case the particular caste to which the candidates belong is included in the list of
reserved communities issued by the Central Government. If a candidate indicates
in his/her application form that he/she belongs to SC/ST/OBC/General category
but subsequently writes to the Council to change his/her category, such request
shall not be entertained by the Council.

9. MINIMUM ESSENTIAL QUALIFICATIONS: All applicants must fulfil the essential
requirements for the post and other conditions stipulated in the advertisement.
They are advised to satisfy themselves before applying that they possess at least
the essential qualifications laid down for various posts. No enquiry asking for
advice as to eligibility will be entertained.

10. The prescribed essential qualifications are the minimum and the mere
possession of the same does not entitle candidates to be called for Written
Examination/Interview.

11. After scrutiny of the applications, the candidates who are found eligible for
consideration will be called for Written Test/Technical Aptitude Test/ Practical
Aptitude Test as the case may be.

12. The candidates who qualify in the prescribed tests will be empanelled in the order
of merit for appointment.

13. No TA/DA will be payable to the candidates for appearing in the Exami-
nation/Interview.

14. The Director, NCERT reserves the right to cancel/restrict/enlarge/modify/alter the
recruitment process, if needed, without issuing any notice. In case of any
disputes, Legal Jurisdiction will be Delhi.

15. The applications in a sealed cover indicating Application for the post of
"________________" thereon should reach within 21 days from the date of
advertisement to Under Secretary,' CIET, NCERT, Sri Aurobindo Marg, New
Delhi -110016.

16. Applications received after due date will not be entertained.
17. The detailed Scheme of examination/syllabus, as the case may be, shall be

placed on website of NCERT http://ncert.nic.in before issuing call letter.
Under Secretary,

ClET, NCERT
New Delhi
Dated:

Proforma for Application:
APPLICATION FOR THE POST OF.........

1. Name: ____________________________________________
2. Father's Name: _____________________________________
3. Date of Birth _______________________________________
4. Age as on 1.2.2018: ______Years ______ Months _____ Days
5. Correspondence Address:-

___________________________________________________
________________________________________________________________
Contact No.:  _____________________________________________________
E.mail: __________________________________________________________

6. Whether belongs to GEN/SC/ST/OBC/PH/Ex-Serviceman __________________
(Proof shall be enclosed in case of SC/ST/OBC/PH/Ex-Serviceman)

7. Educational/Techniccal Qualification from 10th class onwards and experience in
relevant field (for technical qualifications) (Attach copies of educational
qualification and certificate in support of experience as shown below from the
respective organizations).

8. Details of experience in the relevant field: Duration of Experience in years &
months and period (from- to     )
1.
2.
3.
4.
5.

9. Whether working in Government/Semi-Government/Public Sector
Undertaking/ Nationalised Bank: (If Yes, fill in the following) YES/NO
(i) Post held _____________________________
(ii) Department _____________________________
(iii) Duration ______________ Years ____________  months
(iv) Period : From ______________ to ____________
(v) Level in Pay Matrix and Basic Pay: ________________________________

Certified that all the information furnished above by me is correct to the best of my
knowledge.
Place: Signature of the Candidate
Date:

Name of the Candidate
EN 52/7

Affix latest
passport size

photo duly
self attested
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National Council for Cement
and Building Materials

(Under Administrative Control of Ministry of Commerce & Industry,  
Govt. of India)  34 km stone, Delhi-Mathura Road (NH-2), Ballabgarh-121004,

Haryana, India.
Ph : +91-129-4192222/ 2246174    Fax : +91-129-2246175/2242100

Requires Civil Engineers (On Contract Basis) for Projects at Bhubaneswar & Rourkela, ODISHA
SI. Post Qualification Experience Age Consolidated No. of
No. Limit Salary (Rs.) Posts 
1. Sr. Project B.E / B.Tech Minimum 15 years 62 65,000/- to 1

Manager (Civil Engg.) experience in the areas like conc- Years 90,000/- pm
(Civil) [ preferably rete technology, quality control,

M.E. / M Tech quality audit/assurance in con-
(Civil Engg.)] struction of major civil enginee-

ring projects; testing of cement,
aggregate, concrete, steel 
and other building materials;
construction practices, etc. 
(Engineers retired from reputed 
organization, having relevant 
Experience may also apply)

2. Sr. Project B.E/B.Tech 5-10 Years 40 55,000/- to 1
Engineer (Civil Engg.) experience in the areas like Years 65000/-. pm
(Civil) [ preferably concrete technology, quality

M.E./M Tech control, quality audit/assurance in
(Civil Engg.)] construction of "major civil engine-

ering projects; testing of cement,
aggregate, concrete, steel and
other building materials, const-
ruction practices, etc.

NOTE : 

1. Preference will be given to candidates having meritorious
academic qualifications and relevant experience.

2. Salary will be fixed depending upon qualification and experience
of the candidates.

3. Age Relaxation is applicable as per Government of India Rules to
candidates belonging to 'SC', 'ST, 'OBC' categories.

4. Canvassing in any form and/or bringing influence political or
otherwise will be treated as a disqualification for the post.

5. Interim queries will not be entertained.

6. Council reserves the right to raise minimum standards and /or
relax age, experience in deserving cases. Number of Post may
increase or decrease according to the need of the council.

7. Interested candidates may apply on the above address by
sending their application (along with recent passport size
photograph ) to the Director General within 15 days of publication
of this advertisement, on plain paper giving all details related to
name, age, qualification, experience, postal address (contact
number) etc. along with self attested copies of all mark
sheet/degrees and experience details. Application received through
email and fax will not be considered.

8. For detailed information, please visit our website
http://www.ncbindia.com. All corrigendum, addendum,
amendmends, clarifications etc. to this advertisement will be posted
on this website only.

DIRECTOR GENERAL

davp 05207/11/0023/1718 EN 52/77
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Applications are invited for the post of Director, National Council for Promotion
of Urdu Language (NCPUL), New Delhi, an autonomous body fully funded by the
Ministry of Human Resource Development, Government of India from persons
possessing qualifications and experience mentioned below in the prescribed
proforma published in the Employment News/Rozgar Samachar. The Application
Form, can also be downloaded from http://mhrd.gov.in/.
Pay Scale :
Pay Band PB-4, Rs. 37,400-67,000/- plus Grade Pay of Rs. 8,700/- (pre-revised).
Qualifications & Experience : 
Essential : 
(1) Master’s Degree in Urdu Language/Linguistics/Literature with minimum 55%
marks with Persian as a Subject at Degree level from a recognised University or
equivalent. (2) Research/Literary work in Urdu as evidenced by published work
of Standing (evidence to be furnished).
Desirable :
(1) Ph.D. in Urdu OR Ph.D. in Linguistics (2) Good knowledge of one or more
Indian languages in addition to Urdu (3) Knowledge of modern principles and
techniques of lexicography.
Administrative Experience :
For persons to be recruited on deputation
(a) for Non-Ph.D. Candidates: Ten (10) years in group ‘A’ level post OR Five (5)
years in a post carrying pre-revised pay scale of Rs. 12,000-16,500/-.
(b) For Ph.D. Candidates: Five (5) years in group ‘A’ level post.
For persons to be recruited on contract basis.
Possessing experience as detailed above and drawing comparable emoluments.
Explanation : “Administrative Experience” means experience as head of an
academic institution (including the Head of Department in a College or University)
OR Experience in administrative capacity in a Government, local body or
autonomous organization, preferably connected with the area of
education/languages.
Method of Recruitment
By transfer or deputation from among the officers under the Central/State
Government/Universities/autonomous bodies holding analogous posts in the pre-
revised pay scale of Rs. 14300-18300/- or working in the scale of pay of Rs.
12000-16500/-.
Tenure of appointment on deputation or contract
Not exceeding three (3) years. The term may be extended at the discretion of the
Central Government upto a maximum of five (5) years or until the incumbent
attains superannuation prescribed for Central Government employees,
whichever is earlier.
Age Limit:
Not exceeding 57 years on the first January of the year in which the vacancy is
advertised.
Last Date :
Duly filled up applications complete in all respects and forwarded through Proper
Channel by the concerned University/College/Department, etc. should reach Shri
V. Sripathi, Uder Secretary (L-III), Department of Higher Education, Ministry
of Human Resource Development, Room No. 206, C-Wing, Shastri Bhawan,
New Delhi-110001 within 30 days from the date of publication of the
advertisement for the above post in the Employment News/Rozgar Samachar.
Note-1: The applicants who are in Central Govt./State Govt.
Service/Autonomous Bodies/Union Territories or other Govt. bodies should
submit their application through Proper Channel alongwith Integrity Certificate
and a certificate to the effect that no disciplinary proceedings are pending or
contemplated against the Officer. ACRs of the last five (5) years may also be
forwarded alongwith the application.

PROFORMA OF APPLICATION
Application for the pos of Director, National Council for Promotion of

Urdu Language (NCPUL), New Delhi
1. Name and Address (in Block Letters) ____________________
2. Date of Birth (in Christian era): __________________________
3. Date of retirement under Central/State Government Rules: ____
4. Educational Qualifications : ____________________________
5. Whether Educational and other qualifications required for the post are

satisfied. (If any qualification has been treated as equivalent to the one
prescribed in the Rules, state the authority for the same)

Qualifications/ Qualifications/Experience 
Experience possessed by the officer
Required

Essential (1)
(2)
(3)

National Council for Promotion of Urdu Language
(An autonomous body fully funded by the Ministry of Human Resource Development, Government of India)

FC-33/9, Institutional Area, Jasola, New Delhi-110025

ADVERTISEMENT FOR THE POST OF DIRECTOR
Desirable (1)

(2)

(3)

6. Please state clearly whether in the light of entries made by you above, you
meet the requirement of the post: ________________________________

7. Details of Employment, in chronological order. Enclose a separate sheet duly
authenticated by your signature.

Office/ Post From To Scale of Pay Nature of
Institution held and Basic Pay duties (in

detail)

8. Nature of present employment i.e. Ad-hoc or Temporary or Quasi-Permanent
or Permanent.

9. In case the present employment is held on deputation/contract basis, please
state
a) The date of initial appointment
b) Period of appointment on deputation/contract
c) Name of the parent office/Organization to which you belong.

10. Additional details about present employment.
Please state whether working under (indicate the name of your employer
against the relevant column)
Central Government:
State Government:
Autonomous Organization
Government Undertaking:
Universities:
Others:

11. Please state whether you are working in the same Department.
12. Are you in Revised Scale of Pay? If yes, give the date from which the revision

took place and also indicate the pre-revised scale.
13. Total emoluments per month now drawn.
14. Additional information, if any, which you would like to mention in support of

your suitability for the post. (This among other things may provide information
with regard to (i) additional academic qualifications (ii) professional training
and (iii) work experience over and above prescribed in the Vacancy Circular/
Advertisement)
(Note: Enclose a separate sheet, if the space is insufficient).

15. Whether belongs to SC/ST.
16. Remarks: (The candidates may indicate information with regard to (i)

Research publications and reports and special projects (ii)
Awards/Scholarship/Official Appreciation (iii) Affiliation with the professional
Bodies/institutions/societies and (iv) any other information.
(NOTE:- Enclose a separate sheet if the space is insufficient)

I have carefully gone through the vacancy circular/advertisement and I am well
aware that the Curriculum Vitae duly supported by documents submitted by me will
also be assessed by the Selection Committee at the time of selection for the post.

Signature of the Candidate
Address : ______________

Date: _________

FORWARDING NOTE BY THE EMPLOYER

It is certified that :-
1. Information given in the above proforma is correct as per the service records

of the applicant.
2. The applicant is clear from vigilance angle.
3. The Integrity of the applicant is beyond doubt.
4. That no major/minor penalty has been imposed on the applicant during the

last ten (10) years.
5. The cadre controlling authority of the applicant has given clearance to enable

him/her apply for the post.
6. Attested copies of the last five (5) years of the applicant’s Annual Confidential

Report/Annual Performance Appraisal Report has been enclosed while
forwarding this application.

Countersigned by the authorized signatory on behalf of the employer
__________________________

Place: ______________________ (Seal of the authorized signatory)
Date: _______________________
davp 21321/11/0001/1718 EN 52/2
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Pension Fund Regulatory and

Development Authority
B-14/A, Chhatrapati Shivaji Bhawan, Qutab Institutional

Area Katwaria Sarai, New Delhi - 110016
VACANCY NOTIFICATION

Applications are invited for recruitment to the post of Chief
Executive Officer, National Pension System Trust (NPST)
on Contract/ Deputation basis. The complete details of

eligibility criteria, mode of selection, emoluments and

application form etc. are available on PFRDA's website

www.pfrda.org.in, NPS Trust's website

www.npstrust.org.in and also on the website of National

Career Service www.ncs.gov.in. The appointment for the

post on contract basis will be for a period of five years,

extendable thereafter subject to satisfactory review or on

deputation basis for an initial period of three years extendable

by further two years subject to satisfactory review. The last

date of receipt of application is 2nd April, 2018.

Deputy General Manager
(HR)

davp 15102/11/0030/1718 EN 52/49

NO : A-35020/03/2017-ISTM
Government of India

Institute of Secretariat
Training & Management

(AN ISO 9001 : 2015 Institution)
Department of Personnel & Training

Administrative Block, JNU Campus (Old) 
Olof Palme Marg, New Delhi-110067

Telephone-011-26102597; Fax- 011-26104183

Subject : -Filling up of three faculty posts of Deputy
Director (Management Services) and one faculty post of
Assistant Director (English Shorthand and Typing) on
deputation in the Institute of Secretariat Training &
Management, New Delhi.
Applications are invited for filling up of following faculty Posts
by appointment on deputation basis from amongst suitable
and eligible officers working under Central Government :

1. Deputy Director (Management Services) - 03
2. Assistant Director (English Shorthand and Typing)

- 01
2. The officer selected shall be entitled to ‘training allowance’
on her/his basic pay drawn at such rate as may be
determined by the Government of India from time to time [ At
present training allowance is 12%].
3. Details of the eligibility conditions for appointment to the
vacant posts in ISTM and the prescribed Proforma in which
applications can be sent may be downloaded from this
Department's website : www.persmin.nic.in as well as from
the ISTM website : www.istm.nic.in.
4. Applications of only such officers/candidates will be
considered which are routed through proper channel and are
accompanied by (i) Bio-data (in quadruplicate) in the
proforma given in Annexure-ll (A) & (B) and (ii) Cadre
Clearance.
5. The applications of suitable and eligible officers who can
be spared immediately in the event of selection may be sent
to Shri Syed Imran Ahmed, Under Secretary (Training)
Training Division, Block-IV, 3rd Floor, JNU (OLD)
Campus, New Delhi-110067 within a period of 60 days from
the date of publication of this advertisement in the
Employment News.

(R. Gayathri)
Deputy Director (Admn)

EN 52/70 Tel: 26102597

EN 52/76

92 Base Hospital, Pin : 901218, C/O 56 APO 
Recruitment Notice : Corrigendum

1. Refer the advertisement published on the subject matter in this News Paper on 24 Jun 2017.
2. The following amendment may please be incorporated in para 1  of  the above mentioned

advertisement.
For

Name of Total No. of Pay Matrix Reservation Age Limit
the Post the Posts Category in Yrs

CSBO (GD-II) One (01) 21700-69100/- UR 18-25 Yrs

Ward Sahayika One (01) 18000-56900/- OBC 18-28 Yrs

Safaiwali Three (03) 18000-56900/- SC-01, UR-01 18-30 Yrs, 18-25 Yrs
OBC-01 18-28Yrs

Read

Name of Total No. of Pay Matrix Reservation Age Limit
the Post the Posts Category in Yrs

CSBO (GD-II) One (01) 21700-69100/- SC 18-30 Yrs

Ward Sahayika One (01) 18000-56900/- ST 18-30 Yrs

Safaiwali Three (03) 18000-56900/- SC-01, ST-01 18-30 Yrs, 18-30 Yrs
OBC-01 18-28Yrs

3. Fresh applications alongwith supporting documents duly attested by gazetted officer are invited from
the desirous candidates for above mentioned categories as per re-drawn reservation category as
mentioned against each. Format of application form and other terms and conditions have already
been given in advertisement mentioned at para 1 above.

4. Applications which have already been received in response to the advertisement dated 24 Jun 2017,
will be considered for recruitment if found to be in accordance with the amendment and such
candidates need not apply again.

5. Last date for receipt of applications as per amendment will be 30 days from the date of publication
of this advertisement, including the date of publication.

6. Cut-off date for calculation of age is 23 Jul 2017 (Last date for receipt of applications as per
advertisement dated 24 Jun 2017). Commandant

92 Base Hospital
davp 10622/11/0071/1718 EN 52/79

https://t.me/Estore33_com https:/t.me/TheHindu_Zone_Official

https://t.me/Estore33_com

https://t.me/Estore33_com
https:/t.me/TheHindu_Zone_Official
http://www.estore33.com
https://t.me/Estore33_com


www.employmentnews.gov.in 29Employment News 24 - 30 March 2018      ADMISSION

EN 52/65

No.51/3/2014-Estt-XIII/185
Government of India 

Central Water
Commission 

Establishment XIII Section
Room No.324(S), Sewa Bhawan
R.K.Puram, New Delhi-110066

Dated: 07.03.2018
CORRIGENDUM

"It is hereby informed to all the candidates, who have applied for the

post of Assistant Cameraman (Publication) Central Water

Commission vide Employment Advertisement   EN.No7/66/2015

dated 16-22 May, 2015, is hereby cancelled due to administrative

reasons."
(Rajesh Sharma) 
Under Secretary 

EN 52/72 Tele: 29583317

No. A-12024/1/2017-Ad-1 

Cabinet Secretariat 
Rashtrapati Bhawan, New Delhi

28th February, 2018

CIRCULAR

Subject: Filling up two Posts of Programmer in Level- 8 of Pay

Matrix (PB-2 with GP of Rs. 4800/- in 6 CPC Scale) in Cabinet

Secretariat on deputation basis.

In continuation of this Secretariat's circular published in

Employment New dated 16-22 December, 2017, it has been

decided to extend the last date for receipt of application from the

eligible and willing officers in the prescribed proforma annexed to

the above circular to 23rd April, 2018.

2. Application received otherwise than through proper channel

and/or without the requisite documents and/or after the due date i.e

23.04.2018 will not be entertained. Further, the candidates who

apply for the post will not be allowed to withdraw their candidature

subsequently.

(K.J. Sibichan) 

EN 52/43 Under Secretary to the Government of India

EN 52/61

Government of India 

Serious Fraud Investigation Office
2nd Floor, Pt. Deendayal Antyodaya Bhawan, B3 Wing 

CGO Complex, Lodhi Road, New Delhi-110003
No. 02/01/2017-Admn.SFIO/Vol.II

Notice For Extension of Last Date
The closing date for receipt of applications in respect of following vacancies published in Employment
News dated 30 Dec 2017-5 Jan 2018 to be filled on deputation (ISTC) basis in SFIO has further been
extended up to 30.04.2018 :
Sr. Category of Post Tentative Scale of Pay(Pre-revised) Tentative Place
No. No. of Post of Posting
1. Senior Assistant Director 2 Rs. 15600-39100/- Plus GP Delhi/ Mumbai/

(Taxation) Rs. 5400/- Kolkata/ Chennai/
2. Senior Assistant Director 3 Rs. 15600-39100/- Plus GP Hyderabad

(Capital Market) Rs. 5400/-
3. Office Superintendent 1 Rs. 9300-34800/- Plus GP

Rs. 4600/-
All other terms and conditions, would remain the same. The particulars of posts, eligiblity conditions etc.
may be obtained from the website www.sfio.nic.in.

Joint Director (Admn)
davp 07102/11/0019/1718 EN 52/101

Advt. No.-Admin/Rectt. Cell/AIIMS/Bhopal/2018/04 Dated: 05/03/2018

Notification
ENGAGEMENT OF RETIRED FACULTY FOR THE POST OF PROFESSOR (CONSULTANT) AND
ADDITIONAL PROFESSOR (CONSULTANT) ON CONTRACTUAL BASIS AT AIIMS BHOPAL
Applications are invited from eligible Indian Nationals, who are retired Faculty upto age of 70 years from

Institutes of National Importance (INIs) and Government Medical College (GMCs) at the level of Professor

and Additional Professor for engagement to the post of Professor (Consultant) and Additional Professor

(Consultant), on contract basis, in various department of AIlMS Bhopal.

Last Date of Application: 30 days from the date of advertisement in Employment News/Rojgar

Samachar.

Application form submission with detailed procedure for applying to the above mentioned posts with

relevant documents can be downloaded from Institute's Website; www.aiimsbhopal.edu.in.
davp 17170/11/0037/1718 Director  
EN 52/105 AIIMS Bhopal

•Áπ‹ ÷Ê⁄UÃËÿ •ÊÿÈÁfl¸ôÊÊŸ ‚¥SÕÊŸ ÷Ê¬Ê‹
ALL INDIA INSTITUTE OF MEDICAL SCIENCES BHOPAL

(An Autonomous Institute under Ministry of Health & Family Welfare,
Government of India) Saket Nagar, 

Bhopal (M.P)-462020, www.aiimsbhopal.edu.in
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EN 52/63

EN 52/83

Defence
Research &

Development
Organisation

(DRDO)
Defence Terrain Research

Laboratory (DTRL)
Ministry of Defence 

Metcalfe House
Delhi-110054

Walk-in-interview
Date : 11th April 2018
Applications are invited for the
following 02 (two) Posts in DST
sponsored project titled
“Creation of Spectral Library
using reflective and emissive
spectra for delineating
terrain features and
associated materials in
Hyperspectral domain”
Post : Junior Research
Fellow (JRF)
Salary : As per DST Scale 
Duration : For 02 (two) years
or till project ends; which-so-
ever is ealier
Minimum Qualification 
For JRF Positions :
M.Tech. or M.Sc. (with GATE
or NET) in Geology/Remote
Sensing/Geo- in format ics /
Environmental Science/
Computer Science and
Working Experience in ENVI
Software, IDL/ Matlab or similar
other packages.
* For M.Sc degree holders,
GATE or NET qualification is
mandatory for JRF positions.
Age Limit : The upper age limit
for JRF shall be 28 years. Age
relaxation : upper age limit is
relaxable up to 5 years for
SC/ST/OBC/Women and
physically handicapped
candidates.
Interested Candidates may
appear for a Walk-in Interview
on 11th April 2018 at 1000
Hrs at DTRL, Metcalfe House,
Delhi. Candidates will be
admitted from 1000 to 1130 Hrs
only. No candidate will be
allowed to appear in interview if
he/she arrives beyond 1130
hrs. They are required to
produce all certificates/
testimonials/Community certifi-
cate/ valid GATE/NET score
card etc. in original along with
their bio-data at the time of
walk-in interview. They must
also bring a set of self attested
copies of all their
testimonials/certificates and an
ID proof (Voter's ID / Aadhar
card/ Pan card/ Driving
License) along with one
recent colour passport size
photograph at the time of
interview.
No TA/DA will be paid for
attending the interview.
JRF will be encouraged to
pursue their Ph.D after
joining the post.
Note : Interested and eligible
candidates are encouraged
to send their CV to
jitendar@hotmail.com on or
before 02nd April 2018.
davp 10301/11/0392/1718

EN 52/78

Dr. Babasaheb Ambedkar 
Marathwada University

Aurangabad- 431004 (Maharashtra State)
Ph. Nos. 0240-2403399-400, (Off.) 2403104 

E-mail: vc@bamu.ac.in. registrar@bamu.ac.in
Website: www.bamu.ac.in

Appointment of
Director of Innovation, Incubation and Linkages

Dr. Babasaheb Ambedkar Marathwada University, Aurangabad is

"A" Grade University re-accredited by NAAC, Bangalore in 2013.

The jurisdiction of the University is spread over Aurangabad, Jalna,

Beed & Osmanabad districts of  Maharashtra. Online applications
for the Post of Director of Innovation, Incubation and Linkages
are invited from eligible Indian national in the prescribed application
form. Detailed information about Qualifications, Experiences &
submission of application etc. is made available on University
Website:- www.bamu.ac.in.
i) Last date for online submission of forms: 31-03-2018.
ii) Last date for receipt of application forms (Hard Copy)

in the University office : 07-04-2018.
Advt No. Estt/RO/08/2018
Date :- 07-03-2018
EN 52/69 Registrar
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EN 52/62

EN 52/29

EN 52/73

IMPORTANT NOTICE
We take utmost care in publishing result of the various competitive examinations
conducted by the UPSC, SSC, Railway Recruitment Boards etc. Candidates are
however advised to check with official notification/gazette. Employment News will
not be responsible for any printing error going inadvertently.
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No. 25-114/2018-MPH

Andaman and Nicobar Administration
Secretariat
Port Blair dated the 6th March, 2018 

Vacancy Notice
Applications are invited from the eligible Specialist in Non-Teaching for the various
Group 'A' Gazetted post purely on short-term contract basis in Andaman and Nicobar
Health Department under Andaman and Nicobar Administration, Port Blair, as per the
terms and conditions mentioned below:-

SI. Name of the Post Number of Vacant Post
No.

1. i) Medical Specialist 07

ii) Surgical Specialist 07

iii) ENT Specialist 01

iv) Anaesthetist 07

v) Gynaecologist 09

vi) Paediatrician 03

vii) Pathologist 01

viii) Ophthalmologist 01

ix) Radiologist 01

x) Dermatologist 01

2. Remuneration Consolidated salary Rs. 1,10,000/- per month for the 
first year and Rs.1,20,000/- per month for the second year.

3. Age Limit Not exceeding 45 years

4. Educational & Qualifications/ Experience required
Other Essential:
Qualifications (i) A recognized MBBS Degree qualification included in

the First or Second Schedule or Part II of the Third
Schedule (other than Licentiate qualification) to the
Indian Medical Council Act, 1956.
Holders of Educational qualification included in Part II
of the Third Schedule should also fulfill the condition
stipulated in sub-section (3) of Section 13 of the Indian
Medical Council Act, 1956 (102 of 1956).
(ii) Post Graduate Degree/ Diploma in the concerned
Speciality mentioned in Section-A or Section-B in
Schedule V or equivalent.
(iii) 3 (three) years experience in concerned Speciality
after obtaining the Post Graduate degree or 5 (five)
years experience after obtaining the Post Graduate
degree or 5 (five) years experience after obtaining the
Post Graduate Diploma.
Note: For the Physician (Chest and Respiratory Disease)
3 years experience in Respiratory Disease and
Respiratory Laboratory is required.

Standard Terms and Conditions
The appointment is purely on contract basis for a period of two years or till the regular
incumbent joins, whichever is earlier, with effect from the date of joining. Thereafter, the
contract will lapse automatically. The appointment can also be terminated at any time,
on either side, by giving one month's notice or by paying one month's salary, without
assigning any reason or failure to complete three months to the satisfaction of the
competent authority.
1. The consolidated remuneration will be Rs. 1,10,000/- per month for the first year

and Rs. 1,20,000/- Per month for the second year. A copy of order No.
A.12026/4/2017-CHS.III dated 31st August, 2017 is enclosed.

2. The appointee shall perform the duties assigned to him/her. The competent
authority reserves the right to assign any duty as and when required. No
extra/additional allowance will be admissible in case of such assignment.

3. The appointee shall not be entitled to any benefit like Provident Fund, Pension,
Gratuity, Medical Attendance Treatment, Seniority, Promotion etc. or any other

Continued on page 33

Shri Diwan Krishna Kishore S.D. Adarsh
Sanskrit College, Ambala Cantt -133001

Haryana
(Recognized as Adarsh Sanskrit Mahavidyalaya under the Scheme for financial

assistance to Institutions recognized as Adarsh Sanskrit
Mahavidyalayas/Adarsh Shodha Sansthans being implemented by the

Rashtriya Sanskrit Sansthan (Deemed University) under Ministry of Human
Resource Development, Government of India)

Applications are invited for the following positions :
I. Assistant Professor of Vyakarana - 01   (One Post)
Pay Scale : Pay Band of Rs. 15600 - 39100/- with AGP of Rs. 6000
Qualifications : Essential :
1. Good academic record with at least 55% of the marks or, an equivalent grade of

B in a 7 point scale with latter grades O,A,B,C,D,E & F at Acharya/ Master's
degree level, in the concerned/relevant subject from an Indian University or, an
equivalent degree from an accredited foreign university.

2. Besides fulfilling the above mentioned qualifications, candidates should have
cleared the National Eligibility Test (NET) conducted by the UGC, CSIR or similar
test accredited by the UGC like SLET/SET.

3. Notwithstanding anything contained in aforementioned clauses (1) and (2) of
clause 4.4.1 of the UGC Regulations, 2010, candidates, who are, or have been
awarded a Ph.D Degree in accordance with the University Grants Commission
(Minimum Standards and Procedure for Award of Ph.D. Degree) Regulations,
2009, shall be exempted from the requirement of the minimum eligibility
conditions of NET/SLET/SET for recruitment and appointment of Assistant
Professor or equivalent positions in Universities.

4. NET/SLET/SET shall also not be required for such Masters Programmes in
disciplines for which NET/SLET/SET is not included.

Note:
* (i) Notwithstanding the conditions prescribed for exemption of NET/SLET/SET as at
(iii) above, it must be ensured that the candidates seeking exemption from
NET/SLET/SET must have acquired Ph.D. degree in the relevant subject as per the
University Grants Commission (Minimum Standards and Procedure for Award of Ph.D.
Degree) Regulations, 2009 failing which their candidature shall not be considered.
Further, the candidates must have cleared the eligibility test such as NET/SLET/SET
in the concerned subject only without which their candidature shall not be considered.
* (ii) The candidates while submitting the applications as per the afore-mentioned
qualification requirements must have the Post-Graduate Degree in the relevant
subject preferably with Sanskrit language as the medium of instruction. In addition to
the above, they must have the teaching/research experience in the relevant subject as
per the advertisement.
* (iii) In addition to the essential qualification, the competent authority may prescribe
any other qualification as desirable qualification.
Desirable :
1. Research degree in concerned subject or published research work of outstanding

value.
2. Ability of guiding research students.
3. Knowledge of Hindi & English.
4. Knowledge of principles of Language teaching.
5. Teaching experience in concerned subject.
II. ASSISTANT - 01 (One Post)
Pay Scale : Pay Band of Rs. 9300-34800/- with AGP of Rs. 4200/-
Qualifications : Essential:
1. Graduate from a Recognized University.
2. Five years experience as UDC or equivalent in the grade of Rs. 5200-20200 + GP

Rs. 2400/- of any Central/State Govt./ University/ private Institutions/ Public
Sector Undertakings and other Central or State Autonomous Bodies or holding
equivalent position in the reputed private institution/ Corporate/bank with annual
turnover of Rs. 500 crores.

3. Typing speed of 30 w.p.m. in English or 25 w.p.m in Hindi or bilingual on computer
4. Proficiency in Computer operation, noting and drafting
* The total emoluments (including all allowances)/ CTC of the employees working in
the private/public sector organizatuions shall be taken into account while deciding the
equivalency of their pay/status with the afore-mentioned status/pay scales of of a
government servant
Desirable :
1. Knowledge of Sanskrit
Note - Application containing details of academic qualifications and experience
supported by attested photocopies of original documents along with a fee of Rs.500/-
in the form of a crossed Demand Draft drawn in favour of The Principal, Shri Diwan
Krishna Kishore S.D. Adarsh Sanskrit College, Ambala Cantt-133001, Haryana
should reach the undersigned within 30 days from the date advertisement in the
Newspaper. (Ordinary post or by hand will not be accepted)
General Conditions :-
1. The latest passport size photograph of the candidate should be affixed to the

application form.
2. The Adarsh Sanskrit Mahavidyalaya reserves the right to fill up or not to fill up any

post without assigning any reason.
3. Candidates must send three sets of their publications if any, along with the

application form.
4. Candidates already in service must submit their applications through proper

channel. They may, however send a advance copy, but if called for interview they
must produce a ‘No objection certificate’ from their employer.

5. Candidates will have to present themselves for the interview at their own
expenses.

6. Candidates should bring all certificates in original at the time of interview.
7. The appointees will be the employees of Shri Diwan Krishna Kishore S.D.- Adarsh

Sanskrit College, Ambala Cantt-133001, Haryana and not of Govt. of India or of
Rashtriya Sanskrit Sansthan. They will be governed by the provisions of the
scheme as applicable from time to time.

8. Post your applications to the "The Chairman (Management Committee), Shri
Diwan Krishna Kishore S.D. Adarsh Sanskrit College, Ambala Cantt -
133001, Haryana.

9. Canvassing in any form will be a disqualification.
Chairman

(Management Committee)
Shri Diwan Krishna Kishore

S.D. Adarsh Sanskrit College
EN 52/10 Ambala cantt-133001, Haryana
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Continued from page 32

benefits available to the Government servants, appointed on regular basis.
4. Non-practicing allowance will not be admissible.
5. The appointee will not be granted any claim or right for regular appointment to

any post under Central Health Service.
6. Only consolidated salary will be admissible. No Dearness Allowance and other

allowances as are admissible to the Central Government servants shall be
admissible.

7. The appointee shall be on the whole time appointment of the Medical Institution
and shall not accept any other appointment, paid or otherwise and shall not
engage himself in a private practice of any kind during the period of contract.

8. The appointment to the said  post will  be subject to the  Medical  Fitness from
the competent Medical Board for which he/she will be sent to the designated
Medical Authority by the concerned Institute/Hospital before joining the post.

9. The appointee is not entitled to any TA for joining the appointment. :
10. Other conditions of service will be governed by relevant rules and orders issued

from time to time.
11. They will have to work in any part of Andaman & Nicobar Islands.
12. If any declaration given or information furnished by him/her proves to be false or

if he/she is found to have willfully suppressed any material, information, he/she
will be liable for removal from service and also such other action as the
Government may deem necessary.

The applications in the prescribed Proforma duly supported with all documents should
be submitted to Principal Secretary (Health), A&N Administration, Secretariat,-
Port Blair -744101 within 30 days from the date of publication of the Advertisement.

(Meera Mallick)
Assistant Secretary (Health)

To 
The Principal Secretary (Health)
A & N Administration
Secretariat 
Port Blair-744101

EN 52/82

EN 52/92

FORMAT FOR APPLICATION FOR THE POST OF SPECIALIST IN NON-
TEACHING FOR THE POST OF............................................ PURELY ON SHORT

TERM CONTRACT BASIS
UNDER ANDAMAN & NICOBAR HEALTH DEPARTMENT

1. Name of Candidates (in BLOCK LETTER)
2. Father's/Husband's Name
3. Male/Female
4. Date of Birth (in Christian Era)/Age as on ............
5. Nationality
6. Name of Speciality
7. Educational Qualifications
8. In   case  the  present  employment  is  held  on contract

basis, please state:-
(a) The date of initial appointment
(b) Period of appointment on deputation/ contract
(c) Name of the parent office/organization to which
you belong.

9. Additional information, if any, which you would like to 
mention in support of your suitability for the post. 
(This among other things may provide information 
with regard to (i) additional academic qualifications
(ii) professional training and (iii) work experience over
and above prescribed in the vacancy circular/advertisement).
(Note: Enclose a separate sheet, if the space is insufficient).

10. Present Postal Address
11. Permanent Residential Address
12. Contact Number
13. Any other relevant information

DECLARATION
I do hereby declare that the information given above is true, complete and correct to
the best of my knowledge and belief. I understand that in the event of any information
being false or incorrect or ineligibility being detected before or after the test/ interview/
appointment, my candidature/ appointment is liable to be cancelled/terminated.
Date: ................................. Name & Signature of the Candidate

Address ……………………………......
EN 52/71 ……………………………………………

Government of India

Vansadhara Water Disputes
Tribunal

(Ministry of Water Resources, River Development & Ganga Rejuvenation)
5th Floor, Mohan Singh Place, Baba Kharak Singh Marg 

New Delhi - 110 001
Website: www.wrmin.nic.in

CORRIGENDUM
In continuation to the Tribunal's vacancies as published in
Employment News 6-12, January 2018, the last date of receipt of
applications in respect of the post of Executive Engineer only is
extended till 23rd April, 2018.
2. There is no change in the rest of the advertisement. The details of
the post is available on the Ministry's website www.wrmin.nic.in.
EN52/38 REGISTRAR
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Recruitment

ICAR-Krishi Vigyan Kendra, CENDECT
Kamatchipuram, Theni District, Tamil Nadu-625520

Applications are invited to the following vacant post under Plan Scheme of Krishi Vigyan Kendra, Theni
(NGO) and Positions Co-terminus with the scheme.

Sl. Vacant Post/Pay Scale No. of Essential Edu. Qualifications

No. Position
1. Senior Scientist and Head 01 Doctoral degree in Agriculture subject including

Rs. 37,400-67,000 + RGP relevant basic sciences with 8 years experience.
Rs. 9,000/-

Last date of receipt of application : Apply within 21 days from the date of advertisement published in
Employment News.

For details please log on our website : www.cendect.org.in/kvk.html
Apply with Bio-Data, attested Certificate Copies, Two reference and Passport Size photo to

The Chairman, ICAR Krishi Vigyan Kendra, CENDECT
Kamatchipuram, Theni District, Tamilnadu-625520

EN 52/99 EN 52/54

F.No. 1/2(2)2018-NCW(A)-LO

National Commission for Women
Plot No. 21, Jasola Institutional Area, New Delhi- 110025

Sub: Filling up of vacant Posts in the National Commission for Women by
deputation on 'Foreign service terms' basis.

The National Commission for Women has been established as a statutory
Commission for dealing with matters relating to constitutional and legal safeguards
provided for women, to review the existing legislations and suggest amendments
thereto, to look into the complaints involving deprivation of the rights of women and
monitor proper implementation of all legislations enacted to protect the rights of
women to enable them to achieve equality in all spheres of life and equal participation
in the developmental process. The Commission invites applications to fill up following
vacant posts on deputation (on foreign service terms) basis :
SI. Post No. of Eligibility Criteria/Qualification/Experience
No. Post
1. Senior Research 01 Officers (i) HoIding analogous posts on regular basis 

Officer Level-11 (One) in the parent Cadre or Department; or
Pre-revised scale (ii) with three years'service in the pre-revised scale
of pay Rs. 15600- of pay of Rs.15,600-39,100/- + Grade Pay 6000/- or
39100+ 6600/- (GP) (iii) with five years’ service in the pre-revised Scale

of Pay of Rs.15,600-39,100/- + Grade Pay 5400/- or
(iv) with six years' service in the grade rendered
after appointment thereto on a regular basis

in the pre-revised scale of pay of Rs. 9300-34800/-
+ GP Rs. 4800/-
Possessing Post Graduate degree in Sociology/
MSW/Women’s studies from a recognised University;
and Experience  of at  least  five  years  in   conduct
ing/facilitating research studies/teaching.

2. Law Officer 01 Officers holding analogous post on regular basis OR
Level-11 (One) With five years of regular service in the pre-revised 
Pre-revised Pay Scale Rs.9300-34800/- + 5400/- GP) or equivalent 
scale of pay OR With six years of regular service in post in the
Rs.15600- pre-revised scale of Rs.9300-34800/-+ 4800/- GP)
39100/- + or equivalent. OR
6600/- (GP) With seven years of regular service  in the pre-revised 

scale of Rs.9300-34800/- + 4600 GP) or equivalent.
qualifications and experience :-
Degree in Law (LLB/BL) of a recognized University 
or equivalent.
5 years experience in handling service and other
legal matters including those in the Courts or
Tribunals.

3. Section Officer 01 (i) Holding analogous Post on regular basis in the
Level-08 (One) parent Cadre or Department ; or
(Rs.9300- (ii) With three years' service in the Scale of Pay of
34800/- + 4800/- Rs.9,300-34,800/- + 4600/- GP
GP (PB-2) (iii) With six years' service in the grade rendered

after appointment thereto on a regular basis in the
Scale of Pay of Rs.9,300-34,800/- + 4200/- GP or
equivalent in the parent cadre or department.
Possessing Bachelor's degree from recognized
University or Institute or equivalent ; and
two years experience in matters relating to adminis-
tration.

4. Research 04 Officers (i) holding analogous posts on regular basis 
Assistant (Four) in the parent Cadre or Department : or
Level-6 (ii) With eight years regular service in posts in the
Pre-revised scale pre-revised Scale of Pay of Rs.5,200-20,200/- with
of Pay of Rs.2800 GP or equivalent in the parent cadre or
Rs.9,300- department.
34,800/- + GP Possessing Master degree in Sociology/MSW of a
Rs.4200/- recognized University or equivalent.

Possessing sound knowledge.
5. Assistant 03 Officers (i) holding analogous Post on regular basis

Level-6 (Three) in the parent Cadre or Department ; or
Pre-revised scale (ii) With eight years’ service  in the  grade rendered
of pay of after appointment thereto on a regular basis in the
Rs. 9300- Scale of Pay of Rs. 5,200-20,200/- + 2800/- GP or
34800/- + equivalent in the parent cadre or Department, or
Rs.4200/-(GP) With ten years’ service in the grade rendered after

SI. Post No. of Eligibility Criteria/Qualification/Experience
No. Post

appointment thereto on a regular basis in the scale 
of pay of Rs.5,200-20,200/- + 2400/- GP or 
equivalent in the parent cadre or department
(b) (i) Possessing bachelor's degree from recognized
University or Institute or equivalent ; and (ii) five
years experience in administrative/Legal matters.

6. Junior Hindi 1 Central Government officers holding analogous post
Translator (one) on regular basis or officers having 5 years regular
Level-6 service in a post. In the old Scale of Pay of Rs.3050-
Pre-revised scale 4590/- (Revised pay scale 5200-20200/- + 1900/- 
of pay of Grade Pay or equivalent.
Rs.9.300- Essential Educational qualification :- Masters 
34800/- + degree of a recognized University or equivalent in 
Rs.4200/- (GP) Hindi with English as subject at the degree level or

Masters degree of a recognized University or 
equivalent in English with Hindi as subject at 
the degree level or Master's degree of recognized
University or equivalent in any subject with Hindi 
medium and English as a subject at the degree 
level or Master's degree of a recognised University 
or equivalent in any subject with English medium 
and Hindi as a subject at degree level and one 
year translation course from a recognized Institute.

7. Personal 01 Officer holding analogous posts or having six year's
Assistant (One) regular service as Steno Grade ‘D’ in the Scale of pay
Level-6 of Rs. 5200-20200/-+ Rs. 2400/- GP (Old Scale
Pre-revised scale Rs.4000-100-6000/-) 2) Intermediate or equivalent
of pay of Should possess a speed of 100 words per minute in
Rs.9300-34,800/- English Shorthand and 40 words per minute in English
+ Rs.4200/- (GP) Typewriting.

8. Stenographer 04 (i) Officer holding analogous posts on regular basis
Grade ‘D’ (Four) in the parent cadre/ Department; or (ii) with five years’
Level-4 service in the grade rendered after appointment
Pre-revised scale thereto on a regular basis in the Scale of Pay of
of pay of Rs.5200-20200/- + GP 1900/- or equivalent in the
Rs.5200-20200/- parent cadre or Department ; or
+ Rs.2400/- (GP) (b) and have passed skill test on computer with

10 minutes having a speed of 80 w.p.m. in
stenography and transcription 50 minutes English/65
minutes Hindi.

9. Jr. Accountant 02 (i) Officer holding analogous posts on regular basis
Level-4 (Two) or (ii) Lower Division Clerk with 5 years of service in
Pre-revised scale the grade with experience in cash. Having knowledge
of pay Rs.5200- of Tally.
20200/- + 
2400/- GP

The last date for receipt of applications is 30 days from the date of publication in the
Employment News. For further details please visit our website www.ncw.nic.in.

(R.C. Ahuja)
EN 52/87 Under Secretary

IMPORTANT
NOTICE

We take utmost care
in publishing result of
the various competi-
tive examinations
conducted by the
UPSC, SSC,
Railway Recruitment
Boards etc.
Candidates are
however advised to
check with official
notification/gazette.
Employment News
will not be
responsible for any
printing error going
inadvertently.
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Sub: Environment- Filling up of the post of Senior Environmental Engineer Group 'A'
Gazetted (Non-Ministerial) in the Department of Science, Technology & Environment,
Puducherry.
It is proposed to fill up the post of Senior Environmental Engineer (Group 'A' Gazetted-
Non-Ministerial) in the Department of Science, Technology & Environment, Puducherry
in Level-11 in the Pay Matrix on deputation basis (including short-term contract) from
among the eligible Officers serving under the Central Government/ State
Governments/Union Territories/Recognized Research Institutions/Universities/ Public
Sector Undertakings/Semi-Government/Statutory or Autonomous Organisations:-
A) (i) Holding analogous posts on regular basis in the parent cadre/Department; or
(ii) with 5 years service rendered after appointment thereto on regular basis in   posts
in Level-10 in the Pay Matrix or equivalent; or
(iii) with 6 years service rendered after appointment thereto on regular basis in posts in
Level-8 in the Pay Matrix or equivalent; or
(iv) with 7 years service rendered after appointment thereto on a regular basis in posts
in Level-7 in the Pay Matrix or equivalent, and
(B) possessing the Educational qualifications and experience as below:
Essential:
i) Masters Degree in Environmental Engineering/Technology or Chemical Engineering
from a recognized University with 2 years experience in Environmental Quality
Management and Pollution Control activities. (or)
Bachelors Degree in Environmental Engineering/Technology or Chemical Engineering
from a recognized University with 5 years of experience in Environmental Quality
Management and Pollution Control activities.
[The Departmental Environmental Engineer in Level-7, in the Pay Matrix with 7 years
regular service rendered in the grade after appointment on a regular basis and having
the educational qualifications as above will also be considered along with the outsiders.
If the departmental candidate is selected for appointment to the post, the post shall be
treated as having been filled by promotion].
Note 1: Period of deputation (ISTC) including the period of deputation (ISTC) in
another ex-cadre post held immediately preceding this appointment in the same or
some other organization or departments of the Central/State/Union Territory
Governments shall ordinarily not exceed 4 years. The maximum age limit for
appointment by deputation shall be not exceeding 56 years as on the closing date of
receipt of applications.
Note 2: The Departmental Officer in the feeder grade who are in direct line of
Promotion will not be eligible for consideration for appointment on deputation. Similarly,
deputationists shall not be eligible for consideration for appointment by promotion.
2. The Officer selected for deputation to the post will be governed by the terms and
conditions laid down in Government of India, Department of Personnel and Training
O.M. 2/12/87-Estt (Part II) dt. 29.4.88 as amended from time to time.
3. It is requested that this Notification may be given wide publicity by circulating it to all
Offices/Organizations etc. and the applications (in duplicate) in the given proformae
alongwith the complete and Annual Performance Appraisal Report (APAR) Dossiers for
last five years of the eligible Officers who could be spared in the event of their selection,
may be sent to this Department within 60 days from the date of publication of this
Notification. Besides, the following information/documents may also be sent alongwith
application:i) A statement showing minor or major penalties imposed, if any, in respect of the

Official
ii) Cadre Clearance Certificate

iii) Integrity Certificate
iv) Vigilance Clearance
Applications received after the last date or without the Confidential Reports Dossiers or
otherwise found incomplete will not be considered. While forwarding the applications,
it may be verified and certified that the particulars furnished by the Officers are correct
and that no disciplinary case is either pending or contemplated against the Officer. The
Applicants may please be informed that they will not be permitted to withdraw their
applications at a later stage.

(S. TAMILARASI) 
UNDER SECRETARY TO GOVT. (ENVIRONMENT)

Bio-Data/Curriculum Vitae Proforma
1. Name and Address

(in Block Letters)
2. Date of Birth (in Christian Era)
3. i) Date of entry into service

ii) Date of retirement under Central/State
Government Rules

4. Educational Qualifications
5. Whether educational and other qualifi-  

cations required for the post are satisfied.
(if any qualification has been treated
as equivalent to the one prescribed in
the rules, state the authority for the same)

Qualifications/Experience required as Qualifications/experience  
mentioned in the advertisement/ possessed by the Officer
vacancy circular
Essential Essential
Masters Degree in Environmental Engineering/Tech- A) Qualification
nology or Chemical Engineering from a recognized
University with 2 years experience in Environmental
Quality Management and Pollution Control activities (or)
Bachelors Degree in Environmental Engineering/Tech- B) Experience
nology or Chemical Engineering from a recognized
University with 5 years of experience in Environmental
Quality Management and Pollution Control activities.

Note: In the case of Degree and Post Graduate Qualifications Elective/main subjects 
and subsidiary subjects may be indicated by the candidate.
6. Please state clearly whether in the light of entries made
by you above, you meet the requisite Essential Qualifications
and work experience of the post.
6.1 Note: Borrowing Departments are to provide their specific comments/views
confirming the relevant Essential Qualification/Work Experience possessed by 
the Candidate (as indicated in the Bio-data) with reference to the post applied.
7. Details of Employment in chronological order. Enclose a separate sheet duly
authenticated by your signature, if the space below is insufficient.

Office/ Post held on From To *Level in the Nature of Duties
Institution regular basis Pay Matrix (in detail) high-

of the post lighting experience
held on required for the
regular basis post applied for

* Important : Pay Band and Grade Pay granted under ACP/ MACP are personal to the
officer and therefore, should not be mentioned. Only Pay Band and Grade Pay/Pay Scale
of the post held on regular basis to be mentioned. Details of ACP/ MACP with present
Pay Band and Grade Pay (Level in Pay Matrix) where such benefits have been drawn
by the Candidate, may be indicated as below:-

Office/Institution Pay, Pay Band and Grade Pay From To
drawn under ACP/MACP Scheme
(Level in Pay Matrix)

8. Nature of present employment i.e. Ad-hoc or Temporary
or Quasi- Permanent or Permanent.
9. In case the present employment is held on
deputation/ contract basis, please state:-
a) The date of b) Period  of c) Name of the d) Name of the

initial appointment appointment parent Office/ post and Pay of the
on deputation/ Organization to post held in
contract which the substantive

applicant belongs capacity in the
parent organization

9.1 Note: In case of Officers already on deputation, the applications of such officers 
should be forwarded by the parent cadre/ department alongwith Cadre Clearance, 
Vigilance Clearance and Integrity Certificate. 
9.2 Note: Information under column 9 (c) & (d) above must be given in all cases where
a person is holding a post on deputation outside the cadre/organization but still 
maintaining a lien in his parent cadre/organization.
10. If any post held on deputation in the past by the applicant,
date of return from the last deputation and other details.

11. Additional details about present employment:
Please state whether working under (indicate the name of your
employer against the relevant column)

a) Central Government, b) State Government
c) Autonomous Organization, d) Government Undertaking
e) Universities, f) Others

12. Please state whether you are working in the same department
and are in the feeder grade or feeder to feeder grade.
13. Are you in Revised Scale of Pay? If  yes, give the date
from which the revision took place and also indicate
the pre-revised scale.

14. Total emoluments per month now drawn
Basic Pay in Pay Matrix Total Emoluments
15. In case the applicant belongs to an Organization which is not following the Central
Government Pay Scales, the latest salary slip issued by the Organization showing the
following details may be enclosed.
Basic Pay with Level in Pay Dearness Pay/interim Total Emoluments
Matrix and rate of increment relief/other Allowances etc.

(with break-up details)

16.A. Additional information, if any, relevant to the post you
applied for in support of your suitability for the post.
This among other things may provide information with
regard to (i) additional academic qualifications (ii) professional
training and (iii) work experience over and above prescribed
in the Vacancy Circular/Advertisement).
(Note: Enclose a separate sheet, if the space is insufficient).
16.B  Achievements:
The candidates are  requested to  indicate information with regard to :-
(i) Research publications and reports and special projects
(ii) Awards/Scholarships/Official Appreciation.
(iii) Affiliation with the professional bodies/institutions/societies and;
(iv) Patents  registered in own name or achieved for the Organization
(v) Any  research/innovative measure involving official
recognition. (vi) Any other information.
(Note:  Enclose a separate sheet if the space is insufficient).
17. Please state whether you are applying for deputation (ISTC)/
Absorption/Re-employment basis#.
(Officers under Central/State Governments are only eligible for
"Absorption". Candidates of Non-Government Organizations are
eligible only for Short-Term Contract)

No. 3-2/Envt./2018 

Government of Puducherry

Chief Secretariat (Environment)
Puducherry 

dt. 11.01.2018 
NOTIFICATION
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¬ÎâflË ¬˝áÊÊ‹Ë ÁflôÊÊŸ ‚¥ªΔUŸ (ß¸U∞‚∞‚•Ê)
EARTH SYSTEM SCIENCE ORGANIZATION (ESSO)

¬ÎâflË ÁflôÊÊŸ ◊¥òÊÊ‹ÿ(∞◊•Êß¸∞‚), ÷Ê⁄UÃ ‚⁄U∑§Ê⁄U
Ministry of Earth Sciences (MoES), Government  of India

÷Ê⁄UÃËÿ ©UcáÊŒ‡ÊËÿ ◊ÊÒ‚◊ ÁflôÊÊŸ ‚¥SÕÊŸ
Indian Institute of Tropical Meteorology

«UÊÚ. „UÊ◊Ë ÷Ê÷Ê ◊Êª¸, ¬Ê·ÊáÊ, ¬ÈáÊ - 411008
Dr. Homi Bhabha Road, Pashan, Pune 411008

(ÁflôÊÊ¬Ÿ ‚¥. ∑§ÊÁ◊¸∑§/02/2018) / (Advertisement No. PER/02/2018)
•ŸÈÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ ‚„UÿÊªËflÎÁàÃÿÊ° ∞fl¥ •ŸÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ •äÿÃÊflÎÁàÃÿÊ°

RESEARCH ASSOCIATESHIPS AND RESEARCH FELLOWSHIPS
÷Ê⁄UÃËÿ ©UcáÊŒ‡ÊËÿ ◊ÊÒ‚◊ ÁflôÊÊŸ ‚¥SÕÊŸ (•Êß¸U•Êß¸U≈UË∞◊), ¬ÈáÊ ß¸U∞‚∞‚•Ê/∞◊•Êß¸U∞‚ ∑§ •¥Ãª¸Ã SflÊÿàÃ
•ŸÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ ‚¥ªΔUŸ „ÒU ¡Ê ◊ÊÒ‚◊ ∞fl¥ ¡‹flÊÿÈ ÁflôÊÊŸ ∑§ ÁflÁ÷ãŸ ¬„U‹È•Ê¥ ◊¥ •àÿÊäÊÈÁŸ∑§ •ŸÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ ◊¥ ¬ÍáÊ¸Ã— ‚◊Á¬¸Ã
„ÒU.
The Indian Institute of Tropical Meteorology (IITM), Pune is an autonomous research
organization under ESSO/MoES, fully devoted to cutting edge research in various
aspects of weather and climate science.
ßU‚ ‚¥SÕÊŸ ◊¥ ∑˝§◊‡Ê— •ŸÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ ‚„UÿÊªË ∞fl¥ •ŸÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ •äÿÃÊ ∑§ M§¬ ◊¥ •ÊflŒŸ •Ê◊¥ÁòÊÃ Á∑§∞ ¡Ê ⁄U„U „Ò¥U.
Applications are invited for selection of Research Associates and Research Fellows
at this Institute respectively:
1) ÷Ê©U◊ÊÒÁfl‚¥ •ŸÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ ‚„UÿÊªË— 12 ¬Œ , flÎÁàÃ∑§Ê — L§.36,000/- ¬˝ÁÃ ◊Ê„U ÃÕÊ SflË∑§Êÿ¸ ◊∑§ÊŸ Á∑§⁄UÊÿÊ
÷àÃÊ, •flÁäÊ— ∞∑§ fl·¸ (ÁŸc¬ÊŒŸ ∑§ •ÊäÊÊ⁄U ¬⁄U ∞∑§ fl·¸ ∑§ Á‹∞ ’…∏UÊß¸U ¡Ê ‚∑§ÃË „ÒU)
1) IITM Research Associates: 12 positions; Stipend: Rs.36,000/-- p.m. plus
admissible HRA; Tenure: One Year
(Extendable by another one year depending on performance)
2)÷Ê©U◊ÊÒÁfl‚¥ •ŸÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ •äÿÃÊ — 10 •äÿÃÊflÎÁûÊÿÊ°; flÎÁàÃ∑§Ê — L§. 25,000/- ¬˝ÁÃ ◊Ê„U ÃÕÊ SflË∑§Êÿ¸
◊∑§ÊŸ Á∑§⁄UÊÿÊ ÷àÃÊ, •flÁäÊ— øÊ⁄U fl·¸
2) IITM Research Fellows: 10 Fellowships;
Stipend: Rs.25,000/- p.m. plus admissible HRA; Tenure: Four Years
¡Ê ¿UÊòÊ ‚Ë∞‚•Êß¸U•Ê⁄U/ÿÍ¡Ë‚Ë/«UË∞‚≈UË ‚ •äÿÃÊflÎÁàÃ ∑§Ê ‹Ê÷ ‹ŸÊ øÊ„UÃ „Ò¥U •ÊÒ⁄U •Êß¸U•Êß¸U≈UË∞◊ ◊¥ ¡•Ê⁄U∞»§
∑§ M§¬ ◊¥ ∑§Êÿ¸ ∑§⁄UŸÊ øÊ„UÃ „Ò¥U, ©Uã„¥U ÷Ë •ÊflŒŸ ∑§⁄UŸ „UÃÈ ¬˝Êà‚ÊÁ„UÃ Á∑§ÿÊ ¡Ê ⁄U„UÊ „ÒU. ∞‚ ©Uê◊ËŒflÊ⁄U •¬ŸË
•äÿÃÊflÎÁàÃ ∑§Ë fl⁄UËÿÃÊ (•Êß¸U•Êß¸U≈UË∞◊ •ŸÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ flÎÁàÃ ÿÊ ‚Ë∞‚•Êß¸U•Ê⁄U/ ÿÍ¡Ë‚Ë/«UË∞‚≈UË •äÿÃÊflÎÁàÃ ∑§Ê
‹Ê÷ ‹¥ª) ∑§ ’Ê⁄‘U ◊¥ •ÊÚŸ‹ÊßUŸ •ÊflŒŸ ◊¥ ©UÀ‹π ∑§⁄U ‚∑§Ã „Ò¥U.
Students who would like to avail fellowship from CSIR/UGC/DST and work as JRF in
IITM are also encouraged to apply. Such candidates need to specify in the online
application form about their preference of fellowship (whether availing IITM Research
Fellowship or CSIR/UGC/DST fellowship)
•Êfl‡ÿ∑§ •„¸UÃÊ•Ê¥ •ÊÁŒ ∑§Ë ÁflSÃÎÃ ¡ÊŸ∑§Ê⁄UË •Êß¸U•Êß¸U≈UË∞◊ ∑§Ë fl’‚ÊßU≈U: www.tropmet.res.
in/Careers ¬⁄U ©¬‹éäÊ „ÒU.
More details on essential qualifications etc. are available at IITM website:
www.tropmet.res.in/Careers.
ßUë¿ÈU∑§ •èÿÕË¸ ‚ËflË ∑§ ‚ÊÕ •¬Ÿ •ÊflŒŸ •ÊÚŸ‹ÊßUŸ:http://www.tropmet.res.in/Careers.        
¬⁄U ÁŒŸÊ¥∑§ 31 ◊Êø¸ 2018 Ã∑§ ¬˝SÃÈÃ ∑§⁄U ‚∑§Ã „Ò¥U. •ÊflŒŸ ∑§Ë „UÊ«¸U ∑§ÊÚ¬Ë SflË∑§Ê⁄U Ÿ„UË¥ ∑§Ë ¡Ê∞ªË.
Aspiring candidates may submit their applications along with their CV online : http://
www.tropmet.res. in/Careers by 31st March 2018. Hard copy of the application will
not be accepted.
EN 52/33 ÁŸŒ‡Ê∑§, •Êß¸U•Êß¸U≈UË∞◊/ Director, IITM

Delhi Transport Infrastructure 
Development Corporation Limited 

(An Enterprise of GNCT of Delhi)
Notice 

Calling application for filling up various posts on deputation

DTIDC, an enterprise of Govt. of NCT of Delhi, having it office at 2nd Floor, Maharana
Pratap ISBT, Kashmere Gate, Delhi invites applications from the eligible and
interested employees of Govt. organizations for the following posts on deputation
basis for an initial period of one year:-
Administrative Posts
1. Dy.General Manager - -02 Post 

(PB-3, Rs.15,600-39100/- with Grade Pay Rs. 7600/- (pre-revised)
(Level-12 as per 7th CPC)

2. Office Assistant/UDC - -05 Post 
(PB-2, Rs. 9300-34800/- with Grade Pay Rs.  2400/- (pre-revised)
(Level- 4 as per 7th CPC)

Technical Posts
1. AGM (Planning)/Assistant Director - 01 Post

(PB-3, Rs. 15,600-39100/- with Grade Pay Rs. 6600/- (pre-revised)
(Level-11 as per 7th CPC)

2. AGM Works (Electrical)/Executive Engineer (Elect.) - 01 Post
(PB-3, Rs.15,600-39100/- with Grade Pay Rs. 6600/- (pre-revised)
(Level-11 as per 7th CPC)

3. Manager Works (Civil)/Assistant Engineer (Civil) - 02 Post
(PB-2, Rs. 9300-34500/- with Grade Pay Rs. 4800/- (pre-revised)
(Level - 8 as per 7th CPC)

4. Manager Works (Elect.)/Assistant Engineer (Elect.) -01 Post
(PB-2, Rs. 9300-34500/- with Grade Pay Rs. 4800/- (pre-revised)
(Level- 8 as per 7th CPC)

The last date of receipt of application is 02.04.2018. The details regarding eligibility,
Pay Scale/Pay Band etc. are also available on the website of DTIDC i.e.
dtidc.delhi.gov.in.
EN 52/46 Sr. Manager, DTIDC

# (The option of 'STC/ 'Absorption'/Re-employment are available 
only if the vacancy circular specially mentioned recruitment
by "STC" or "Absorption" or "Re-employment").
18. Whether belongs to SC/ST

I have carefully gone through the vacancy circular/ advertisement and I am well aware
that the information furnished in the Curriculum Vitae duly supported by the documents
in respect of Essential Qualification/ Work Experience submitted by me will also be
assessed by the Selection Committee at the time of selection for the post. The
information/ details provided by me are correct and true to the best of my knowledge
and no material fact having a bearing on my selection has been suppressed/ withheld.

Signature of the candidate
Date ______________ Address________________

Certification by the Employer/ Cadre Controlling Authority
The information/details provided in the above application by the applicant are true and correct
as per the facts available on records. He/she possesses educational qualifications and
experience mentioned in the Advertisement. If selected, he/ she possesses educational
Qualification and experience mentioned in the Vacancy Circular. If selected he/she will be
relieved immediately.
2. Also certified that: i) There is no vigilance or disciplinary case pending /
contemplated against Shri/Smt. ___________ . ii) His/her integrity is certified. iii)
His/her APAR Dossier in original are enclosed/ photocopies of the APARs for the last 5
years duly attested by an Officer of the rank of Under Secretary of the Govt. of India or
above are enclosed. iv) No major/ minor penalty has been imposed on him/ her during
the last 10 years Or a list of major/ minor penalties imposed on him/ her during the last
10 years is enclosed (as the case may be). Countersigned

(Employer/ Cadre Controlling Authority with Seal)
“Clean India and Clean Puducherry”

No. 345/DIP/AD(press)/2017-18
EN 52/110

Advertisement dated
⁄UÊc≈˛UËÿ ‡ÊÒÁˇÊ∑§ •ŸÈ‚¥äÊÊŸ •ÊÒ⁄U ¬˝Á‡ÊˇÊáÊ ¬Á⁄U·Œ

National Council of Educational
Research and Training

Vacancy Notice
Applications are invited for filling up one vacancy (likely to change) of Deputy
Secretary in the PB-III of Rs. 15600-39100/- with GP of Rs. 7600/- (pre-revised) at
Constituents Unit of NCERT at Bhopal on deputation basis on foreign service terms
for a period of one year, extendable for another year.
The eligibility conditions are as under :-
For Deputation :-
Officers of the Central Govt./State Govt./UT/Autonomous  Organisation  holding
analogous Post on regular basis OR 5 years regular service in the Pay Band-Ill Rs.
15600-39100 with Grade Pay of Rs. 6600/-, (Pre-revised)
Note-1: The departmental officers in the feeder category who are in the direct line of
promotion shall not be eligible for consideration for appointment on deputation.
Similarly, the deputationists shall not be eligible for consideration for appointment by
promotion.
Note-2 : Period of deputation including the period of deputation in another ex-cadre
post held immediately preceding this appointment in the same or some other
organization or department of the Central government shall ordinarily not exceed three
years. The maximum age limit for appointment by deputation shall be ‘Not exceeding
56 years’ as on the closing date of receipt of applications.
Note-3 : For the purpose of appointment on deputation basis, the service rendered on
a regular basis by an officer prior to 1st January, 2006 (the date from which the revised
pay structure based on the Sixth Central Pay Commission recommendation has been
extended) shall be deemed to be service rendered in the corresponding grade pay or
pay scale extended based on the recommendation of the Pay Commission except
where there has been merger of more than one pre-revised scale of pay into one
grade with a common grade pay or pay scale and where this benefit will extend only
for the Post(s) for which that grade pay or pay scale is the normal replacement grade
without any up-gradation.
The eligible candidates may send their application duly signed along with attested
copies of qualification/ experience/ Caste certificate with the latest passport size
photograph pasted on application through proper Channel to the Section Officer, R-
II, NCERT., Sri Aurobindo Marg, New Delhi - 110016 within 30 days from the date
of publication of this advertisement in the Employment News in the proforma
given. The employer, while forwarding such application, should send Vigilance
Clearance Certificate and attested copies of ACR of the employee for the last five
year, incomplete applications/applications received after due date will not be
entertained.

Proforma

1. Full name (in block letters)

2. Father's/Husband's name

3. Date of Birth

4. Complete postal address with Contact number

5. Educational Qualifications

6. Details of service rendered in Govt./Semi Govt./Autonomous organization

Name of Post held Pay Scale/Pay Period of service 
Organization Band with GP rendered in the post

7. Whether belongs to SC/ST/OBC/PH/Ex-serviceman category
EN 52/86 Signature of Applicant with Date

Photo (Self
attested)

Continued from page 35
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Q1. Which bank  has been
authorised to issue and
encash Electoral Bonds
initially at its 4
Authorised Branches ?
Give details.

A. State Bank of India (SBI)
B. The first issue of the

Scheme will be opened in
March 2018 in place of
January 2018 for the first
quarter of 2018.

C. Accordingly, the first sale of
Electoral Bonds will
commence from 01st
March 2018 for a period of
10 days i.e. up to 10th
March 2018. 

d. All the above
Q2. ' Electoral Bond' (issued in

India) shall be valid for
how many days ? Give
details.

A. fifteen days from the date of
issue and no payment shall
be made to any payee
Political Party if the Bond is
deposited after expiry of the
validity period.

B. The bond deposited by any
eligible political party to its
account shall be credited
on the same day.

C. Both (a) & (b)
D. None of these
Q3. The Fifteenth Finance

Commission as
constituted in pursuance
of clause (1) of Article 280
of the Constitution, w.e.f.
27th November, 2017
shall make its report
available by 30th
October, 2019, covering a
period of five years
commencing from which
date ?

A. 1st April, 2020. (The
Commission shall use the
population data of 2011
while making its
recommendations.)

B. 2015
C. 2011
D. 2022
Q4. In the abbreviation

LIBOR, the letter L stands
for what?

A. Labour
B. London (LIBOR : London

Inter Bank Offered Rate)
C. Luck
D. Left
Q5. As a consequence of

which of the following in
India , there has been a
sharp rise in FDI in the
past three years - from
US$ 36 billion in 2013-14
to US$ 60 billion in 2016-
17 ?

A. Filing of taxes under GST
has been made
progressively smoother.

B. The switch from cash to
digital payments has been
notable and has created
new opportunities. The
simplification of procedures
for tax payers, business-
persons and investors has
led to India making
significant advances in
Ease of Doing Business.

C. The opening of more and
more sectors to greater
private and global
investment has also drawn
appreciation.

D. All the above

Q6. Defence Corridor in UP
will leverage the existing
ordnance factories and
defence PSU
establishments in UP. The
proposed  stretch covers
which of the following ? 

A. Aligarh, Agra, Jhansi,
Chitrakoot

B. It also includes Kanpur and
Lucknow.

C. Both (a) & (b)
D. None of these
Q7. NDA government is

inspired by the ideology
of "inclusiveness" which
was postulated half a
century ago by whom ?

A. Pt. Deen Dayal Upadhyay,
who defined the concept of
"Antyoday"

B. Man Mohan Singh
C. Morarjee Desai
D. L.K.Advani
Q8. The  fact is that over 70%

of population of India
today is below the age of
40 years and schemes
like which of the
following are meant to
ensure their
"inclusiveness" ?

A. "Start-up India",
B. "Stand-up India"
C. "Mudra Yojana"
D. All the above
Q9. Where the  India's first

test-bed for next
generation, efficient,
compact, waterless super
critical carbon-dioxide
Brayton cycle test loop
for power generation.
India's first S-CO2
Brayton Cycle based
solar thermal test loop at
the laboratory scale is
established ?

A. BARC, Mumbai
B. at the IISc campus in

Bengaluru 
C. IGCAR, Kalpakkam
D. Ahmedabad
Q10. What is the  theme of the

latest edition of 'Theatre
Olympics' being held in
India, 2018 ? 

A. "Flag of Friendship"
B. Clean India
C. Food for all
D. Health for all
Q11. Which word will best

complete the relationship
given below?
BUCKET : ACTVBDJLDFSU
: : BONUS : ?

A. ACMNMOTVRT
B. SUNOB
C. ACNPMOTVRT
D. ACMNMOTURT
Q12. Complete the following

series by choosing the
right answer from the
options given.
ACFG : ZXUQ :: DFIM : ?

A. WURN
B. WURP
C. WUQO
D. WTQP
Q13. Which number will best

complete the relationship
given below ?
14 : 9 :: 26 : ?

A. 12
B. 13
C. 15
D. 31
Q14. Choose the pair which

shows the same
relationship as in the

given pair.
Fragile : Crack

A. Cemetery : Death
B. Pliable : Bend
C. Hydro : Water
D. Irreducible : Reduction
Q15. Find the ODD one out.
A. Plassey
B. Haldighati
C. Panipat
D. Sarnath
Q16. Choose the pair which is

different from the rest.
A. 1975-1579
B. 3152-5321
C. 4283-8432
D. 7319-9731
Q17. If in a certain code, GO =

32, SHE = 49, then SOME
will be equal to.

A. 56
B. 58
C. 62
D. 64
Q18. In a row of girls, Ramya is

fifth from the left and
Priya is sixth from the
right. When they
exchange their positions,
then Ramya becomes
thirteenth from the left.
What will be Priya's
position from the right?

A. 9
B. 12
C. 14
D. 17
Q19. If South-east becomes

North, North-east
becomes West and so on,
then what will West
become?

A. South
B. South-east
C. North-east
D. South-west
Q20. Village Chimur is 20 km

to the North of village
Rewa. Village Rahate is
18 km to the East of
village Rewa. Village
Angne is 12 km to the
West of Chimur. If Sanjay
starts from village Rahate
and goes to village
Angne, in which direction
is he from his starting
point?

A. North
B. North-west
C. South
D. South-east
Q21. At dusk, Sharma started

walking facing the Sun.
After a while, he met his
friend and both turned to
their left. They halted for
a while and started
moving by turning again
to their right. Finally
Sharma waved 'good bye'
to his friend and took a
left turn at a corner. In
which direction is
Sharma moving now?

A. South
B. West
C. North
D. East
Q22. Find the wrong number in

the series. 7, 28, 63, 124,
215, 342, 511

A. 7
B. 28
C. 124
D. 215
Q23. Complete the following

series by choosing the
right answer from the
options given.

LXF, MTJ, NPN, OLR, (…)
A. PHV
B. PIU
C. PJW
D. PKX
Q24. In this question, five

statements are given
followed by options
consisting of three
statements put together
in a specific order.
Choose the option which
contains logically related
statements and the third
statement is a conclusion
drawn from the preceding
two statements.
P) Apples are not laddus.
Q) Some apples are
laddus.
R) All laddus are tasty.
S) Some apples are not
tasty.
T) No apple is tasty.

A. TPR
B. RTP
C. QSR
D. RQS
Q25. In this question, a

statement is given
followed by two
conclusions. Choose the
conclusion which best
fits logically.
Statement :
Fortune favours the
brave.
Conclusions :
I) Risks are necessary for
success.
II) Cowards die many
times before their death.

A. Only conclusion I follows
B. Only conclusion II follows
C. Neither I nor II follows
D. Both I and II follow
Q26. Arrange the following

words in a logical order.
1) Hecto 2) Centi 3) Deca
4) Kilo 5) Deci

A. 1, 3, 4, 5, 2
B. 1, 5, 3, 4, 2
C. 2, 5, 3, 1, 4
D. 5, 2, 1, 4, 3
Q27. In the following question,

each sentence has four
parts marked P, Q, R and
S. Choose the part of
sentence with the error
and mark as your answer.
If there is no error, mark
'No error (S)' as your
answer.
A code of ethics is a set
of principles and rules
used by companies,
professional organi-
zations and
individuals(P) / to govern
there decision making(Q)/
in choosing between
right and wrong.(R)/ No
error (S)

A. P
B. Q
C. R
D. S
Q28. In the following question,

each sentence has four
parts marked P, Q, R and
S. Choose the part of
sentence with the error
and mark as your answer.
If there is no error, mark
'No error (S)' as your
answer.
The forum's goal is to
make intercultural learn
opportunities(P)/ and
global citizenship

education more
accessible,(Q)/ relevant
and actionable.(R) / No
error (S)

A. P
B. Q
C. R
D. S
Q29. The following question

has four parts marked P,
Q, R and S. Choose the
part of sentence with the
error and mark as your
answer. If there is no
error, mark 'No error (S)'
as your answer.
To build self-confidence
(P)/ your must be true to
yourself, (Q)/ no one can
give you self-confidence.
(R)/ No error (S)

A. P
B. Q
C. R
D. S
Q30. Complete the sentence

with the most appropriate
word. The discovery of
the new element was
______; the scientist was
looking for something
else.

A. Intentional
B. Intrepid
C. Eloquent
D. Inadvertent
Q31. Complete the sentence

with the most appropriate
word. The army fired on
the crowd when they ___.

A. Fizzled out
B. Became quiescent
C. Turned noisy
D. Turned violent
Q32. Complete the sentence

with the most appropriate
word. Due to cyclone
Vardah, water had _____
in the low-lying areas of
Chennai.

A. Reinforced
B. Strengthened
C. Stagnated
D. Changed
Q33. Choose the best

synonym of the given
word from the options
given below.
DORMANT

A. Neglected
B. Indifferent
C. Inherent
D. Undeveloped
Q34. Choose the best antonym

of the given word from
the options given below.
PLETHORA

A. Plenty
B. Current
C. Scarcity
D. Balance
Q35. Choose the option which

best expresses the
meaning of the idiom/
phrase given below:
"To have an axe to grind"

A. To work for both sides
B. To have selfish interest to

serve
C. To criticize someone
D. To fail to arouse interest
Q36. Choose the option which

best expresses the
meaning of the idiom/
phrase given below:
"The gift of the gab"

A. Fluency of speech
B. An unexpected gain
C. To be very happy
D. An Xmas gift

Test of General Awareness
(Useful for IBPS (Clerks & Officers)/SBI /SSC/UPSC Exams.)

The compilation of Q’s & A’s has been done by Mr Praturi Potayya Sarma. However, such a compilation is only indicative in nature and readers are advised to
consult multiple sources/forums for building a sound knowledge of current affairs. (Answer Key shall be published in the Next Issue)
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essence of existence of life.
“Water is the most critical resource

issue of lifetime and our children’s lifetime.
The health of our water is the principal
measure of how we live on the land”, so
said Luna Bergere Leopold, the famous
US geomoropholigst. There is no denying
the fact that water makes most important
of all the ingredients which help sustain
the lives of the Homo sapiens as well as
flora and fauna on the earth planet. It is
also the root of the existence of all the
moral, ethical, aesthetical and spiritual
values and the engine of the sustainability
of the world culture and civilization.

But unfortunately with the soaring global
population, which has increased more
than double over the period of past seven
decades, the availability of water,
especially for the drinking purposes, to the
common masses has turned out to be one
of the biggest crises of the modern-age-
Homo-sapiens of the 21st century.
Moreover, water accessibility to global
population has also been plummeting to
the newer low with each passing year. And
nothing can be worse and more critical
when we take into account the level of
underground water which is going down
and down every year.

How much critical and disappointing the
scenario of water crisis can be for the
human beings is so dangerously reflected
when media very recently published a
report with terrible and panicking images
of the people of Sao Paulo, the most
industrialized Brazilian city, once called as
the city of drizzle, with not more than the
population of 13 million. The residents of
the city had to face such a severe drought
very recently that they had begun digging
and drilling their houses’ basements,
floors and even vehicles’ parking places to
reach out to the underground water.

The readers of this horrible report and
threatening images might have not felt the
sense of déjà vu of the ordeal and the
nightmare the Brazilian city inhabitants
had to undergo but the lessons are very
clear for the understanding of which one
need not be a rocket scientist - water is
life, no water means no trace of life, the
world is sitting on the cusp of waging the
ugliest and the severest ever civil war over
the issue of usurping the lion’s share of
water in the imminent years to come - the
very elixir of the survival of the mankind on
the earth, the very essence of the survival
of the flora and fauna on the earth. Also
the writing is very clear on the wall for the
existence of lives on the earth.

Water covers more than two-thirds, that
is approximately 70 percent of the earth
planet areas. It does never mean that we
have so much sufficient water as much we
need for the smooth running of life. It is
because of the fact that only 3 percent of
the entire global water is fresh drinking
water. This is not the beginning of the end
of the saga of distress and dilemma. The
two-thirds of the total of 3 per cent of fresh
water get stuck or trapped away in
glaciers and so we are left with meagre 1
per cent of fresh water for the daily basic
human activities to the various
applications in all the three sectors of the
economy, producing goods and services. 

If mere one percent of nearly 70 percent
water on the earth planet rests for the use
and falls within the accessibility of the
mankind and other creatures on the earth,
we can easily guess the ferocity of the
water crisis across the nations in the
world. It is very much bewildering that as
many as 1.2 billion people, a little over as
that of India’s population, are deprived of
access to water. And a total of 3 billion
people, more than the population of India
and China put together, are cursed to
suffer from the acute water shortage for at
least one month in a year. The sad story of
the sufferings of the people due to water
crisis does not cease here only. 

The critical condition of both the

availability and accessibility of water also
tells on the plight of sanitation in the world.
Lack of sufficient water makes the people
vulnerable to a string of water-borne
diseases like those of cholera, diarrhoea,
typhoid fever and several others. The
medical science says that more than 90
percent of the diseases which the
mankind is likely to suffer from have their
roots to contaminated and unsafe drinking
water. It also deserves a mention here that
as many as two million people, mostly
children, die every year from diarrhoea, a
contaminated-water-borne-disease.

Drought now has become more usual
and most common natural global
phenomenon. Floods are inundating most
uncommon cities and towns across the
world. Abrupt climatic changes have
aggravated the situation eve more. Half of
the total wetland areas of the world has
been destroyed over the past seven
decade which does not augur well for the
earth considering the fact that these
wetlands, which make most potential
nurseries of the development of human
civilization and growth of diverse nature of

flora and fauna, work as a shield for the
people against storms, droughts, floods
and other natural calamities. The
destruction of wetlands is also the matter
of worries because they substantially
nourish the production of rice, the staple
diet of almost half of the population of the
world.

Water crisis is only one and the
problems and dilemma are galore, the
wider repercussions of which are so
obviously visible on the various segments
of the economy, ecology and environment.
At this critical juncture of matter of life and
death brought about by global water crisis,
we need to make a serious soul-searching
and ask a very though tprovoking
question: Where do we need to find faults
which have led us to the vortex of water
crisis? And, most importantly, we need to
ask ourselves another equally significant
question: How and when will we wake up
to take initiatives to correct the critical
multi-headed-hydra-like water crisis
situations which have overstretched to the
extent of jeopardizing the lives of not only
the present generation but also the lives of
the generations to come?

In the Zambian capital of Lusaka, there
is a very famous zoo. This zoo has a cage
which does not have any animal but a very

weird notice pasted on it which reads as,
“The world’s most dangerous animal”.
When the visitors enter into the cage they
find a man-size mirror in which they see
their reflections. The message is very
clear: For all the natural catastrophes and
the whole gamut of crises which the world
population is suffering from, it is only man
and only the man and his undying lusts
that are to be held responsible and guilty.

So like other crises, water crisis too is
man-made. We have ignored the life-
sustaining crucial role of water on the
earth. Hence the solution also lies in the
sincere endeavours made by the mankind
only. The most important and urgent step
is to bring about holistic paradigm
changes in our mindset and insight. We
first need to visualize the dangers which
are so perniciously looming large over our
very existence due to water scarcity. We
need to visualize the horrifying world
scenario when we would be left with no
water resource on the earth and we would
be rendered cursed to die altogether.

The Slovakian proverb says that pure
water is the world’s first and foremost

medicine. Not only this, it is also the bread
winner of entire creatures on the earth. So
there is no gainsaying the fact that we
urgently need to conserve water.

Conservation of water starts from the
check on the wastage of water. They say
that saving a natural resource is
tantamount to producing it. The agriculture
sector which uses 70 percent of total
accessible water on the earth is the
biggest stake for us. No doubt, agriculture,
the single most source of granaries, is root
of the sustenance of the human beings but
at the same time we need to be cautious
to know that almost 60 percent of the total
water volume used in farming is wasted
through leakages. This puts heavy
pressure on the underground water. The
irrigation system requires to be supplied
with latest scientific technologies and leak-
proof infrastructural facilities.The
agriculture scientists also must make a
string of intensive researches into the
possibilities of finding the genetically
improved seeds which may give boost to
the dry farming system so that precious
and scarce water can be saved. Industries
also need to work upon checking the
wastage of water. Water used in the
various industrial applications such as
coolant or cleaning agent must be

rationally used via installation of latest
know-how, improved modus-operandi and
an array of sophisticated technologies.

Effluents and industrial wastes and
sewages require to be recycled so that
they are not dumped into the rivers and
lakes. Rain water harvesting may proved
to be a significant conservation technique
which can provide great relief to the
people facing the acute water shortages.

A blanket ban on the deforestation and
felling of the trees by the private
contractors in the name of development of
furniture industries must be exercised
without any further delay by the
government. There is an urgent need of
accelerating the afforestation at a massive
scale so that erratic and irregular nature of
rainfall can be fast improved and water
availability can be ensured sufficiently for
WASH (Water for drinking, sanitation and
hygiene) to the entire 7.5 billion population
of the world.

Common masses too need to be woken
up from the deep slumber to make them
realize the importance of even a single
drop of water. Leaving the water taps
running for hours without any purpose is
nothing less than a crime against the
humanity on the earth. Until the people
realize the adverse consequences of the
waste of water of this sort, crisis would not
likely to go sufferings are set to aggravate
day by day. 

Vying with the developed economies for
the faster rate of growth of Gross
Domestic Product sounds pretty
heartening and no one can be skeptical of
it. But with this lust of reaching out to the
pinnacle of progress and prosperity, what
we do not take pain to ponder over is the
question which every conscientious citizen
must ask himself - Will the earth sustain
the burden of undying desires and ever-
accumulating needs of the Homo
sapiens? Next bigger question is no way
less important –For how long will the earth
sustain all these pulls and pressures
wrought by man? Last yet the biggest
question is - Are we ready to face the
consequences when the earth gives in
and finally surrenders to our whims and
fancies?

Keeping in mind the vital and life-saving
role of water in the sustenance of the
mankind and the earth itself we must ask
the aforesaid questions very seriously and
try sincerely to answer and find their
speedy solutions only today - otherwise
we would not live for tomorrow to answer
and find solution for them.
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